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The MInister of RaIlways (Sbri 
JarJlvan Bam): There is nothing to 
consider, Sir. If it is your desire, I 
will have no objection in placing the 
Minutes of all these Consultative 
Committees in the Library of Parlia-
ment. 

Mr. Speaker: From time to time. 

Shrl JacJlvan Bam: All the Minutes, 
Sir, not from time to time. 

Mr. Speaker: Very well. 
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Prevention of Hanway Aceldeaa 

.448. Sbrl Wodeyar: Will the 
Minister of RaIlways be pleased to 
state: 

(a) whether Government have re-
ceived any plans for inventing a 
gadget for the prevention of Railway 
accidents; and 

(b) whether any financial aid has 
been granted for their invention? 

The Depnty MIDIster of RaUwaYI 
(Shrl Shahnawaz Khan): (a) No. 

e b) Does not arise. 

Sbri Wodeyar: May I know if any 
such plans have been l'ejected as be-
ing spurious? 

Shrl ShahDawaz Khan: I am not 
aware of any such plan being reject-
ed on that basis. 

Shrl Wodeyar: Is the Department 
of Government engaged in the cons-
truction of any such gadget? 

Sbri Shalmawu Khan: One gentle-
_cn bn tbo nOnlA of Ur Ponnn 

swamy devised a certain mechanism 
for reducing the amount of dam'llge, 
and that was a device whereby the 
vacuum brakes would be applied as 
soon as thel'e was a derailment. That 
device is being scrutinised by the 
Railway Standards Office, 'llnd that 
device has been patented. 

Shr! Dasappa: May I know whe-
ther there are not instruments to 
detect track defects which could be 
placed on the railway line well 
beforehand, the instruments indica t-
ing the various defects in the track? 

Tbe Minister of RaIlways (Sbri 
JarJlvan Bam): There are, and they 
are being tried on the Central Rail-
way. 

Shri Paianiandi: May I know who 
this Ponnuswamy is, whether he is a 
worker of the Railway concerned and 
whether he has been given any re-
ward for his invention? 

Shrl SbahDawu Khan: Yes, he is a 
railway employee, and he has been 
given a reward. 

Shrl Joachim Alva: Is any begin-
ning made to implement the recom-
mendations of the Vasist Committee 
which toured the U.S.S.R., especi'lllly 
their observations with regard to the 
prevention of accidents? 

Sbri JarJivan Bam: I will require 
notice to give any detailed reply. 

Tubereal ..... 

·449. ShrimaU JIa Palchoaclhury: 
Will the Minister of Health be pleas-
ed to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that an .. 11 
India survey was conducted by the 
Indian Council of Medical Research 
in order to ascertain the incidence of 
tuberculosis among the population of 
India; and 

(b) if so, the result thereof? 

The MInIster of Health (Sbri D. P. 
Karmarkar): (a) An all India T. B. 
Survey On a sample basis was taken 
up by the Indian Council of Medical 
Research in 1955. The survey is in 




