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Seventeenth Loksabha

=

Title: The motion for consideration of the Election Laws (Amendment) Bill,
2021 (Motion adopted and bill passed).

THE MINISTER OF LAW AND JUSTICE (SHRI KIREN RIJIJU):

Sir, I beg to move:

“That the Bill further to amend the Representation of the People Act,
1950 and the Representation of the People Act, 1951, be taken into

consideration.” ... (Interruptions)

SUSHRI MAHUA MOITRA (KRISHNANAGAR): Sir, you cannot bring
this Bill ... (Interruptions)

14.46 hrs

At this stage, Sushri Mahua Moitra, Shri Gaurav Gogoi,
Shrimati Kanimozhi Karunanidhi and some other hon. Members

came and stood on the floor near the Table.

TG Ul - T S, 1 311U fod o SR 8 $& dieHT dgi?

gt = RIS : W, 89 39 Yo H 319 SqaRM IS (3fHeHT) fad,
2021 AP MU E | TTH $S WY AdR AU G | ... (SIYM) HRd &I
S AT T ©, SAaRH H BT Sl dRIPT g, SAaR HHIRA & ATHH
T BH S gd PRA g, S B3 D! ol HA 3 aret g | ...
EIYT) H WS o Uy FaH1 Ieal g | 3t a& &1 5 3aia== af
g, 3t St Ui &1 B, St uiewH B, 39 o fSuRe 7, 39
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HAATE | ITH! R B P [T WBR 7 FARE HHIYE & 1Y dreHd
P, SATE HHITH F off RHASTY 311E §, 3! fAdd 8T, 77 59
oI 39 3 SHe & HIeoH ¥ Udd fhU B | ... (STaY™)

B9 99 AN S & 1o AfAu™ & HaTfad 5Id 18 A UR 81 SId &
dl 3MMYepT AifdT 1 Age BlaT & | AfeT 3nft S Uty g, 399 18 ITd
B B & d1g ot 3 dfed W|d € 1. (Tay™) 39 fed & 1 oy,
ST SITPBIET 3¢ §, 98 X Id H UH &l HIBRT S ol 15 § | 39
BB S H Sl 3Td §, T8 3P &, Al 3P a1 W I1d | ol gid
2. dWIdE IR IARABTIIAE | 18 ITA 81 P dIC Y DICIBIST]
SC Pl HAUSY IW H | SR, 1 3Ud, | JaTs 3R 1 3R IR
PITPRIT ST PRI T3 g | ... (TTYUH)

2P QTG SHRT Sl TRARET Uifded &, 98 SU8R god gl T |
SqH] HAdd o b Uh UM fpdl Ifdq & o0 Hdl g 3R 3NReHa
T BT ST W IYBT A9 8, 3R I8 ST 3{eT S8 SIldT g df gfag
JleX HeadI g | ... (TIY) T81 R AT g3 — AW, ! IS &1
®I3 UG -6l & | 981 TR I18W forar g3 g | Y- 20 & J&-Ta=H 6
¥ RoSieeH diqey Tae & o 913w forar g3 8, 39 S9! S8 WY
fore &1 UTay™ fhor AT B | 99 39 R I g @t H fged H vauwH
BT | ... (AIYT)

IR, 3G §1C USRI I 91d § | SARM Hhede B & 4T ol
g 1T BIdt 5, 39 fUHRRN & UHRR &+ &1 Uy § | 399
I9P! UIST TagUUs a1 T g | 7 I9F IR # H AT e B
fITR Y IS | ... (STaYT) 3R | 9 AN I T8 @ 1P S | ol
3dFERd A &, TG G! 8, I8 33 B, Tal gl, Og Bl | SATRH
HHEE H Tgt T8d1 § | 390 U Uray™ STl AT § fb U MRS &
U 7 3ffe-RI ¥ATSe & U YR HTS 5, IYB| SAdeRd Ad & 1Y
foich B BT UIGUH IJT TS |... (TIYM)
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Ig giaesl 8, PIAIR! gl 3, Hac! gl § |...(TauF) WHR
d8d Bl 33T gATd GYUR BT Sl TUIoTd AR 3175 §, 39T AU T e
HAT, § 01 Iufie HaT € | §1¢ H AH 9o 5 Fodl, dl § 39 W
R FARTH ST 3R SRefhHTH & 1Y IS o I8 FA1d GUR o
& foru fraT SRt 8 | y=udTe |...(caauT)

AR GO : U1 U g3

% e ufafa |, 1950 iR e ufaffda
JFAFTH, 1951 T 3R MY B 9T faeded W IR foear

Silg |7

i 3R T MR @ERHR): W, TS I8 8 1 PR § Th
AT P Y, gz fd e SIS 81 ¥eT §, e ug e uila
gl Y81 §, 3(TY 1T Sd-1l SiecaTrsil R HIIZ & |...(IYH) 3R U8
3@ Agayuf g, @Y a1 SiegarSit # U 31 I RIS & 2 ...
@ay™) g9 A g8 Wt wir @t I P 39 L& Fud A den oe
...(TGYT)

SHRI T. R. BAALU (SRIPERUMBUDUR): The Government has not
generated enough public opinion. ... (/nterruptions) Public opinion should
be generated fully. This Bill should be discussed in the House after some

time, after getting the nod from ... (Interruptions)

gt fooe el : TR, # 9gd 81 Hequl aTd BT FARMP SR HRAT
ded PR fAug FAarA ST sadt FaR d wa18 |...
(TTYT) T WIS HAST Y g1 IHHS 8 PR AT 7 |...(TIU) H T
&I BRI & foIe WiET A Bt RUIE o ygaaear g |
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The Departmentally related Parliamentary Standing Committee on

Personnel, Public Grievances, Law and Justice in its 105th Report has stated
that the Committee is of the view that linking of Aadhar number with
Electoral Roll will purify electoral rolls and consequently reduce electoral
malpractices. ... (Interruptions) Accordingly, the Committee has directed
that the relevant laws, in this regard, should be amended at the earliest and

Action Taken Report i1s required to be forwarded to the Committee. ...

(Interruptions) Ig Wm HHT, ForgH 3iid uref & AFHYG 95 §,
Jel T AIPHSYI AT |
g1, Afreia g @gn): Ul Tgicy, g8 S HIY g, I8 $hdd

SRR &I

.. *®Ydl g |...(CTaYT) ST SR HHIYE oG] I=YT 1.+ fear |,
(TTYT) HTUFT ARG Tfe 3MMUH! &1 8Y, dl...* I Ao HIHTR
J, J DU &b A ARG o4 3R B = IAD! 3G HAT 410 ...
(TAYT) U HRU T 98 ISR HHIYET BT . +IGT drgdt § ...
(TAYT) THRI IRBR Sl T f9d dH 318 5, Th JINTg RBIH dar
3% 8, SUD! U8 §aIG BT A6l ¢ |...(SFIYUM) Tl [gied, |

3MUPH! Il Iedl § b SR UL FoH Hdl ¢ b 8 3MUR
AP AW E |...(TAYF) Foi4 YR P U1 (ay) fomr foast
BT SITET & U fadT |...(aUM) 3R IS 8H 3MUR Pl dddeRd
A & Y WS @ §, A DIF-IT A IR IE 87 ...(TIYF) Hifh
3! IACRE! B §FT § |...(TaUT) 39 Fad H# U1 g3 g ...+
AUTA P AR &, I g P AT FiGS 81 T |...(TIYT) 59 YR B
¢ BT 7 IFATCRIT Bl §41 Jball &, 7 ~UTel bl &7 Jobal § 3R 7
fpat 30 &1 91 Ybdl g |...(TIYM) dIc §b B IS &b HRUT IR
Uiteifepd UIe i eyt g1 a1 HiUY 81, T g4t T Had dic &t JoHid
HX g B, YUY 3] fRIY PR IQ © |...(TFYT) ORI 9dTd I8 & (b
S TIfeT §2 §, s oife H S5dl § & Afeg y 3 4exd # 81 vId g,
AfaHw AR # 81 O1d @ 3R 39 ot SR HHIRE & U &l
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TR 8l U1 | sHfely WPR I8 TOYT dpx 3E © 1.
(TAYT) §H 39 fdd &1 9dH d § 3R e I 38 IRd & P
srarezht &1, faczft o ggi &1 alex 7 997 a1 9T 1., (Suau™) Soa=
HUIH oft T T St .+l Ia1eRul A 81 & 98 Hio &1 94 8
WY, ST TR 81 WY, S9iY URT e 3BT HIY ¢ |...(SHdYT) a1
Tecl & 1Y H 3+ 10 THT B § | o1 &g, 19 HRd |

SHRI KALYAN BANERJEE (SREERAMPUR): Sir, this is the Bill
whereby the entire democracy 1s being taken away in this way. This Bill

needs a discussion.

Sir, I will tell you. Last week, this Minister of Law and Justice invited
me and also all the Members of the Standing Committee on Personnel,
Public Grievances, Law and Justice. At that time, he committed that it
would be sent to the Standing Committee. Now, this 1s his master plan. He
is killing. ... (Interruptions) He is killing. ... (Interruptions) He is killing
the entire thing.

ot foras UTSE TSHd RARR-Riyg): am-a quafd ggieg, o
Ra ¥ & R® I 9 f9a &1 Ry &R @ E ... @au™) S
SiecaTol H 81 IR 39 f9d &1 U B DI DIRRT B 51 @l &8, TRH o0
Il Ed ESH St Dl Ul F g4 TH R &I Ada™ P Ufad
UPR UT B BT &, HAGM Gl ®! YR W i HAT 3R Segaroh
# IY U BT et 7ol § ... (SIaYUH) 39 W gl didb I 989 g
RT | 39 R G AT BI 3UA-304 IR o B Pt HIAHT §
... (TaYT)
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SHRIMATI SUPRIYA SADANAND SULE (BARAMATI): I have only
two-three 1mportant questions to ask the Government. The Bill was
introduced today. What is the tearing hurry? ... (Interruptions). In the
speech, Mr. Nishikant Dubey talked about Bangladeshis. In the newspapers,
it 1s said that only the Congress wants Bangladeshis. I have a humble
question to the BJP. There 1s an allegation against the BJP that one of the
Ministers is a Bangladeshi, an allegation in West Bengal. That must be

verified when he talks about other people.

The other thing is that they have talked about electoral reforms. If the
hon. Minister wants electoral reforms, he should take this Bill back, bring a

comprehensive Bill covering entire electoral reforms, talk about the
women’s reservation Bill, electoral bonds, S |IY Higell Rl
foa +f gry <, 9 9HdA S 3R U8 f9d urg B .. (HIUH)

So, they should take this Bill back. ... (Interruptions)

SHRI LAVU SRIKRISHNA DEVARAYALU (NARASARAOPET): Sir,
this Bill needs to be discussed. Yes, we very much welcome the gender
neutrality which they have taken up in this Bill. At the same time, giving
opportunity for four times to enrol themselves as voters i1s a good thing. ...

(Interruptions)

But still Sir, we have experienced where 30 lakh people have already
been seeded. What had happened in Telangana and Andhra Pradesh in 2015-
16?7 In the Telangana Elections, 30 lakh people could not vote. ...
(Interruptions) And in Andhra Pradesh, what happened was because of

seeding of Aadhaar and this data together, the previous Government could
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go ahead and make sure whom to be given what and whom to be taken out.

... (Interruptions)

So, I request the Minister again to come with a comprehensive Bill so

that proper discussion can happen in the House. ... (Interruptions)

oft A= UTUSy (IFESHY TR): A JHTUf Sft, sar f g/ st
T I8 A § P 39 foa R ®rae A 9=t gl 91iee ok 9ot &
59 W did4 & fore ve AT faaam =ifge o 1... @9ym) o
feaTa @ ST WeT H gars o fobat o 38T 8, 98 Fo1 4 Pal gaRI
O AR & faaw § | s fAa d o 4 8, S wd vomn
STAAT TR | ... (STIYT)

HIIGR, 39 fad & WY gHR S H MYR & JTY dic? foRe
Pl foir PR B AT B ST ... (TIYH)

SHRI ANUBHAV MOHANTY (KENDRAPARA): Thank you Sir.

On behalf of my Biju Janata Dal Party, I appreciate the way the hon.
Minister said that there will be four phases of qualification and it will be
gender neutral. But at the same time, this 1s not the proper decorum. This i1s
not the proper way to pass any Bill. It was supposed to be introduced today
in this House. Today, the House 1s in a very disturbed way. This is not the
proper time. It should be debated. It should be discussed by all parties and
then only, considered to be passed.

SHRI ASADUDDIN OWAISI (HYDERABAD): Sir, I stand here to
oppose the Bill. This Bill violates the basic structure of the Constitution. In
the Kesavananda Bharti case, it was clearly said that democracy is a part of
the basic structure. This Government i1s taking away the autonomy of the
Election Commission. An EPIC card is issued through a Constitutional

process by a Constitutional Authority. We have no right whatsoever to
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indulge in it. By bringing this Bill and making it a law, the Government is

interfering in the working of the Election Commission ... (/nterruptions)

15.00 hrs

SHRI N. K. PREMACHANDRAN (KOLLAM): Sir, I rise to oppose this
Bill. Today, in the morning, at the time of introduction of this Bill also I
opposed it on constitutional grounds. Now, my opposition is to the way by
which this Bill is being passed. ... (/nterruptions) The Bill has been
introduced only today. The hon. Members of this House are not getting the
opportunity to move their amendments. This is our democratic right ...
(Interruptions) It is the democratic right of a Member to propose and move
amendments. It is quite unfortunate that in the parliamentary system of
democracy, the Members of the House are not being allowed to move the

amendments. Then, what 1s parliamentary democracy? ... (Interruptions)

SHRI E.T. MOHAMMED BASHEER (PONNANI): Sir, I vehemently
oppose this Bill ... (Interruptions) It is a ... * for the entire Legislature. This

1s never heard in the history of parliamentary democracy ... (Interruptions)
AR Ul A |63 Sft - 39 Sifere |

it fooed ol : A quTafd #wgied, # 999 Ugd oMUl
maﬂTE | ... (dYId) §H Election Laws (Amendment) Bill G
MUE | ... (WIAYM) 34 BH 39 f9d P! T81 Sciegyd IR 3R 39
R SIS &I Al f&aT | ... (Tdy™) I8 §gd o Hgayu fod g,
fory R ed dred ¥ fr wa dad =i A i o 8iR o1 #d ¢ | ...
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(SIYT) UTferarc SHIsh AT &1 o R 8, 3% ded Ir! faueft wifida
& AdT 3R 39 f9a T 301 G <d, 39 W 309 o od 3R g4
BHd dl TY dgd 3T YR Sl | ... (SHaYH)

T IRE o A TN 8T3Y H T A 3R © 3R 3l ¥ 7= 7l g
cwRe M MIRIPed e [P Tl T8I el & | ... (AIYH) 89 a
4t Ted 8, ST df I8 f9d dax MW § | ... (STay™) g9 T T
ITed &, 98 ol Xd ardraRor § =i g1 98T | ... (SIdY™) 39 gad 3
A FMHT IR I &, T8 B aid Al g | ... (TIYM)

IR, g gHIce [9a g | ... (FUH) T1d UR P Ufehal Bl gH
AP ol TP 5, FIfh Tg SAR HHIYA 3Hh SfSAT 3R HRAT PR
FATHT | ... (TIYF) TRERd TS R I WBRI & dig v FmaR
Tl I gg UfhaT Idd! 3 el g | ... (IYH) Hs Il I oM
HHA 3T fear 3R - & S s T=iugs ¢ | ... (Taum)
98d CRId fSThRE 8 & dc 31191 I8 fod g1 Igi dak 3Mu @ | ...
@aY) § od HUISIE Dt olid & 8T AT, 99 4 39 919 71 forep fasar
T | ... (gay™) fauelt uifiéal & 8RR $© Ad1 8 I & [ TP Wit
HU A YT IR | ... (FIYH) H 39 §1d &) foh ¥ e eT & fh 39
faog R urfeladd KT HAd d sgd U U T g gdhi g | ...
(SAYT) UfearHdt RiET Hact § g9 urical & e gd § 3R dgi
ST S ¥ BHUR I6HR Il gict g | ... (TG Uil L&
HHE A AT RS A 8 | ... (cmay™) § 3 & forw 59 I
& HeOH 9§ 39 Ugdh YA A8l § | ... (TIYM) UTferarde] TS
HH P NUIE BB 8 — the Committee is of the view that linking of

Aadhar Number with electoral roll will purify electoral rolls and

consequently reduce electoral malpractices. Accordingly, the Committee has
directed that relevant laws in this regard should be amended at the earliest
and Action Taken Report is required to be forwarded to the Committee. H

3 U Toff a1 feReRgd G AT @W € | ... (TIYUH) D

T PR B ST A P N ISA A AT TG | ... (FIYH) &
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Ugd ay 1988 H SId 614} HiRecgRAd fHSHE g3 U1, 39 THT qIfc
3¢ & AU g 21 9y o, o &g 39 18 9y fobar 77 o7 |
(SIIYT) O 18 aY BT YIay™ far 71 o1, 99 I9H TP 7Y, U Al
EITYT| ... (FAYF) SHD! IoT8 ¥ 1 A B 3R HIg 94 UR &I
ST 8, 381 YA 719 3AdeRd Ad H gof el A, df R I1d HR &
fore 9% i RAG SE S Id & | ... (TFUH)

SIS HAAd §H Sl IR SR Sl ¢ 38 &, 3P IR Id |
oid Ht 18 T B 31 T Belt €, T8 IR JAFCRA U H S{TAT 717 Gof
PR AHdT & IR WA H feU 78 aifeaT I1ge &1 WA B AHhdl & |

Heled, e god R dIa-1 Argdl € |... (STdU™) TSl I Ugd Ife
s gIR] o8 TR URSS g 3R dic ST Iredl §, dfe 98 I3V ®, dl
3Td! AI3% IYH! S8 WR dic STd Ibdl o, dfd dfe PIs Algal fbal
T S8 URCS ®, df S9P g3 S Pl dic SIa- &I UIayM Tal o7 | 39
Siex g X feal AT § | 3 YaRM 20, a¥ 1950 & Uiga RusiesH
uac ff, ‘the wife’ I SliTg ‘the spouse’ PX fegr Tan % G?I? ST ‘if she’
ﬁ'R@lT%,aBT ‘if such spouse’ D @@?WW% ... (SUdYI) s%lab
d1e g9 & fore ov1g &1 it fifgd S usar 8 | 3od, wrgfct fafegT
aq & fow RfSReE & usdt 8 | A9-E 160, 99 1958 & Wud
ROSieT™ Tae & RM Uray™ | ool far 8, o & U1 argdT 8 | Sub-

Section 1 (a) of Section 160 says:

“Any premises are needed or are likely to be needed for the
purpose of being used as polling stations, for counting, for storage
of ballot boxes, voting machines including voter verifiable paper
audit trail and poll related material after a poll has been taken,

accommodation for security forces and polling personnel.”

g1 & fU SRexd & fgaa 4 -
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“provided that such premises shall be requisitioned after the

1ssuance of notification of the Election Commission under Section

[ -l b

30 for such election till the date notified under clause ‘e’.

g fob S1d T SAaRM AIChIs gl B, dd dd Holl I e
PR IT g B RIS T8 R Ibd § 1. (TIYF) 811
JARATH! SISTHE Dl HIC BHRP YR’ & Y SAdGCRd Jd & il &I
el Y1 IM§ 1. (ay™) # Al g [ 3614 [9d & Urau™ &1 i
Y Tl UgT g U1 IHIH & 91 ey H2 H U 781 3@ &, H§ &8 Tal
ToHdl § | dfed 9 Re T Ry &1 TR 33T 7, T8 31% el ¢ |
Wﬁ SoHe | ﬁ‘;ﬂ'q Hlc 7 Pl % fb “Right to privacy is a
fundamental right.” 9 TTY A ®IC 7 g8 i w18 & -

“Permissible limits for invasion of privacy, namely, there should
be existence of law, legitimacy of interest and such law should

pass the test of proportionality.”

I F IR H H WA H TLBTS HIb 9] aredl § ...
(SIIYT) JaY Ud TR 3T &’ g1 =1f3T, I8 oty &I 3
gl % Eﬂﬁ‘ﬂ gH 3ol o Al ABRT 3T QAEn' %, to justify the Supreme
Court ruling. GERT AITETHYT 3T gce e & &

Section 17 of RP Act says:
“No person shall be entitled to be registered in electoral roll

for more than one constituency.”
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Hedud ATH &I 8 & AT I8 AfSifeal 3 39eve 39H JST g3 §
3R Y H test of propoﬂionality%ﬁiﬂ%qﬁmﬂﬁm?%%, dg oi-dIl
& I H g, AR & 3 H 8 3R ¢ H WIth YR g1d Hi 2P
M Tg W ¢ | H o T 3Ry Il g fob 39 fadues &1 ga gmelq
B 1. (HIYM)

I GO UY T8 ®

f e ufaffda #fafRTm, 1950 iR e ufaffda
FAFTH, 1951 BT 3R TYMYF B aTdd [99ge R IR
far §me |

JRdTd ¥didhd g3 |
HAHA GHUM : 3 IHT fAdas 1R WusaR AR &t |

A QU U9 98 & :

“fob WUg 2 ¥ 7 [A9gPH &b 3§ |7
JdTd Widhd g3 |
s 24 7 9 A Sg feu U |
9Us |, AT 9 3R f[3dae &1 1 9 [A9a® | ol
fau U |

HAMAT UM : A |31 S, 3 39 U9 &9 & fadas uiiva
fear e |
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SHRI KIREN RIJIJU: Sir, [ beg to move:

“That the Bill be passed.”

AT U - UY U8 8:
f% fadge urfya fear sme |~

UdTd Tdighd g3 |

AT AUTUTA: 4T B! HRIdTs! AR, f&mie 21 fogwar, 2021 &
OTd: 11 991 db & foIw W B STt @ |

15.12 hrs

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till Eleven of the Clock on
Tuesday, December 21, 2021/Agrahayana 30, 1943 (Saka).

INTERNET

The Original Version of Lok Sabha proceedings is available on Parliament
of India Website and Lok Sabha Website at the following addresses:

http://www.parliamentofindia.nic.in

http://www.loksabha.nic.in

LIVE TELECAST OF PROCEEDIN F LOK SABHA

Lok Sabha proceedings are being telecast live on Sansad T.V. Channel.
Live telecast begins at 11 A.M. everyday the Lok Sabha sits, till the adjournment
of the House.
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Published under Rules 379 and 382 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business
in Lok Sabha (Sixteenth Edition)

* The sign + marked above the name of a Member indicates that the Question was actually asked
on the floor of the House by that Member.

* Available in Master copy of Debate, placed in Library.
* Available in Master copy of the Debate, placed in Library.

* Laid on the Table and also placed in Library, See No. LT 5730/17/21.
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* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.
* Speech was laid on the Table.

* Speech was laid on the Table.

** Introduced with the recommendation of the President.
* Not recorded as ordered by the Chair.

* Not recorded.
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