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Shri B. S. Mari by: As a matter of 
tact, Andhra State has extended the 
invitation to other MPs who are not 
members of the consultative cm- 
mittee of the House. If the host S ate 
is desirous of inviting all MPs, there 
is no objection whatsoever

Production of Calcium Ammonium 
Nitrate

+
f  Shri Ignace Beck:

•1164.  ̂ Qaxi Matin:
I  Shri S. C. Godsora:

Will the Minister of Food and Agri­
culture be pleased to state*

(a) whether it is a fact that the 
fertilizer plants at Nangal and 
Rourkela will produce Calcium 
Ammonium Nitrate,

(b) if so, what steps have been 
taken to popularise this fertilizer in 
advance to create a ready market; 
and

(c) whether it is a fact that the new 
fertilizer is hygroscopic and requires 
better storage conditions?

The Minister of Agriculture (Dr. 
P. 8. Deshmukh): (a) Yes, Sir

(b) ( 1) Demonstration,

(ii) Free distribution for trial on 
cultivators’ fields.

(111) Increased imports and distri­
bution in areas of States near to the 
location of the factories.

(iv) Sale m the years 1954 to 1958 
at prices below cost price

(c) Yes, Sir.

Shri Ignace Beek: May I know the 
total annual output of calcium 
ammonium nitrate from both these 
plants?

Dr. P. S. Deshmukh: The maximum 
fertiliser that will be produced will 
be 3,90,000 tons m each of these two 
plants The Nangal plant is expected 
to go into production in 1960 and the 
Rourkela plant in 1961.

The Deputy Minister of Irrigation 
and Power (Shri Hathi): Regarding 
the supplementary to SQ No 1158 I 
did not give the exact allocation of 
the cost of the dam For the informa­
tion of the hon Member I may now 
state that the basis of allocation of 
cost for electricity and irrigation is m 
article 43 of the statement and 
Appendix D

WRITTEN ANSWERS TO 
QUESTIONS

Subsidised Hostel for Children at 
Secunderabad

‘ 1154. Shri T. B. Vittal Bao: Will 
the Minister of Railways be pleased 
to refer to the reply given to Starred 
Question No 1111 on the 17th Decem­
ber, 1958 and state*

(a) the progress made up to-date 
regarding the construction of a sub­
sidised hostel for 100 children of 
railway employees schooling at 
Secunderabad,

(b) the amount spent so far; and

(c) when will it be thrown open 
for admission9

The Deputy Minister of Railways 
(Shri S. V. Ramaswamy): (a) Tenders 
for the work have been finalised and 
the Railway Administration will let 
out the work on contract shortly

(b) No expenditure has been book­
ed so far agamst this work

(c) By about January 1960




