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Pay Scale# u i  Training of Tele-
graphist*

121. Shri Bal Raj Madhok: Will the
Minister of Communications be pleas-
ed to state:

(a) the pay scales of the Junior and 
Senior telegraphists working in the
Overseas Communications Service
and the P & T Department;

(b) whether they are trained by
their respective Departments before or
after their appointments in the cadre;
and

(c) the duration of their training,
remuneration offered and the subjects
dealt with during such training?

The Minister of State in the De-
partments of Parliamentary Affairs
and Communications (Shri I. K.
Gujral): (a) to (c). A statement is
laid on the Table of the Lok Sabha 
[Placed in Library. See No. LT-138/
67.)

Telegraphists
122. Shri Bal Raj Madhok: Will the 

Minister of Communications be pleas-
ed to state.

(a) whether it is a fact that the
Telegraphists in the P. it T. Depart-
ment besides performing identical

duties, possess many additional quali-
fications as compared to their coun-
terparts in the Overseas Communica-
tions Service;

(b) whether there w a marked d»s- 
crtmlnptton between their scales of
pay; and

(c) if so, the steps taken to remove
this disparity?

The Minister of Stat« in the Depart-
ments of Parliamentary Affairs and
Communications (Shri I. K. Gujral):
(a) to (c). The duties of Telegraphists
in the P. & T. Department are not
identical to those performed by Tele-
graphists in the Overseas Communi-
cations Service. The question of dis-
crimination in pay scales does not,
therefore, arise. The Pay Commis-
sions have equated Telegraphists in 
the P & T. Department with other
allied TTadres m the Department who
are on the same time-scale of pay.

Telegrams sent from New Delhi
C.T.O.

123. Shri Bal Raj Madhok: Will the 
Minister of Communications be
pleased to state:

(a) the number of telegrams sent 
by post, the number of telegrams
posted in original and the number of
telegrams transferred to local sub-
offices from New Delhi Central Tele-
graph Office during January and 
February, 1987,

(b) the total number of man-hours
employed for the purpose and the 
total expenditure involved in the
shape of salary and overtime; and

(c) the average per hour output
per official in the process’

Hie Minister of State In the De-
partments of Partlamantary Affairs
ana OommiunftcatkMui (Shri I. K.
Gujral): (a) to (c). Hie information
is given in the form of a statement
given below:- -




