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The Sangeet Natak Akadami is an
autonomous body, and it gives the
grants without even consulting the
Central Government.

Mr. Speaker: The hon. M em bers
question is who initiates these grants,
the State Governments or the Sangeet
Natak Akadami.

Dr. M. M. Das: Applications are re­
ceived by the Sangeet Natak Akadami.

Shri Sanganna: May I know whether
such grants have been made to other
States for these purposes?

Dr. M. M. Das: Yes, during the last
financial year 1953-54, a total grant
of Rs. 75,000 has been given to different
organisations in different states by the
Sangeet Natak Akadami.

Shri Sanganna: May I know the
names of those organisations?

Mr. Speaker: I do not think we need
go into that detail now.
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The Minister of Home Affairs and
States (Dr. Katju): (a) A  sum of
Rs. 8,63,05,000 has been advanced to
the Jammu and Kashmir Government
as interest-bearing loans and an amount
of about Rs. 6,33,58,000 under ‘Aid to
Kashmir’. In addition an amount of
about Rs. 324 lakhs has been spent
upto the end of March 1953 on that
part of the Jammu-Pathankot road
which is within the State limits.

(b) An amount of Rs, 233*80 lakhs
has been given in connection with de­
velopment schemes.
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Shri Gadgil: Not interested!

Dr. KatJu: It varies from  3 per cent,
to 4 per cent, on various items.
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Shri S. N. Das: May I know whether
the Government are aware as to what
is the extent of the expenditure from
the loan so far advanced?

Dr. Katju: These amounts have been
given during the last 8 years and I
imagine a good deal has been spent.

Shri Bhagwat Jha Azad: May I know
whether this amount of approximately
Rs. 20 crores given relates to a specific
period, and whether in addition, other
amounts have also been given?

Dr. Katju: No other amount is ad­
vanced to the Jammu and- Kashmir
Government.
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The Deputy Minister of Defence
(Sardar Majithia): (a) Out o f 930 such

^claims, 13 pension/gratuity claims in
respect of officers and 10 pension/
gratuity claims in respect of other
ranks, are outstanding.

(b ) The claims could not be settled
for various reasons, such as want of
average pay statement in respect of
pay for the substantive rank, comple­
tion of service documents counting of
former service etc.

(c ) Before the formation of Vindhya
Pradesh, dearness allowance was being
paid to pensioners in Rewa, Panna and
IDatia States. Government orders have
been issued for the continuance of the
payment of the allowance to the mili­
tary pensioners of these three States.
The question of granting the conces-
:sion to military pensioners of other
States of Vindhya Pradesh, is under
examination.

(d ) Payment in the case o f military
pensioners o f the former States of
Hewa, Panna and Datia, will start as
soon as the claims for the allowance,
under the latest orders, are passed by
the audit authorities.

(e) Yes, Sir.
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Mr. Speaker: The hon. Member should
not have waited till he had completed
the reply. Is it possible for the Minis­
ter to state the reply in Hindi?

Sardar Majithia: It is dimcult to
translate it totally, but I wiU make a
rough attempt.
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Shri Gadgil: May I know whether it
is not a fact that persons from the
Defence Services have retired and their
pensions.......

Mr. Speaker: Order, order. The Chair
is not able to hear because the hon.
Member is not facing the Chair. He
should face the Chair.

Shri Gadgil: May I know whether it
is not a fact that many persons have
been retired and their pension papers
have not been finalised for years to­
gether?

Mr. Speaker: So far as Vindhya
Pradesh is concerned?

Shri Gadgil: I am not talking o f
Vindhya Pradesh but of others.

Mr. Speaker: The question is restrict­
ed only to Vindhya Pradesh.

Sardar Majithia: Off-hand, I do not
mind answering that question. The
difficulties are common. Sometimes
their records are not available because
after the Partition, the inhabitants- 
originally came from  West Pakistan
and their records have not been given.
Their units were there and in some
cases, their records of service due to
the war have not been completed. All
these difficulties are there and the  ̂
papers have to be thoroughly checked
before we can give them pension.

Shri Gadgril: Meanwhile people have
died.

L o a n  t o  P u n j a b

*2284. Shri D. C. Sharma: W ill the
Minister of Finance be pleased tO' 
state:

( a )  the amount of the loan ro far
advanced to the Government of Punjab
for the construction o f the capital at
Chandigarh;

(b) whether it is proposed to advance
any further amount to the State Gov­
ernment for this purpose; and

(c) if so, how much?

The Parliamentary Secretary to the
Minister of Finance (Shri B. R.
Bhagat): (a) Rs. 75 lakhs.

(b) and (c ). The amount to be
given in 1954-55 has not yet been de­
cided. The Punjab Government have
however requested for a loan o f Rs.
lf)8 lakhs for the Capital Project in
1954-55. This is under consideration.

Shri D. C. Sharma: May I know by
what lime this loan which they have
asked for will be finalised and also,
whether this loan is adequate for the
construction of the capital?

Shri B. R. Bhagat: This loan has
been asked for for the current year and
the Planning Commission is actively^




