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Statement

'ituo*

I. Tista Barrage

a. Lining of Mgyunfcshi Canal

». Upper Kangsabati

4.Dwarkeshwar

5•Gajol Lift Irrigation

«. Delong

Mtdiwn

1 Tango na

2.Parga

3.Barabhum

4. Moutore Jore

5- Saida

6. Beko

7. Path

8. Rath

9. Extension of Boundhu Irrigation

10 Ramchandrapuf

11.Sail Reservoir

12 Gjlmaraiore

13 Hinumatl

f4 Narayanpur Sona

IS Lipaniajore

6. Salt Diversion.

Social Welfare Schemes for Tamil 
Nadu

8516  SHRI R V SWAMINATHAN: 
Will the Minister  o£  EDbCATluiM, 
SOCIAL WELFARE AND CULTURE 
be pleased to state

(a) the  Central  Social  Welfare 
Schemes that  will  be  undertaken 
during the 1975-76 in the State  of 
Tamil Nadu,

(b) whether this State has been 
ignored in this regard in the past,

(c) total amount likely to be spent 
in the ltfth Five Year Plan on Social 
Welfare Schemes; and

(d)  the nature of that social wel­
fare schemes  which  will be under­
taken during the  Fifth  Vive Year 
Pl*n?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE 
MINISTRY OF EDUCATION AND 
SOCIAL  WELFARE  AND IN THE 
DEPARTMENT OF CULTURE (SHRI 
ARVIND NETAM)  (a) The foXLowinC: 
Social Welfare plan  schemes in the 
central and centrally sponsored sec­
tors sectors will be undertaken during 
the year 1975-76 in the State ol Tamil 
Nadu

(1) family and ch'ld welfare pro* 
Jects,

(it) weltore of destitute children; 

(ui) condensed courses of education 
for adult women,

(tv) socio-economic programme;

(v) hostels for working women;

(vi) scholarships,  research, traia- 
ing, sheltered employment and 
grants-in-aid  to  volnuntary 
organisations lor the welfare 
of the handicapped,

(vn) social work education, train­
ing and research,

(vui) integrated education of handi­
capped children,

(ix) placement of the handicapped 
persons through special em­
ployment exchanges, and 

(x) grants  to  voluntary  or­
ganisation  by  the  Central 
Social Welfare Board

The following social welfare schemes 
in the central and centrally sponsored 
sectors are likely to be  undertaken 
during 1975-76 in the State of Tamil 
Nadu

(I) functional literacy; and

(II) integrated child  development 
services.

(b) No, Sir

(c) An outlay of Rs 200 crores has 
been  provided for  social  welfare 
schemes In the central and centrally 
sponsored sectors in the Draft Fifth 
Five Ye8r Plan.
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(d)  The social  welfare  schemes, 
which will be undertaken in the cent­
ra] and  centrally  sponsored sectors 
during the Filth Five Year Flan, are 
of the nature of family welfare; child 
welfare; women’s welfare; welfare of 
the handicapped, education, training 
and  research, and  grants-in-aid to 
voluntary organisations.

Norms for recommending Irrigation 
Projects

8517. SHRI  SHANKERRAO  SA­
VANT Will the  Minister of  AGRI­
CULTURE  AND  IRRIGATION  be 
pleased to refer to tne reply given to 
Starred Question No. 466 on the 24th 
March,  1975  regarding  terms and 
conditions of loan lor Godavari Bar­
rage project by World Bank and state:

(a) the norms for recommending Ir­
rigation Projects to the World Bank 
lor Its assistance;

(b) which  Irrigation Projects  in 
Maharashtra have been recommended 
to the World Bank; and

(c) reaction of the World Bank to 
these projects?

THE DEPUTY MINISTER IN THE
ministry or agriculture and
IRRIGATION  (SHR XEDAR NATH 
SINGH); (a) The following norms are 
broadly  followed m  recommending 
irrigation  projects fot Woild Bank 
assistance —

(l)  Project is included in the deve­
lopment plan of the State and accept­
ed by the Planning Commission;

(ii)  The State can provide adequate 
funds fur speedy completion within a 
fixed time limit:

(ui) Project does nol involve any 
Inter-State aspects tj b» settled.

(iv)  Scheme rhoulci be economically 
viable.

(b)  The Government of India  is 
examining the possibility of seeking 
World Bank  assistance for  Wafts,

Krishna and Bhlma Projects in Maha­
rashtra.

(c) Does not arise.
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