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(c) the total amount of loaDS 
granted by the Central Government 
upto March, 1962; and 

(d) the total amount of loans 
recovered from them upto March, 
1962? 

The Mbdster of Works, Housing 8Dd 
Supply (Shri Mehr Chand Klwma): 
(a) In Dandakaranya, allotment at 
present is being made only to erst-
while campers from West Bengal. 

(b) to (d). Do not arise. 
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ImIastrIaI TraIDiDg IDstitate, lacpore, 
on-

1297. Shri UIaka: Will the Minister 
of Works, HoasiDg 8Dd Supply be 
pleased to state: 

(a) the progress made in the con-
struction of Industrial Training Insti-
tute under the Dandakaranya Deve-

. lopment Authority at Jugpore 
(Orissa); and 

(b) the date by which it would be 
completed and start functioning? 

The Minister of Works, Housing 8Dd 
Supply (Shri Mehr CbaDd Klwma): 
(a) and (b). The construction of the 
building for the Industrial Institute 
has come above the plinth level and· 
is expected. to be completed by the 
end of October, 1962. The Institute 
will start functioning soon thereafter. 

rribal Folk Sonp 

1298. Shri UIaka: Will the Minister 
of Information and Broadcasting be 
pleased to state: 

(a) whether various tribal folk 
songs are broadcast from All India 
Radio, Cuttack; 

(b) if so, the number of days in 
the week on wl)ich they are broad-
cast; and 

(c) the time allotted for IIIICh 
broadcast? 

The Deputy Minister in the MiDi8-
try of Information and BroadeastiDc 
(Shri Sham Nath): (a) Yes, Sir. 

(b) Regularly once a week in a 
special programme, every Saturday. 
Tribal music also figures in other light 
music programmes of the Station. 

(c) 15 minutes in the special pro-
gramme. 

Documentaries on Tribal People in 
Iadia 

1299. Shri Ulaka: Will the Minister 
ot Information and BroadeastiaJr be 
pleased to state the number of docu-
mentary films produced on the lives 




