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and jeweleiy Kerns as dstlnct from ttieir 
private jmvelary; and

(c)thedelaHsofsuchiten«ofRegional 
and oams and ieviallarv dadarod bv
the former ruleis?

TH E  MINISTER O F  S TA TE  IN TH E  
MINISTRYOFPARLIAMENTARYAFFARS 
A lO  TH E  MINISTER O F  S TA TE  IN TH E  
MINISTRYOFHOMEAFFAIRS(SHRIM.M. 
JACO B): (a)Gov8mmentdonotconsldert 
proper that either the value or the detaiis of 
property recognised as private property of 
the Rules should tie a matter for pubic 
disclosure.

(b) w d  (c). The Government of India in 
the While Paper put)llshed in 1950, had 
stated mteralia, that In a large number of 
cases, ancestral jewellery has been treated 
as heirioom to be preserved for the Ruling 
family. In the case of the states having 
valuable regalia, such articles are to remain 
in the custody of the Ruler lor use on 
ceremonial occassiona and they wW be 
subject to periodical inspection by the 
Gk)vemments concerned.

ITransbdiotH

Ashram Schools forSC/ST

2964. SHRI RAM NARAIN BERWA: 
WiflthellibnisterofWELFAREbepleasedto

(a) the State-wise nuntwr of Ashram 
Schools’ opened during the last three years 
for the students belonging to Scheduled 
Castes and Scheduled Tribes;

(b) whether Government propose to 
open 'Ashram Schoor in every Tehsil 
headquarter under the Scheme; and

(c) If so, the detaOs thereof?

TH E MINISTER O F  W ELFARE (SHRI 
SITARAMKESF«):(a)ACentrallySponsotBd 
Scheme for Establishment of Ashram 
Schools for Scheduled Iribes In Tribal sub- 
f>lan areas is under Implementation since
1990-91. Rupees two crores were released 
to State Governments of Andhra Pradesh; 
Gujarat. K a m a t ^  Kerala. Orissa. SMdm. 
Tam I Itedu, Tripura and Utter Pradesh for 
opening of SO Ashram Schools during 1990- 
91. A  statement showing State-wise details 
Is enclosed. In 1991-92, Rs. 68.38 lakhs has 
been released so farto the States of K ^ a .  
Orissa and Tripura as Central share for 
opening of Ashram Schools for studente 
twionging to Scheduled Iribes.

(b) and (c). The Centraly Sponsored 
scheme for opening of Ashram Schools in 
Tribal sub-Plan areas includes Tehsil 
headquarters as well.
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