Fourteenth Loksabha

Session : 9
Date : 01-12-2006
Participants : Acharia Shri Basudeb,Pathak Shri Brajesh

an=>

Title: Regarding damage to the statue of Dr. Bhim Rao Ambedkar.

SHRI BASU DEB ACHARIA (BANKURA): Sir, I have given a notice for suspension of Question
Hour.... (Interruptions) A democratic institution has been attacked. ... (Interruptions)

sft g UTe® (ST4): SIUIme HEley, gAY afordl R IR & fadig # @ik 9rer WRe arded] @) ufaen
P Gfed 9 & AT W 73 Fia WA S ®FHE TRad W® g9l 1 Arfed faar 21, (eraus) gafey &
G BT B B, (@9uH)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I will listen to all of you after the Question Hour.
... (Interruptions)
MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I will listen to all of you after the Question Hour.
... (Interruptions)
#ft A TR (aReft): HHAT I B W HA S TSAT g, I8 DHIH] GHRAYY 7. (TaH)

SHRI BASU DEB ACHARIA : A democratic institution has been attacked. So, Sir, please give me
a chance to speak. It is a very important issue. ... (Interruptions)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Shri Acharia, I will give you time during the ‘Zero Hour.’
... (Interruptions)
MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Please sit down. Nothing is going on record.

(Interruptions)™ ...

IqTEAE HEISd: W U Al g UeE B U B B WA B BT Al T 2 SR g Afew st ayea
A BT §| FOIY UISEH S BT R YedTd d6T 6Ied &1 A B Wid axT @ g # g1 # awsan § 98 a9
WARTw amar 21 safay 78 s fAad 8 5 ued &rd & ger <1 ¥ 916 Y B A § D! diem Bl A
TER | ST Sft bl Wi # der &1 AT |

.. (agagm)

*Not recorded



MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Please sit down. Nothing is going on record.
(Interruptions)™ ...
MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I will accommodate you after the Question Hour.

... (Interruptions)[R1]

Surend wered v Rare # oo T8l S|

sft SOTY UG : B9 q1dT ATed B YA dei¥d 8l B Abhd gl SUEHel of, ¥ diew & v uta fiee @
|qag fear sy, .. (gagm)

SUTEhel Heled  : Ush fAee s 43 gl |
st Hom AR (BAAAT) @ H A U BT IHA Hdg HAT AR g ... (FEEr)
MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Hon. Members, please sit down.
... (Interruptions)
MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I will accommodate you after the Question Hour.

#ft orer qut (WagR) « @ W B iR o o g8 7, 89 39 <9 & Afdur fwtar &1 e wed wE e
qHd ¢l ... (TFaEr)

sft A7 TG ACT (FERYY) ¢ 59 W B WREE Pt @ wRe i @ w8 aw aga R A 2.
(caeT)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Hon. Members, please sit down. Nothing is going on record.
(Interruptions)™ ...
MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Nothing should be recorded except the speech of Shri Brajesh Pathak.

(Interruptions)™ ...

* Not recorded



SUTETE HEIGd  : Ided Off, 3T 98 g, Ured o, o7 W 98 wgd | <Red wift wiféal & @ww ¥ u7 W ane
& 6 39 W o5 <rgH faar syl § Rvad AR B TS BT T Argdm gl oifhe gue e Wt ¥ ured o 9
He fb 9 Ut a1d |1 AT § gAY sHfay # uies il Bl §HA < & g

# T IOSFH U N, IR YT D HAGR F q1@1 Ao HHRE srEedH St B g B @S 9M @ 91,
IR U, HERIG R U B 30 ol # g @t o R U1 &1 T ] Swa 3R Smudten g Bl
FTedl gl HERIG H JAiQler @ QR U & URIR & TR & AR T & 3R 4 94 gferd o sfigiel ox W& A
%@l AT, oS Hl 99 W AR AR, d1dT Wigd Bl Gf B dred @ arg fhar S @ 21 g8 afordl @
A Bl BRI & S ARl &1 9AM & e 4R & |Ag 3 Aogdl & &1 M [Bar g1 39 7wl B
IR 3R N el RIS fars wavdl @ wRiifes arar wred srasax @1 Afamn & dred darel galforli @1 ol dab
RFR & fF = 21 e ARwR e = @ S9! shieas SR T 2| Sferdl 31 989 &1 & fay,
o T & Us A @ ARER e war 21 <fodl & oresf Ge S & forg arefifds wmr & va s
S HERT T T 1 R 21 v IRt @fdd el o <en 7 10-12 e S o g2 w99 T8 9% wear @
3R gfemm & RR &1 7l drs wabal §1 U aferd Uar &t R €1 T8l Aabdl ® Hifh 98 ardl ATsd Dl Al
HRAET AT 21 3/ 39 AT B Aidleng g aws Wl (FarE gara # afwfad 9@ e @)
SHfIY IR U &1 AYBR B qud T@G BT AMY 3R T8 W AU e R A ). .. (Faer)

sft IETSiara G99 (FRRRITTETR) @ I8 STR UQ SRR &I 967919 &3 @t |iforer 21, .. (eraem) )

11.10 hrs
(At this stage Shri Toofani Saroj and some other hon. Members
came an stood on the floor near the Table.)
......... (TagT™) [13)
11.11 hrs

(At this stage Shri Toofani Saroj and some other hon. Members

went back to their seats.)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Allegation should not be recorded.

(Interruptions)™ ...

IUTEhel HRIed  : gAA oft, Yferier & wrdardl & fAarer faam mam gl

... (Tge)



MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Nothing is going on record.
(Interruptions)™ ...
SUTEHE HEIed  : gAA off, ferem & Srard) | e faam war 2

... (eTger)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: The House stands adjourned to meet again at 11.30 a.m.

11.12 hrs

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till thirty minutes

past Eleven of the Clock.

* Not recorded



