>
Title: Need to determine appropriate remunerative price for onion in the country.

ot af¥areg acewr (R=18) @ aoriler Fwmufer s@icer, 3 snuds e 3 IFErR A Fordt wIon arEar g smuel IS aga 8l Aecayol fwer uz dieror @1 s <t 8, 3 e
& 3308 g1 A o § of SAeTR 9 K 3 wIel @1 3curgel AT &, R werdh 3 wiar dier 8| SIaelic B Wl B STel a9 avq Affrm & daa a3 usd
ATGSIorD Fraerel 3ol &1 Srwad eft, Slel AM9UID 6l RIS it T ofdl, a8 ) @alt e o1, SADT Acleld RIST STol 9 el Al ofdl &) S| a8 Slol A9 ofdl &
Y u3ifdrrer aaiEdt wae 3 &7

wIrel & wep Al 3R] FRiar aga & war Al 8) ag sicg @ TemE Aol ardlt disr 8 321 wer 6 Feft wen asiwa b2l @Y aga 2 v A a1 3, SR A AST 3T
STI¥R 3 S0l AiEe) 3 216 Aol & b Abe 3 vt ot Blard agn & amewiel © 26 &, b2 oft 33t ford! 22t 5 wirer @ pfdrier walfEdt 3 Brpeon midy

3ATT &A12 261 53D vaAlsiazs 3 dian dene @l &l P, del iz b e am, HUsRUI T uEs? o i wilda vars 70 gar HUE A & i Ja wed fGenao:
Jorepl aafi-wmelt Yifibe uia g FURl @ 63 gale BURl frern &, sAfere aga 3 el 3t oft &A1Y w8l acasen wad &

33t IR @ uw Hik ot ferdt 8 e St reiia giew 500 Sier aw @ een &, 33! 9o Bl Bt S 3, sAfere ¥ MU et A AIPR A Rord o [ &2 e
RIS TPl 365, Yot @raen ol aifdn, Brt sid 3 wier 6 fvcam ssRt o 21 RrRl R i spew Slell g 78 315

*t32
Title: Need to set up a Steel factory by Steel Authority of India Limited in Tikamgarh Parliamentary Constituency of Madhya Pradesh.

31, dhveg wan (Qwaerg) : 2l #adea, & wer y2or B Swnors sy A e A aen g M dudter &g B sy B 3 Rerae gwrasn aen asures 8
Jreedl apuraent areY eils Jreas wi fdone sisi &) Aast ad ud A Asi w2 dls s A ear gy fBeer sien a1 8 yreflor wrer A RBsrae A seurt & o aerdt ey usrst 3 amar
#ft 3ud Ros Jx@ o Bre 2) 23 6 swerodt B a2 adeer 3 Jor B St seurd 2 E, Jord 2wl St &is aERo 2, 3AA 3 A 4 yfrerer A afdiw e F oo B
ustEt 3 Sl arRas 8, 33 elar 8, St aiftras sprae aren &) Risey o 9 Reger & avall eren Yerd 31 fden of g6 A asi s2urT ey Fenfte ol & wor & anat §2 &g A
worldiafl grar Reer 2izie] e@mol a1 aswel yraan Rsen i gast & aen el ensol il afermgz A sy ao Rerl s albt & Brads woun 5@ 3 ssurd g enfte ool et
A RN ) goerxis o1 b e &) i A vw &, By AR Ror & e 3o 30 6 amagwraar 8

aezr ggor e B grn wrl orft sedeeat afte e aeiifdd sifw e gt vl ue seeng @ wfr yefdka & srft eft) arr: @ 3 sprde & R ofty s Bon 3
wrlardl a2 g3 ad B wrl deon 3 enfirer oz s¢er ariifyd iiv s g sy 3 e orumen #erRl sirel &t uger g2 &t sm, |

*t33
Title: Need to revive Maize Research Centre in Begusarai Parliamentary Constituency of Bihar.

3. sitenn Ris (Sorznr) : sdicy, ¥ faer & doprrr i wn &g 3 amar §) 23 ad usdt WRER Bt & gowdi, sit giérn & wadt sdv wielt swfter &, ast aearlior
g AR ol FAADT IAofRAelol Pog, b Fendern &Y #fty 23 adl 3 g a1 SRl Pog, ot AUl IpjRiemel & Ve I wep off spoRitrer & dlor B Befladl ol & &) aai
ueiftrrrt 8, wetardl oft 3, sy ol of Fave wass switar <t & sz st as 3 s gan 3

e ol &t @t & b 21 o1 B skeliferes Jpia uz ww arga etpra w1 Juenust gt 3 aiiy stofenn B dia 3 g iz anomd gl & acdarel WwR Bierds Pt sidl, Pl
JAxepler sfiz eIz & A2 8| &1 Ford AU eI A MG oIl Alsd & [ fofienol Pog 3 sil aforfddaan g3 &, cleulc g3 3 3iiz S YEeTanR I e BRI 281 8, 4 sADL
Sifd @2 3liz 32 [z & fére 531 gorsles ot B fere srager itz sMfdia wrlad @) @ $31 3l AR ©l el Bitd wIell aIsd &)

*t34
Title: Need to review the Jawahar Lal Nehru National Urban Renewal Mission (JNNURM).

oft ofizer anrcur aRoY (arac): rorofler Zremafer ardlaer, 3 2R @i earel it weon aEar § b SiaG2 I dies Yeiffafur o A sicela el sdta b oy @A
forattor <1 eisron @ordt &) sl fo1e dvg Sz 21oer 2 forfér yra St 3 Mg A varer et aiie 2rsw A dier cao yia gian 3) ot =toren emamedt 2, ag g1 o Sar 3) & s Woten
B TIW A2 W1 ol AT 2o dradr & & AR, b AT 8 A & Mud Riaarst @wruieer @ srag o deE AsenR oten B aidefa 2050 wwrelt @l fere
afla 6,500 @ds e Bict & s Asmen B sicela ot awer aor 3, olfldl B fore ot ar aor &, A Bivar Biferzdt B i St g andt 2 33t @0t 3) 7 anuwwT &= 53 3l
anenftfar averen argan & s v ancHt @I 3 orm @IE o Braar oft srcorar aor & 301 U2 2 TP dsog, 3R DAt Msran @ soft @t frfer et & A aen go @i ardl St
&7 Yog @ 3 Ysia o aia g [ Vit o A Mfd yem @ Stev A Sz A

*t35



Title: Regarding crisis in Iraq.

off It g =381 (D) @ Femufer #EkGe, d Aer Fu A s iz e B Bt w Agel @1 wel Anltia wEr ared g &0 denaR 53 S 38 3 ied o1 #dlel A
ud S Usdl Sl [Fefer a1 A Jfifyen 3 3rusar & eff, RPRRE ©R agl & e aEiyd], @ d [l off et 3 JEiia 8, a0 361 ol usen aiead &, @ adar sl
QeI 1 [91nR dlent us a1 & gioren A S Zerfer scusel 2l 8, ag Rian o fwer &) s & amarct 1.25 @dls 2) asi & cilor glorn a2 3 om ol snT &) Brr ymor o
Teoll el 6l ol & arer g¢ afiz Alyer vd ferfepa 3 38 32 ool sl uf¥arsmmil & Arer faeer ATIerT ol cPIAR Aub T 281 A B9l Bkl 3 b 308 A8 amt arn
i) &di g ot e 2%l den [ Red sa B o w2 e &, o1 agd cller b3 & ol dal siel ud e uel & e @l fére ) Iedier Edel vele @ 43 e ) it asi
JepIR e & Jorml 43 & &) aga 12 el dle @32 @8l 3 &) Po st 2 a8l ©H ©l 518 P el el d2 oidl 3 um &)

smufer #@lcR, Riar s ara & & o dlee sl Prefda 3 apft st aga 0% degaere dwel wal gu &) weor o amelt aew 3 seyR e fear & # Juen saers off, sweft
MR ® 3R T Bt Bioer o e o aea § #S1 uan & [ oz & o walf3Rl of ast o @2 Jort A e & afie s b oIeIf¥! @l a o o2 A
&) u1g wo aordla fawer ) sy et gform w12 31 o @2 @ W &, oot g glorn w1 sl firen & Sfdvor Rien s 2 fop ot Yoz A st $F acone &) #@ &, St dler
AT ¥ A @R s vorewn.ea Sund &, T g & e asl w2 smut A 81 32 &, 3o dif¥el @t et yrmvr gt gforn 3 & va1 &, sPR S sme At 3 gEdr o
G2 ¥ &N dl ordl S A &)

#dlGe, ot af¥erdn sa 3R 2fifwn # 3cucal & a1 &, we Riar @1 fwer &) St oft arpd st oellt g€ &, e & dia 3 seist &, 3 531 ue fewft aidt o asar § st g
gforn 3 v siRerar wi srdier 3euser dlom wElGRI, 9 08 Yielolr sl AIEI &, UG RfE aell sl § v frse $¥e 3 gg O Rafy wor gt &, 320 Jur ame) Rdas,
St aref¥es anft aft s3ras @ s 2emEll w3 WA gu & 368 A el B e AR o ysel B &) 7 @z o qurd o B -2 Ae ot weon araen § R SN 9 et 3o
a1ad & 3od A ol e frer ellell @Y argd enen arn &, wnR g feifd 3 3o1 ellell @Y avsl govrar afie om e aseol & aftif¥es e &or &t ez wy) aig 4
A5zt As eltor 8, A sparrer A eier 2, A Rgr B elter &1 an A weargSer W eor &, IwR FHdcerm A5 rer Jordt Fyarzmai uz frar o3

HON. CHAIRPERSON :

*m02 Shri Shivkumar Udasi and

*mO03 Dr. Virendra Kumar are allowed to associate with the matter raised by Shri Rajiv Pratap Rudy.

*36
Title: Need to set up a marine training academy in Gujarat.

oftercht srrefidor uRer (drezmom) @ ane2vfler Aamufey sdlcw, st #A sscagyl fauwr uz dierst @ dlar e &, sad e @ s geware Jon aiadl &) Ao Reel etw 2
A g1 R o) ez 3orn ) $A e o Aol ¥ ar-ar 3om B A P are ot awern yra ordf g€ eft st d vas waran 8 1 " w6t aw srersdtorell” s d fve A
53 Hacaqul iRl U2 3 e A AR @l ol it w2on aradl &) st i 1663 fvaefles & amfeas Mo usdl 3 sl aul A s afler 22t A g1 W@ 3
A B ser0l vl AdGarefter e e O Hdorer 2wrp: Wred Ryl el der @1 @ il yfern weorn, dov die aen ase W zenfia fow ) 12 sz 5 cor B
dle gr1 wiree dQeer B o 2 &) 2wy oz a2 3 War ot wT DRl g1 w20l 3 LI el olFaR U2 &) Wel ¢ I DT 3 9% &l orN &) AN AMan B R 3 ort
w20l aliz sifuelz G 2ot & fore arcel Roxa ot siogma Sl &) 3o @l 3 ENA YR B Yfdisr arel wafaif¥el, wizee gferr el i syd asmol ait aftrrdl o
aetenf¥el @) Jords fAifdree @t A5 sfpu aycTorT gidreru dot b fere Rizere @i aem e AQfRier die A sifudarr sz dercala A arz 3 sdorer @Rl aeor B aifeT srageraar
& R e sicwl yoor &1 arefla, Bign & w2 3)...(cmaue)

& v arer wgon atsdl g adlor yfer vorsHl o1 Baiv w6l B e IERE IeR of Po w gféra sftofe & du ot as B Ao e o ademr ot b e
arair ey fBrNapfboet iz foior & e anavee seer JRAmal o #F ool 3x@? AN O fere dede-adlor gferr vorsHl & e el &) s HIoR of 53 vosH! &
fere dog, &t srwsa & gafdo smwepR el 3 250 vos sefter Bigem ot I e Jgiftre Jgaf s &) sa3t a1 s Ao o ot a@erT o &)

areT: d A2 A spRl & @ adlor 22l 3 ope1 22 s sl Sor &Y Fy2en &I ufdglt &q spria 2w i wdler 2fier varsal & Fenuen B sl Siea 3 sice dI Sme den

*t37
Title: Request to grant compensation to five applicants died during physical test for police recruitment in Mumbai.

3t fsfle idien (s s ud) @ aimerofter aemufer Sft, apad ... (eremer) Sip Members are disturbing me and asking about the allotment of houses.
...(@remer) gFad 3 &Y 1 usel fora gz @bt ufdf3afer 3 20 e, 22 A ¥ uia siterari! Bt ey &, F 53 yfer amuest Al MU IRHI A ARBIR, TSI DI ATl
it avzen aigar g A srarer Reafere grad sne A wrf ssfe@Ach snfeardt &iq 3 amem e, w1 gy B MBS &I A =T &y 95 derer & uferar Bt areft 3 A wdtgn ol
& fere, oifepdt ¥ fore ame &) gFad S 91az i [Gel-galS A ARE @9, 36 @I, ol &, dlel @5l AR A2 3 IR Jorhl fbfSrrer Tc ot wien ar$ Itz Sper ardion 9, i
ot v it oft ot Jrepe, vap &t ot uia clisil &t a7y ol g usel v &t ey, S-cliol o1 B aig g, @R f&or are iz, dien, uidar, 17 csil @ sudrer 3 ardt
52all Usl| Alfdvel dg BT Pl Bl A1 ) Ioalal uid elloll Bl e dw Pw ofdl s ANl IEle, YT WM 3o1d Yfel IR, 36 Jiefl, ufern whirez @1 s
@s 281 A1 [ bfSier 2xe Al sorebl ardlel w1 531 gtz A arsiras a1 IsiEl) Afdvel IS A of A1, B J¥ el of 316 dicfl, Wog, @1 vy oft aer, el o gram oft ordl
atiaft

19.00 hrs.

ofa @ o1 uf¥ar} @t A Wog, IIDR > 916 A} Aorofter Asromer Bis B urRT srm, dY 3oaior st G w2 s iy 4t all these physical tests are being carried out.
P50, IR DI Al A arT DD $A DIl Dol difée i Sl e ol &, Joreot e ficroft arfée) sorbt aige a yerderer dlon arfén,

3 3uds e A Wog, ATBR A AP W6l diadl & 5 St ularz duaz 21 5R1 &, 3613 Yfer ag IAdcoln &rep a2 AT gy As 3 331 YR &I deel of 81, a8 1



HON. CHAIRPERSON:

*m02 Shri Kamlesh Paswan,

*m03 Shri Shivkumar Udasi and

*m04 Shri Devji M. Patel associated themselves with the matter raised by Dr. Kirit Somaiya.

*t38

Title: Issue regarding problem of drug-addiction among youth in Punjab.

oft srde ammor (2e1s2): wmufer oft, amuat aer SfidY affas 3 dieror w1 ot e, 335 e smuT aga-agd towarg A 3121 7% @ MRS e 3 o1 B AIS! IAToI ATEAT
&, ag WferRwe oft 3 afe 2orer oft 3; Sor @Y arrss waarer 3 dona & gaifer 90 yferere 3 sener &, Afdver airet dotia @Y w1 2 Ay 91 dota G W el ) J91 datg
@t e @) anst Yo aga ad ger agsBer A an awn 2 3l ag g1 aysBer Ao 3) d dsast Yol afdy 3 ug 2@ g--According to the survey conducted by
Shri Guru Nanak Dev University ...(smaemer)

HON. CHAIRPERSON : Hon. Members, the time of the House was extended up to 7 o'clock. Now there are three more Members to speak. So, if the
House agrees, we may extend the time of the House till they complete their speeches.

SEVERAL HON. MEMBERS: Yes.

off srerder amor * Aanufer ardlcw, according to the survey conducted by Shri Guru Nanak Dev University, Amritsar ufefendie & &> urr siaedica & 73.5 per
cent of youth in the age of 16 to 25 years in Punjab is drug addicted. dsima & @& aert & orft &) doma A5 Tyear Qo a2 28 & @5 s qed s 3 oft Siess @
as3 &, ol dsi U2 Aw B sl w3 Al wadt &, Afdvel asi w2 @l &) spR aa o, M aadt &, Afder wAsi uz o st vadl &) doma A atia 3 Rifer aw] o1 arn &, aeiifds
A 3ot a1 @Y ot e A F) doma B w3 A Rifder wwef o1 arn ) ota aS-ad AwRR! uasd IR o Jeakor siferyact Bifdrres wi o e, Afver Jorw) I g 3 & acfior
fre & &t arfly anft S wasd S 22 &, S Wifeifeaser eor &, & anar eNall & arer oidl oY, A Rrb difdar aoftall & arer YorY & doma 3 @ifdar agfisl &5t snarst @Rl O
Raenw arft 2, o 3e8ior awn Roen? ... (@maurer)

HON. CHAIRPERSON: No allegations can be levelled.

off sorder aivor : 3 wellloroa ordl e Jar §) ws Mo i am &l § O ad-wd Al B e &) spll 3odiol B ARal g A s A o1 elfes @ uws W@ §
<. (ercrerror) anretofler #icft oft, @ acmon arsm & v s A Goica @) uws 233 & Hiorn) d-ufdasmer Jez 3 Aon aifde ey apfl dera 3 70 sene d-efdasme et &) d 4 amor
& fore @il 3 81 A vorma 3 Ricren oo Ry 2a1 &) sier sdlaser @S, o uasd a8 &, 91 Ul witfrdic @1 27 3--33sar 218 Wolt, Rk 25-30 R ¥ sdasa @is
ar 3, Borfder 43 Poft, 2@ 6 Poft, azer 1736M, R ves #idlar 3 sclagion @Ys & el a yadl ot &) domra 591 31 gl 26 3 6 9N &) dona & oitraror [t
Exe ura ordl @2 ur 22 &, Sl wisr ar gfer 3 ol Qo e aifde

gafifero 9 amuds aneem 3 AR A el e & By seflfoe vaver rn SR 3 e diw sif¥edr an Derid sif¥est @1 snewn doten SiRl, aifts dsia 3 e & Awend
BB

*t39
Title: Issue regarding poor telecommunication services provided by BSNL in Jharkhand.

off wftog, o uw (Bif¥is) : wmufer wete, smwds g, Fmrm? Bif¥dls, wiswr, semdtaw, tomars, dwrRt anfé &gl 3 o @ steab e ool 2
eligel der-aekd 36l 3 2t @ St &) wier O gt Tew aren =ifts waen [ enser sodier wie <t &) bl A sy 4iq I ARt RRae o1 s e &, sei fRest
wep atia &) 18l @erer i eraR uersan & dfa aul 3 a9 cier 331 fawer i 301 2% &) Aftver 531 W @1 Forard o &1 @ &) ag forwr 377 & asa 81, S smaz 3 81w adwer
amaz 3 oft 531 978 @1 B <l o Jorn & FANY amel AN yavs 3 Sif waerdst 8, agl t-sft Rren arq gon en, Aftser ag amer @ arey o1df gam sy ATeREr A F o
AR A Fiet w2 § fop 331 aifdewa St fsen s anfes asf &t amer Srerar @ serT amr e 285

*t40
Title: Need to implement Salgaon Dam Project in Mount Abu, Rajasthan.

off 2ol var. weer (Sieilz): erovrare amafr areteRr, amuet apR At f&wm amer # werener W weafls e e I AT &Y U2 dierer A fRre FaST gan & st aifder
wift Bt 3, aal w2 cfveet @ snawwrer oft gar &) aga el A 3 snarr o1 Ya1 &) aaf W vw eEna a1 &) 331 31 3 AfS urelt A s w1 watterer S, da AFe g W TART
St e &, ofdl dl 331 ganat B fere iy o Izar ordf &) dior 2mer uge amde g 3 ureft & wft g aifrer B welt B @R agf B Iy aw G w03 agf 5t ehive
AT &, Iorepl Aol el ust [y et amde g 3 ureft &t waft &, 531 asre A amu Sl U2 deet 9 ordf T A, Iy S ST B 7 s AreEr A I A AieT Wl
atadr § den WoR A PBrger sft wear § fe Jmeena afk=isen @ g% fven smey mfds e ang st 2erRers o weafly & ofie amr-argy B yelt 3 5t gfiee ofer amd 2,
JoTepl I AT of 8 32 ST 3N BT TR SIT D)

aemafer AGIGR, agl U2 agd -3 P w0l gu &) aal Wil acd smee uga &, Afdper AN saoft snddl & b urell o1 glel O @R Jer@ ot a8l A Brcen usar §
sAfeme R fordger & afiz R A 7 wag sl w2 agen b 51 uf=iisen @ Sieg A sicg 9 WA S iz ArcEia uf¥elson goml smy)



*t41
Title: Damage caused by flood in Khiri Parliamentary Constituency, Uttar Pradesh.

oft arrr Brep 2oft (=) @ anoreiler swmuftr sgic, i =i ale w9 &, St 3 yger A 3, A gon orn &) AE @G A yenfda &g &) orurer @1 fiwrad! 8iq 261 ¥ R
orurel 1 #iawell, 831, Bolicll seanfe; Wl sifeeil &, o1 wrur 331 &, 3 w3t e s a1 & Ru aga A2 bl & a2 ot a8 o 3) aE 8l Pt gure 8 8 s asl
&6t anféles Rerfer Wt uz & foly et &) urer 3z stoon =&l &t Jc Bl 3 &0l @16 A Al aga AT AT YS9 AIDR B AWl IOR| clfdbol I YS9l JIDR of IA
U3 IS €26l oidl [ Siuret 3 el o1 el (W @ doll RN 3 BEs w1l 83 @A ¥, SiEl &0 A cllel Jisl AR b e Uenel &, avar ol 21 3 3, adl sy g
& citel @1e A ameifdsa & o ars fibe 31 anet aredt &) fise 31 Fal @1 o don Jiie wacl @1 gasrel 2N 3IAH AT-AMe el 312 el Sil 33 i), Bl = WA 8, a6 a6
& vl gel 8 S 3 ot FEHT apT-begl uz oft o1dl e s &) S ander Brer 3 et A &, s ol arac off v, o wdiedt 3, 39d @ Joret et ot
ol i uren &) s1oett SNt s &, 331 9t YIH ofdl 2l &) off =l el fich 3 cfes Jom gkey 3 cplt &) 331 T s 3ot dler ioft frell uz, St aewer & isft fret &,
301 uz 15018.65 e Fuw afern distt firer uz, sten distt fBrer we 23,449 aram Fuv i Twar ®st B w2 15,650 ara wue, oo e 54, 119 ara sue adt &
Rpaall &t arera wRE 8 gebt 8) WA @ 28 &) W Br 32 &) @e 3 wadl I e 8l 2@ ) el o Rl ordf 8 w 28 8 3w s1eol &t warer St bt & 33 e ol fra
ur 33 &) faparrer bt oia zmielt &) acal & Fgpar o bl ardl o 8 wr %@ &) ufvar & o sicer s ord 81 wr Far &) sreur-ulhvy ot wmwen ordf 2l wr 2@ & safer fpael a
dBG BTN 32 foraTen &) 3 AU IR A AP BT 6l AP DBIel AIEAT § [ 3 U2 eIl 3 3 321 U2 At 3 aaf oft 2y

HON. CHAIRPERSON : The House stands adjourned to meet tomorrow at eleven of the Clock.
19.10 hrs

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till Eleven of the Clock

on Thursday, July 10, 2014/Ashadha 19, 1936 (Saka) .

* The sign + marked above the name of a Member indicates that the Question was actually asked on the floor of the House by that Member.
* Not recorded.

* Not recorded.



