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MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: When
the Papers are being laid on the
Table, no other remark or no other
speech shall go on record.

11.18 hra,

COMMITTEE ON WELFARE OF
SCHEDULED CASTES AND SCHE-
DULED TRIBES

Fmsr, THIRD AND S§TUDY ToUR RerorTs

SHRI R R. BHOLE (Bombay
South-Central): 1 beg to present the
following Reporis (Hindi and English
versions) of the Committee on the
Welfare of BScheduled Casteg and
Scheduled Tribes:—

(1) First Report: Action Taken
by Government on the recommen-
dations contained in the Twenty-
First Report of the Committee on
the Welfare of Scheduled Castes and
Scheduyled Tribes (Sixth Lok Sabha)
on the Ministry of Railways (Rail-
way Bpard)—Reservations for, and
employment of, Scheduled Castes
and Scheduled Tribes in Northern
Railway and Award of Petty Con-
tracts to Scheduled Castes and
Scheduled Tribes in Northern Rail-
way.

(2) Third Report.Action Taken
by Government on the recommenda-
tions contained in the Thirty-eighth
Report of the Committee on the
Welfare of Scheduled Castes and
Scheéduleq Tribes (Sixth Lok Sabha)
on the Ministry of Petroleum,
Chemicals and Fertilizers (Depart-
ment of Petroloum)—Reservations
for, and employment of, Scheduled
Castes ang Scheduleq Tribes in
Indian Oil Corporation Limited
(Mu‘klins Dwision}

(3): Report of Study Tour of
Study Group I of the Committes on
its visit to Madras, Pondicherry,
Rameshwaram. Madurai, Tirunel-
veli, Kanyakumari and Trivandrum
during October, 1980.
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(4) Beport of Study Tour of
Study Group 1I of the Committee on
itg visit to Calcutta, Puri, Paradip,
Visakhapetnam and Hyderabad
during October, 1980.

(5) Report of Study Tour of Study
Group 1I1 of the Committee on its
visit to Bangalore, Mysore, Coorg,
Manipal Mangalore, Goa and Bom-
bay, during October, 1980.

(Interruptions)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Many
hon. Members sgtood up. After this
item on the agenda is over, I shall
allow one or two minutes to each of

the Member who wants it.

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL:
1 rise on a point of order,

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Under
what rule? The former Home Minis-
ter ig on his legs.

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL:
Under rule 60. When Mr. Dandavate
raiséd a point of order, you pointed
out certain priodities and how the
agenda will be followed.

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER:
ruled that out of order.

1 have

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL:
Mr. Sathe also pointeq out certain
rules. He said, adjournment motion
has certainly priority and you also
agreed that adjournment metion has
pﬂoﬁty over the laying of papers on
the Table of the House.

THE MINISTER OF INPFORMATION
AND BROADCASTING (SHRI
VASANT SATHE): Provided con-
sent was given by the Speaker.

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL:
You do not listen to others. We are
listening to you.

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Why
can’t you do that with a smile?

(Interruptions)
" TERMINISTER OF STATE IN THE
MINISTRY OF HOME AFPFATRS: AND

'DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMEN-
TARY AFFAIRS (g6 R VEN-
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EATASUBBAIAH): He shouly nol
Yook at the Press Gallery all the time.

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL.
Sir, you agree that adjournment
motion has priority. Now what Mr.
Sathe has argued in this House is that
because the Speaker has not given his
consent to certain motions given notice
of by hon. members of this House,
therefore, the question does not arise.
He was on rule 56. T am on rule 60.
I have got the Hindi version of the
rules. Rule 60 says:

q f@w 60 1 TTIF I @I E:
o ag W fFoafe wew

gav Ifeafas ame § T 7 9o

qJeqf & wANT T g AT I TAAT
qeafa 3 41 TR FH R OOA
Iq gEE B GIAT FT 93 FT GO
qFar WX gafagad w&@ W) [/ ar
el & adi v dfe fagoo
|7 AFAT AW IgH AT gV F)
g 7 & g 7 o frora
2qT |
What does Mr. Shakdher say in his
interpretation? 1 have not got the
book with me just now. Mr. Shakdher
says, whep, it is a border line case and
the Speaker thinks it is on the border
line, whether i¢ is admissible or not,
the hon. Speaker will listen to the
members first and then give his ruling.
I have given notice of an adjournment
motion on Assam situation and also
violence on the farmers’ agitation.
(Interruptions). Mr. Sathe, you are

not the Speaker. You cannot decide
it.

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: You
address the Chair,

SHR] DHANIK LAL MANDAL:
My submission to you is, this is a
border line issue. You will say that
the Assam situation is not the respon-
sibility of the Central Government.
Wehmwntedm:t&atthecnl’md
ofher cemtral forees have been gent
- $heds to 'will and abet... .’
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MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: On
your paint of order, let me give the
ruling. “Once a member is informed
of the Speaker’s decision with holding
his consent, no discussion or point
shall pe permitted to be raised in the
House eithe;' on the subject-matter of
ihe notice or the reasons for dis-
allowance thereof.”

SHRI DHANIK LAL MANDAL:
We have not been informed,

(Interruptions).

SHRI BAPUSAHEB PARULEKAR
(Ratnagiri): Omn a point of order,
Sir. It is very important. Tt is under
rule 353,

SHRI K. LAKKAPPA (Tumkur):
They are repeating the same thing.

SHR] BAPUSAHEB PARULEKAR:
Sir, I am not in the habit of repeating.
This is not concerning what the
Minister for Information anqd Broad-
casting said; T wil] come to it sub.
sequently. Unfortunately, we heard
a2 remark from the Chair which is
defamatory to all the hon. members
of the opposition. You have sald at
the commencement of the sitting that,
‘it you members of fthe opposition
behave in a civilsed manner, I will
hear one by one.” You see the record,
Sir. 1 will request you to expunge
that remark of yours. (Interruptions).

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I want
to correct you and put the record
straight. I said, “If we can conduct
the affairs of the House in a civilised
manner...... ", That is what 1 said.
The proceedings are there. If any-
thing defamatory has been said, I will
myself expunge it. Dont worry.
(Interruotions). If anything defama-
tory or derogatory against any mem-
ber has been said, 1 shall expunge it
myself.

SHRI BAPUSAHEB PARULEKAR:
You said, to the members, “You
speak’'in g civilised manner.” That is
not the way of addressing the mem-
bers
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MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I have
not said like that. (Interruptions).
“Civiliseq manner” is parliamentary.
1 have already given a ruling like that
in, the last session. What | said and
what I requested the members is fully
narliamentary and therefore, thers i
no question of anything being unpar-
liamentary in what 1 gaid.

If you are interested in giving im-
portance to the problemg ot the people,
because this is the last day of the
session T would request you to men-
tion your points one by one. 1 will
give two minutes to each. 1 will call
everyone, this side and that side.

SHRI SATYASADAN CHAKRA-
BORTY (Calcutta South): You said
that “civilised manner” is parliamen-
tary and you are entitled to say it.
Are we also entitled to say that the
Chair should also behave in a civilised
manner?

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: There is
no harm. T hag ruled that “civilised
manner” is parliamentary. It is ap-
plicable to the entire House, including
the Chair,

DR. SUBRAMANIAM SWAMY
(Bombay North East): I will say one
word in your defence. When you said
“civilised” I remember you lookeq en
that side. Therefore, we have no
objection,

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: 1 have
never saig “uncivilised behaviour” in
regard t0 any member, nor have I
said that any member behaved in an
uncivilised way. 1 have said “let us
conduct the affairs of this House in &
civilized manner”, This is parliamen-
tary. 1 also said that I should not be
misunderstood.

st wAem T (fm)
fegdt et argw, & afamied ok
A7 afaaicd ww & TR T Fgw
wgaT g fie wer & awmr ofeareed
-4 8fer ag 2T g ¢ f few
= w Iww few @ fer wn
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g 1 “mn” wm= W ofeaded
i v 5 “mar TR ¥
wF T ar’, @t deafemmed
ey 78 & mawr “fafraree” W=
TAA 9T | WIER A wgAr wifgg
ar & a1 s § ¥ ag weg ford
9T @, afs wa a9 W 39 fe
e W oguk @ ¥8 9) § fer
AEA K FRA B EF A AG E |
IHAT T a9 wer f@E o @R

§ oA a3 AEAFA AZAT §
fs w9 @7 &1 F§ wAAE FI
fregae & w1d, AR A ®6}
Tgard ¥ Sy OT 9@, ar v Igar
qET wEw w1 AT @ qrr =@ifew
ar 78 | K gToET SEENT, 9Ear g,
AW TR ¥ wF uwEHe qee
fear & o wgrag # e widY amar
o g F A s @ amt,
A W 8T F qH g, e e
Ta, dfeT wTOR §Ew F1IEH ghoer
gt & | FIEY g AT S eI JaT
arfgu | @& ® fregara @ ghaer
AT =ifgg | & gmux wwr e fqr
qIEAT 1 WO FT Owfeaw g ?
grE IH AT T A faw q@e ?

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Every-
thing will be done under the rules.

PROF. MADHU DANDAVATE: I
may draw your attention to the fact
that yesterday when we raised the
question of the arrest of Shri Y. B.
Chavan, at that time it was pointed out
that if certain irregularities are there,
they should also be a part of the state.
ment that should be read out by the
Chair. Only the arrest and the release
wag actually mentioned, but the judge-
ment of the Judicial Magistrate...a
(Interruptions),
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Again we find that in the Long
March of the Peasants another Mem-
ber of this House, Shri Ravindra Var-
ma, who is the Chief Whip of the
Janata Party, has been arrested along
with others only te foil the march.
At the same time, repressive policies
continued throughout the country. In
Assam, it is not the State Police but
the CRP that has beexa responsible for
killing men. At the same iime, the
former Chief Minister of Assam, Shri
Bolap Borgora, has been arrested «nd
lakhs of people are staging satya-
graha in protest. I have actually given
notice of an adjournment motion. You
may or may not grant me permission
to move the motion but, after all, it
is my duty as the representative of
the people to do it because what hap-
pens outside in anger and hunger of
the people must get reflected in this
House, Therefore, I have raised it,

SHRI K. LAKKAPPA (Tumkur); *

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: This will
not go on record. Because, it is against
another Member. It is an allegation. I
am sorry.

SHRI RATANSINH RAJDA (Bum-
bay South): My only submission is
that the proceedings of this House are
watched by the entire country. What-
ever we speak, or you speak from the
high pedestal, is of great significance.
The moment you say “let us c(onduct
the affairs in a civilizeq manner,
meansg you pre-suppose something and
there are certain implications. That
is why I would very humbly submit
that you ought not to have used those
words because all the members—I da
not say this side or that side—we are
all supposej to behave with dignity
and decorum ip this House; anj when
I say “we” 1 am including you also.
You are the custodian of our dignity
and decorum; so, I do not spare you.
It is a question of the dignity »nd de-
corum of the entire House. Therefore,
T would like to submit that the moment
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you say “let us behave in a civilized
manner” the impression that would go
out of this House is that many of our
members, or some of the members, of
this House ig that many of our rem-
bers, or some of the members, of this
House, may be on this side or that side,
are behaving in gn uncivilized man-
ner.

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I never
said that.

SHRI RATANSINH RAJDA: But
there was no necessity to utter those
words.

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: 1 also said
that this should not be misunderstood,
No misunderstanding.

SHRI RATANSINH RAJDA: What
I submit is that you should not pass
such remarks. Coming ag it does from
the Chair....

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: 1 have
given my ruling. “Civilized” is a
parliamentary word.

SHRI RATANSINH RAJDA: It is a
parilimentary word, but somtimes we
have to take precautions before using
such words, because there are impli-
cations. By implication you may im.
pute some motives, which should not
be done. So, these remarks should be
expunged.

SHRI C. T. DHANDAPAN] (Polla~
chi): I gave notice of an odjournment
motion on the atrocities committed on
harijans in Tamil Nadu. I gave notice
of the adjournment motion because on
many occasions my Calling Atiention
Notices have not been admitted. Three

**Not recorded.
3099 Ls—2
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[Shri C. T. Dhandapani]

harijans were burnt to death in Tamil
Nadu in Tanjore district by Marxist
Communist Party members. Fire was
set on the houses of harijans belong-
ing to a particular party by the CPM
members, The CPM members were
standing around the house so that the
ladieg and children coulq not escape
through the backdoor. They were burnt
to death... .

(Interruptions)

We have to face the realities.... (In-
terruptions)

Then, one IAS officer....(Interrup-
tions)

MR, DEPUTY-SPEAKER: No, this
will not go on record.

SHRI C. T. DHANDAPANI: **

MR, DEPUTY-SPEAKER: I am not
permitting. Nothing will go on re-
cord. **(Interruptions)

Wt T yATR Fag (fRdomaz) ¢
ureqsr wErey, & fraw 60 ® weww
TATT §T G JoMT AgaT ) W
fraw & &\t dawrs & o feer
¢ ot W g7 Aifog 1 (sqwEmw)
W W A AT a9 "R
@ TS, afaw g W
ToX AW ¥ feam v e
w® g g 23 ardw Wmd
qEgw w1 SAfET @, §IL XM ®
frar 32 @2 gC § | 0 ©w w0-
o yEE faar & we ww @
& v Al § o fw g wE
¢ fe um, o swi-fane yeare faar
S8 WW @I W T A

S~
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ar wdY ot § O orwrd & ¥ fag
. ... (=wawq)

MR. DEPUTY SPEAKER: It says:—

“Once a member js informed of
the Speaker's decision withholding
his consent, no discussion or point
shall be permitted to be raised in
the House either on the subject-
matter of the notice or the reasons
for disallowance thereof.”

(Interruptions) **

SHRI V. S. VIJAYARAGHAVAN
(Palghat):*

MR, DEPUTY-SPEAKER: This will
not go on record.

(Interruptions) **

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Piease sit
down. Hon. Members, you are all
aware that today is the last day of
this Session. Therefore, I would very
much request you, in whatever manner
you want me to request I am prepared
to request. Are not the problems of
thig country more important than these
things? I could allow one by one, but
it there is not going to be any order,
then I will go to the next item.

(Inferruptions)

MR. DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Now, 1

am going to the next item in the agen-

da. Calling Attention. Mr. Jalil Abba-
si.

MR, DEPUTY-SPEAKER: Nothing
else will go on record. I have gone to
Calling Attention. I am not permitt-
ing anybody now. Mr. Jalil Abbasi.
Nothing else will go on record.

(Interruptions) **

**Not recorded.



