141
MR. SPEAKER: The question is:

“That in pursuance of sub-sec-
tion (2) of section 8, read with
sub-section (3) of section 7 of the
Customs Tariff Act, 1975 (51 of
1975), this House approves the
following Notifications of the Gov-
ernment of India in the Department
of Revenue gnd Banking, namely—

(a) No. G.SR. 870(E), dated
the 6th November, 1976, inereas-
ing the export duty on coffee
from Rs, 300 per quintal to
Rs. 1300 per quintal,

(b) No. G.SR. 877(E), dated
the 13th November, 1976, in-
creasing the export duty on
groundnut kernel from Rs. 800 per
tonne to Rs. 1500 per tonne and
on groundnut in shell from Rs.
600 per tonne to Rs, 1125 per
tonne, and

(¢) No. G.S.R. 13(E), dated the
12th January, 1977, levying an
export duty on cardamom at the
rate of Rs. 50 per kilogram under
the new Heading No. 22 in the
Second Schedule to the said Act,

from the date of each of the notifica-
tiong aforesaid.”

The motion was adopted.

16.53 hrs.

MESSAGE FROM THE VICE-
PRESIDENT ACTING AS PRESI-
DENT

MR, SPEAKER: I have to inform
the House that I have received the
following message dated the 6th
April, 1977 {from the Vice-President
acting as President:

“I have received with great
satisfaction the expression of
thanks by the Members of the Lok
Sabha for the Address which I de-
livered to both Houses of Parlia-
ment assembled together on the
28th March, 1971.”

Message from the CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SAKK) Vice-President 142

acting as President
16.53} hrs.
GOVERNMENT OF UNION TERRI-
TORIES (AMENDMENT) BILL

g ®A (Y e fag)
qeqq Wgled, # WA QT §

“ & @9 ToaRd mrew wiafaw,
1963 FT WX MG FI7 qr9 fbas
o< fa=e feqr s

ST g TR & AN § HieregaT
Fogamgr sxfmmmr s aw &
g fyadr faem 4@ § sEEr
gafg sad f sy 6aw gRiT 1 Y TEA-
o s ffear o s & gy W A
=~ A9y IwFT e ag ot fr gfaaa
Heds it frgm i A qE@
WY 919 AT & TO0T 6 I HT &Y Q|
afe aaf fF ot awr feaea & o
T A1 HR T awr v F T M,
I9 FT ETATH I TEN QT A7 A IEA
wF wifeta & wfcg oiw &t a8 6
e gffa e #t fagr et
AT FLAT | FfF gw AT wafy
A\ TAIT /@ 6 AT A I
# faa®w § ) gw @ W "ATEa
& gRAT WK I fag wafger oF
fadas it 7 faaw yega #37 &7 fAR
Rarsega e w1 Ay
q a7 § afeT gan g Efhada
MM AT 6T 5qTE I8 § |
Tz wr  gfear 7 wifedw @ afeg
5 T &Y g 6 A 7 faay a1 W
gH FEFT 5 WA 7 WEA FT ABA |
i, T, T W e -—ag gfa
2 fedar wgamdt & | agw gaTw faae
a1 fE M TAa, Ty Fad 4 A A
qET TATE T | 23 WH A AET qHA
gIAT Y W1 23 FATE A% g FIA
#1 fasre a1 Afer qw w Aww g
g & agt ot 9 & oW # ani wrow
R g fremraaeaagefmai &
0T QAT FTA § wfsarE gwft | vafag



143 Govt. of Union

[stadr s=w fag)

g o frae & f& S foi ®
59T 7 WEIA $T @ & IAT q<g 4T,
TAA, T A WY 5T 4 LA & qQ
5 §T 7 WEA #Y qEA H7 & AT |
st 5 @57 o faw Aw }, S@® A9
59T 4 A A B wfwa F wrgar § 4
STE 7 96T Q| ¥9 WING FT & 9
¥ OeX Q19 AT @ E ! TATAE F
TCF & TS 5 qT7 7 HETT THAT AT |
TH 7Y 4g gAr fF war, e, em
ot faarm——ga 7 fede § qza
59T 7 HgIA griT | &gl 97 %l ®J
¥ AT WAL, TG H OAFOAT FIA
ST a%a | F gARar § 9 d9ga
HITT WIHAT §, FIE FLE0A AA AGH
g, ST TEEI WL FAT |

MR. SPEAKER: Motion moved:

“That the Bill further to amend
the Government of Union Terri-
tories Act, 1963, be taken into
consideration.”

DR. HENRY AUSTIN (Ernakulam):
The Home Minister has brought for-
ward g Bill which per se discrimi-
nates  between State and TUnion
Territory, Ag is well known the
Union Territories are clamouring and
trying to come on par with lhe rest
of the States in the country. Tt has
been the practice of the Government
of India consistently to bring the
Union Territories also to the level of
the rest of the States. It is a muiter
ol surprise that the Home Minister
i3 bringing in a Bill where it is said,
for Goa it is 4 months, for Mizoram
6 months, etc. It does not fit in with
the general ethos of the country and
the legislation on the subject. T am
not taking a partisan view. The ra-
tionale behind the proposal of in-
creasing the term of State Legisla-
tures and Lok Sabha to 6 years has
been discusseq at length and there
was a national dialogue. If you see
the debate of those days you will see
how the national dailies took a lively
interest on this issue which evinced

APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Amdt.) Bill 144

considerable interest. Legal pandits
and constitutional experts have
given out their views, Whereas
Rajya Sabha has six years, as their
normal tenure, why should Lok
Sabha which, according to our Cons-
titution, wield more power and
authority, should have 3a lesser
period? That was the lacuna, Angd our
framers of the Constitution at that
time had a different concept. But,
after 25 years of the working of our
Constitution, the public opinion felt
differently or, if you deny that pub-
lic opinion wag not total in proof of
the move, at least concede that a
sizeable section o® the public opinion
favoured this change and, in the Lok
Sabha itself, 1 do not think that
many members even in the opposi-
tion, objected to this on principle,

17 hrs.

So, this matier was discussed thread-
bare and I do not want to view the
problem as purely partisan, I would
request all the hon. Members to con-
sider this aspect objectively on
merits, Why should hon, Members on
this side of the House have to go
through the clectiong earlier? How
hard it is to face the clectorate run-
ning to ten lakhs of people every five
years? It is even degrading to have
the Lok Sabha’s tenure a little less.
(Interruptions). This was the acpect
which was felt at that time. If you
30 please, you may bring a bill. In
that context, if you read the pro-
ceedings at that time, the situation or
practice obtaining in different coun-
iries, in differeny Parliament, you
will find that in certain countries,
they have a seven year term and
certain others had even more tenure.
So. it was not that only India was
having this tenure. Many countries
have different tenures for the legis-
latures ag their lifespan, These were
the considerations which prevailed at
that time in making this suggestion.
Later on, it was brought forth in the
form of a Bill before the House. But,
it was unfortunate that the Fifth Lok
Sabha had to be dissolved and the
same Bill could not be introduced in
relation to the unjon territories. And,



145 Govt. of

today, instead of bringing in regu-
lar bills, to normalise the situation, it
ig surprising that the hon. Minister
with considerable experience in all
this, is bringing in this Bil] for the
Union Territories. Probably, it is due
to climatic reason. I am afraid there
may be a political overtone in the
sense that you are thinking of elec-
tions rather than to normalise the
situation. Probably, the prospecta of
-elections seem to be main guiding
factor in determining this thing This
is repugnant to the Constitution and
the people who had evinced some
interest in this matter, 1 do not think
that the people coming from Delhi
will approve of this. I had ex-
changed views with members coming
from Delhi. They were asking for
enhancement of the status of the
Union Territory 4of Delhi and to
make it a3 regular State. You are
trying to perpetuate this thing and
giving an inferior status to the Unlon
Territory., 1 do not think the people
of Delhi will take kindly lo that
suggestion. Therefore, I do oppose
this move and 1 do believe that it is
incumbent on the present Govern-
ment to bring in a bill later on. And
it may be revised—that is a different
matter, to a six year term for the
Union Territorieg also.

MR. SPEAKER: Government has
an amendmeni. But that has not
been circulated. I would request the
hon. Home Minister 1o read it out so
that the Members may know that the
amendment has been given notice of.
It has not been circulated.

CHAUDHURI CHARAN SINGH:
My amendment reads as ‘ollows:

Pages 1 and 2,

for lines 8 to 15 and lines 1 and
2 respectively,

Substitrite—

‘Provided further that the
provisions of this section shall,
in relation to the Legislative
Assemblies of the Union Terri-
tories of Goa, Daman and Diu
and Mizoram, in existence on

CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SAKA)

Union Territories 146
(Amdt.) Bill

the 7th day of February 1977,
apply as if for the words “five
years”, in the twg places where
they occur, the wordg “five
years and seven months” had
been substituted.’.”(3)

MR. SPEAKER: In view of this,
I do not think the hon. Member Shri
Amrut Kasar need move his amend-
ment. He can speak on that.

SHRI AMRUT KASAR (Panaji):
Mr. Speaker, Sir, first of all, I thank
you for giving me thig opportunity of
expressing my views before this
House. Since this is my maiden
speech, let me, in the first instance,
make it clear that [ support this Bill.
'The policy of the Janata Government
is to have a tenure of the Assemblies
and the Lok Sabha for five years
instead of six years. As I have pro-
mised to my voters, I shall be sup-
porting the Janata Government in
amending the Constitution anq the
Forty-second Amendment, I support
this policy of the Government to have
the tenure of five years both for Lok
Sabha as well as for Assemblies.

As regards my amendment, pre-
viously it was or five year and four
months but since the hon, Home Min-
ister has already cleared that in both
the cases it will be five years and
seven months, T do not think that I
need to stress that point.

Therefore I am withdrawing it
The Home Minister has promised
that in both the ecases, it will be
five years and seven months, Now, I
wanteq it to be actually seven months
because whenever legislation is passed
we must take into consideration the
geographical situation of that place.
Monsoons are fasl approaching. Many
of the hon, Members here know that
Goa is situated at the feet of
western ghats. The rainfall there is
more than 120 inches on an average.
This heavy rainfall cutg the communi-
cation with the villages, Although the
communication facilities are good in
Panjim—capital of Goa—yet in the
surrounding talukas like Parnem and



t

147 Govt. of Union

[Shri Anant Kasar]

Satari the communicationg are cut.
The voters are more in number in
these talukas and, therefore, it will
affect them, Therefore, I happily
accept this move of the Home Min-
ister that it will be seven months 8o
that immediately after the monsoons
we are ready to take up elections and
as in the manifesto of the Janata Party
the aims and purposes of the Bill
will be fulfilled.

Mr, Speaker, Sir, at the same time
I extend my cooperation to the
Janata Party in its policy for decen-
tralisation of power and 1 would
like to say due to the acceptance of
the principle of decentralisation of
power in the status of Union Terri-
tory will be lifted up and it will be
granted Statehood. I extend my full
cooperation to the party and all the
kindnesgs which our Home Minister
has shown to us.

SHRI EDUARDO FALEIRO
mugao): Mr. Speaker, Sir, it would
be in the interest of the Congress
party to have elcctions forthwith in
Goa Dbecause just now in Goa we
have a non-Congress government, It
will be in the intereset of my party
to have elections forthwith in Goa
but inspite of that we are oppusing
this Bill on the general principle end
not limiting ourselveg to petty con-
slderations. Though it will be in the
interest of our party to support this
Bill yet we have to oppose it as we
want to be faithful to the main
principles.

AN HON. MEMBER: What is the
“Principle’?

SHRI EDUARDO FALEIRO: The
principle involved is that Union Terri

tories must be put on the same foot-
ing as the States.

(Mor-

Sir, I would like to say this much.
I fail to appreciate why this exten-
sion of seven months? Why seven
months and why not eight months?
Why seven months anq why not four
months? If they want to repeal the
Ordinance, why not they repeal the

APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Amdt.) Bill

148
Ordinance forthwith? Why not say
that the Assembly stands dissolved

immediately? What is the point in
giving seven months? There is no
legal bar to dissolve the Assembly
immediately and hold the elections
after the monsoon or before the mon-
soon. In fact, if they are serious
about holding the elections, if they
want that popular government
should come, they canfhave elections
in the month of May itself because 40
days are remaining now, A notice of
40 days is enough.

The point I want to make js that
the Lok Sabha electiong have proved
that the present government in <he
Uniop, Territory does not have the
support of the people. Out of the 30
Assembly constituencies, 18 consti-
tuencies voted in favour of the
Congress Party and only 12 voted in
favour of the Maharashtravadi Go-
mantak Party, This being the posi-
tion, there is something more which
this government and the hon. Home
Minister can do. I would like to say
this because it is very important in
the interest of our country, in the
interest of the Union Territory and
in the interest of decent politica in
this country.

There are serious allegations of
corruption and gross misconduct or
misuse of power against the Chief
Minister, These charges are before
the Home Ministry. These charges
deserve to be enquired into. A com-
mission of enquiry shouldq be ap-
pointed against the Chief Minister
and then necessary action must be
taken,

It has been proved by judicial
authority how corrupt is the Govern-
ment of Tamil Nadu. The people in
the Union Territory of Goa have
compiled the charges against the
present Chief Minister in Goa and
they have made a tabular statement
showing the charges proved against
Mrs. Kakodkar and showing what
are the charges prima facie estab-



149 Govt. of

[Shri Vijay Singh]

rlisheq against the present Chief
Minister of Goa. Now, I may state
that in the interests of a clean gov-
vernment in that part of the country,
these charges must be enquired into?
A comhission of enquiry must be
appointeq forthwith, And then. as
Dr. Austin, my hon. colleague, has
said, it is high time we put the Union
Territories at par with the States
though it may be against the interest
of the Congress Party as it is in the
present case, Though it may be
against the interests of Congress
“Party, we should work on principles.
This is what T have got to say for the
consideration of the hon. House and
the hon. Home Minister.

SHRI AMRUT KASAR: He has
made serious charges. 1 want to reply
‘to them.

MR. SPEAKER: You had your
chance. Some other Members can
reply to them.

SHRI AMRUT KASAR: The Cong-
ress Party itself had granted one year
extension.

MR. SPEAKER: It is not as if on
Goa Assembly only one can reply, this
" is the Parliament of India.

SHRI KRISHNA CHANDRA HAL-
DER (Durgapur); We should get our
chance also,

MR. SPEAKER: I will ecall you
later. I will now call some new peo-
ple. I have not called even one from
this side. It is becoming impossible
for me. 1T will call you when your
turn comes.

**SHRI KRISHNA CHANDRA
HALDER: Mr. Speaker, Sir, the hon.
Home Minister has introduceq the
Government of Union Territories
(Amendment) Bill in this House. Ear-
lier the Minister for Law and Com-
pany Affairs Shri Shanti Bhushan had
introduced the 43rd (Constitution)

CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SAKA) Union Territories 150

(Amdt.) Bill

Amendment Bill The substance of
the Bill is that elections to the Lok
Sabha, Vidhan Sabha and Union Ter-
ritories should be held after every
5 years instead of 6 years. We sup-
port thig spirit and extend our support
to the present amending Bill that is
now before the House for discussion.
While introducing this Bill the Hon.
Home Minister had made it clear that
he seeks to extend the life of the
Governments of the Union Territories
upte 5 years and 7 months because of
the impending monsoon and thjg is
quite understandable. While oppos-
ing this Bill, Mr, Henry Austin, who
has since changed his place from the
ruling side to that of opposition, said
that there was a national consensus
on the 42nd Amendment of the Cons-
titution as a result of which the life
of Parliament, Assemblies, and gov-
ernments in Union Territories were
extended upto 6 years. For his infor-
mation I may say that when this 42nd
Amendment of the Constitution was
introduced in the House, we on behalf
of the then opposition had stoutly
opposed the legislation and the peo-
ple at large had also opposed it. The
government of that time had solicited
the support to their Bill through some
conferences which were mainly attend-
ed by their own puppets. Then the
General Elections were held and this
42nd Amendment of the Constitution
was made an election issue both by the
Janata Party as also by us and other
allieg of the present Government.
What did we see in the elections? The
people rejected the very principle of
the 42nd Amendment Bill, by defeat-
ing the Prime Minister, Mr. Swaran
Singh who headed the Constitution
Amendment Committee and finally re-
jected the Congress Party and we see
that they are in the opposition today.
This amply proves that the theory of
national consensus had no support of
the masseg then nor today. Why we
support the legislation? We feel that
in order to respect democratic princi-
ples and to fulfil peoples aspirations,
it is necessary that elections should
be held after every 5 years because

**The original gpeech was delivered

in Bengali.



151 Govt. of Union

[Shri Krishna Chandra Haider]

we feel that this period is sufficient
enough to implement democratic eco-
nomie principlea If it is not done
their will be a natura] tilt towards
euthoritarianism ag we had witnessed
in the recent past. I hardly need to
mention; Sir, that the 42nd Amend-

ment of the constitution was passed in’

this House by the Congress Govern-
ment by clamping down emergency in
the country and puting leaders and
workers of the opposition parties be-
hind the bar and ignoring public opi-
nion. But as soon as they went to the
people for their opinion, they rejected
the legislation completely. Through
this election they gave a clear verdict
that they are opposed to dictatorship
and bureaucracy. They have also as-
serted their faith in individua] liberty,
right of assembly, right of trade union
activities, right of freedom of speech
and above all that the democratic
norms be maintained in the country.
They did not want to face the people.

DR, HENRY AUSTIN: On a point
of order. How can the hon. Member
maintain his position? Our govern-
ment decided to holg the elections
long before the expiry of the one year
extended term. How can he say that
we were afraid of facing the people?
We could have waited for another
year,

MR. SPEAKER: You are only mak-
ing a second speech. There is no
point of grder.

SHRI KRISHNA CHANDRA HAL-
DER: 1 think they even did not like
to hold the elections but because of
external pressure and other factors
which I dont want to go in detail
here, they were forced to hold the
elections,

The Congress party wanted to stick
to power and convert this great coun-
try into a big jail. If they had agreed
to ho'd the elections it was after they
got intelligence report from their
police, the RAW and as is said, they
even had gone to the astrologers to
know about their fate in elections but
all their calculations went wrong and

APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Amdt.) Bill

162

the masses who live in villages and
who are taken as illiterates, have pro-
ed to the world beyond all doubt, that
they are second to none in their poli-
tical maturity and their faith to up-
hold democracy in the country is
absolute and unshakable., It was be-
cause of the people’s faith in demo-
cracy that the Janata Government is
in power today.

They are trying to restore demo-
cracy in their country and as such
support the Bill.

oft wf€ sTge (awwig) @ weaw
ARG, T AT qg welr & A fadgw
@ 83 ¥ grewifew fear §, & saer
awda w0 & fog @er gw g | M,
T, fr Wk froiwr & weqaEv,
TTFAL qF A FUA ¥ Fe0 ¥ A
fadaw @z & Sufewa fear m@w
agr AT FOAT WfwAE & R Ay
WEA 4, A @ T ¢

AAAT § oG qE F gAY foRAr @
gl AW & wfaur & waE o IR
fraffa wafa €Y, ag aara gt mf o)
wqr e feafa ® aowrelt g
¥ grar o sfewrs & wenge fEar agr,
IF qHT I TLHT &1 Gfaar & gmas
FA FTHIE ATUFTAZ 9T 1 a8 G
w5 ara Y waft 1976 % WA R
& auTa FT AT AV | 1971 | Y 777
gun aT, ag 5 ¥ ¥ faw gmran, A fF
6 e ¥ fow 1 st &7 51 FaQdY g
¢, ST WX ¥ AR FaT vTaT g
gaa Y wig=Tfes &9 & smaT s far
tigw s wfas wow g 8%
I wfaFe 3 w=wta gua @fqee &
o frarar ) & wzavE fe s =
¥ wafy @or g I ¥ T qFWET v
T ITHT e Awfgwre g 91 |

3PN T waer wrger dwrgw fnar,
afes dfare w7 qrer eer a7w far )



153 Govt. of

sfardt 2 7wy ofcadw w3 fa,
fmy AT aRar 7 1971 ¥ ST AGT
FAM IR I AT A 5 9 F fog
. FAT 41, 6 A & foaq AFT AT 91 )

_ qﬁﬁ@wﬁmaw
ﬁ;mq'léfmm%hqazaﬁha
g B 7. Trar, g9, = Ak A ar
2 gfama 2fEdw 2, ag s usat
¥ gEY AT AE, ITH T 94T SATI9h
21 1T 1 I THIGAT FT ITIW 3T &7
AMIFTT AT FTAW qIEF F7 TG @ ™I
21 BATL R T oF Fgraw g % 100
T2 Q@1 F faer g= # 97 1 fowiy
qF SOITF Tox 7 fAArg, I9 TwR=Tar
F¢ 293 17 FT FAT qiaw & 7

1967 % AH—TWT AT T A
frsra gwmal & 949 5,5 @ ¥ @
ATT-ATY ZIA A1 AfEA 1971 ¥ fad
ATE FWT FT IATT FIGT 147 | T8 F1T
4 7T 417 AT F ATz FAAT AT, IS
ara ¥ for? swiiw ardl & R AE
frar 1 wTat &t fram—awm &
FAT AT 1972 F ATA AW FWIAR
¥ 0F 97 T gY 7L |

oY oY P 7w JWr w7 AT @)
AT, §T TR et & e
AT 3T 1 WA T THEAT F g §
TT 3% 1971 ¥ 73Y, afew 1972 ¥ iy
STE F TATT AT HTY FOA AMGT A |
QUL T AT | UHETAT & THYF &, AT
3+ ACF T F ZA F FATAN F qT4 ATG
faurs et & AT Y FO MR
Ol

gt @7 fafy 9ot & & g0 B
wafy &Y 2T FT q7F AT FIF F T=0g
¥ u¥ fagas ¥w Frar, &Y 707 et &
T ¥ I &1 faOw fFar 1 & awwar
184 LS—6.

CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SAKA) Union Territories 154

(Amdt.) Bill

g fF 3 qF w71 & wds G, afew
Y TAATTH €319 & guus § | fa<ndr
T F T T A E g fagaw ¥ S
F1% TerfaF WA fadt g€ &, ag -
A a1 WX 1971 ¥ FAw
FE AT F AT FIAT 7 FOG qUE
& AR FT Tofas F_AITdT TG gAar
A, T TF IR I qF G971 F T
FAN F ToAfas agraar @ & fag
FUA 9T ¥ G F 99 ATE T
oY, a1 o 7 fadae g welr 7 3w fFar
2, SE® | qWATaF JEAET @ 9K IF
F ATE G AT ATRY |

¥ ggar agar g f faindy e &
T=aat &1 quAr  frow gvw & &A1
F1feq #X TH G FT /AT Tg WAL
zG aw far T fad as ofed 7 37
arfew | = T FOA A wafy @fau
F zru fuife &1 9fy §; F9 oF
et & Fzg4 ¥ ag watw faaifa &
g &1 fom g dfqwr T g
fra g, 3% Gy fatndy s gw AT A
TEI AT 1 A IS NG AT F a7 O |
dC-FTAT wraTEET feafa a9 F7 &
faTredT a1 & G FT JA ¥ I7 F2
fear mar a1 1 Fiwd oET #T G0 &
Fg1 74T % 37 wfaurT g F 997 9
TF LT J2-faarg gor 91 | ag Toa
2 AW FUw qEl s Wea
Frafrer adf & faar 1@ 2w 7 fFar
WY 5T & FT T BT S v A
T A 4y | el FY qreg 3
F AT AL FEFAT AA T AT G |
AT F §F T 17 77 fEmy mar av
TR AT AGl ®1 AT THAT 4Y | I faAT
F e g1 T 3 9T O & Few fre
7 a7 »fY FerETa ¥ quveE &1 Afwa
¥ azre ¢ afgare F g e
a7, FfF g A aE § AT 7@
&rwf R AIw T feafa dr



155 Govt. of Union

[T ®{r %3]

a1 T § o e avdT & A
TTATT FY FOATET & TF qE T SFETT
OF 9T #Y WS #} oF v F Fav
Faum | g & S AvAS Saer
FT ST TG F §, FAF ST Y eAwAd
FImFMaEAI QL1 @ T F
T WY AT faare gar §, Ftaw aiEt
F HETY, qF ATAT STAAT Fgerar & i

TR ZEL 391 & &fag™ 7@ 41 A
AT FY HA §, I T A AW g
Mr 7 2w F 91 FOw ML {7 JT-AA
THIOT TYX UG &) 9T 4 @A d
faT " T@ I FY oar # TG A
fa=mi %1 931 a e F o qiw &
®T HATY T F3T FL S T < faaT |

A WRT F A 7 g4 wiw & ang
Fag 9rEf F 3 w7 fa=wdd &7 fadw
FLAT g HIT ¥1gan g fF g Aalt w71 5w<ary
TgUT §, W W FF Al q9-
aeafa &, afwa &

PROF. SHIBBAN LAI, SAKSENA
(Maharajganj): Congress party has
said nobody opposed the six year
term when the Forty-fourth Constitu-
tion (Amendment) Bill was passed.
This is utterly false, I was the solitary
opponent in the House who cpposed
every one of the 59 clauses of the
Forty-fourth Amendment Bil] jnclud-
ing the six year term. In fact I gave
an amendment that the term should
be four years instead of six years.
The term of American Congress is
also fcr four years., Members of the
Rajya Sabha also retire every two
years. So, it is wrong that I wanted
six years and not four years.

17.32 hrs.
[Panpir D. N. T1wARy in the Chair]

st arq 7w fewt (Aml) @ @
ofs wgrzw, 77 mfedm fam @ om

APRIL 7, 1977 Territories (Amdt.) Bill 156

FEE A I I9F FIw F v
W QA FEA FEA & W A &
iy ¥ ¥ Fo faare w@AT TEATE |
a8 I 6 @ F7 NforT "er T
FE I G QI AT G, FE G qTA
T WEA W W @ 9g 9 T
A1 AN FETAEA L T qH
§® faie anfd= & 18 W 7 far
W fFT w dareETaEa g1 7
3 39 guena Qv o zafag
T& g #1IT A 9@H 6 "I FT hAAT
THT A3 3T AAF F v § A g AR
I 1A AT G FTES AAE T 1 & F
Tga WA F g HAT ¥ fAaTT wo
AT g 5w ag o 7191 ¥ 6 A 7T
F AT TG gAHTT F AGH F1 TS A Ak
oF  qetas gfse & ag T8 far
WD GF agr o faF g 3z
Fgm Faar @ g1 w9 Iq Ak
Ffaw 1 FAT AW ¥ fawrg AR aTE=H
F1 TAT FAT A IH aa7 F7 99 &
T TeT ¢ W W FY AqaT T I
QETHT & gEr g ... (|Igm)
THSET wEd dY ) AT AR 9T gaeE)
# A@ FIT AT A4 IH I JATET
FZAT 93T | Rl & fAq 4 wg
feqr fr ORI ®1 F IR0 FRAATF )
A mE A T FE @EIFR AT F
gfag 1 zH 29 T FTH AT 2 AEA
AT & W faFra Qe g £
FAMF AT TN F o FrooFfy
qrr T | W 979 919 F7 gy wafy
geT A A1 A OF AT A W AT A
Iy H oA S a9 HeX W FEr
e g A fAper ST} 1 OF A
Y aTaT |1 QAT AT | OF g a7
1T & CHE F TS AT . . .1 (@qAgm)

N ®Q I A AT A=A
g & 1 T g § AT T4 &



157 Govt. of

oft vy o firwt ;T BT T+
T auRTEmH AR

=t w7@ s DX T Aol
ﬁwa‘fn’n qurmaﬂﬂmiefaq
nﬂthm‘&maﬁﬂm*ﬁm

oft g ow fwt . soEr W R
TZ | AT A A Ew 2w F oo}
T A ¥ wiwE A5 § 1 WY 2T
"7 79 T ) (saawm)

8 g st oY ¥ o T T

g f& ar g Y omE a9 § W)
qi §T FT 97 TIATH g9 G HIA AT
TR TED AR F W AT oA
FAM | TH WIT FT 6 qTA FT T/ FIA
#T 4g wood 91 fF a9 a1 #7 gy
F forw ozt oF gt Ferasr 1 g A
T H, TISATH] 1 HEad €7 33 § H1T
T FA A fra am g1 @@ ¥
I ST & | JAAT 9% JY J19 q1e A
FIH ZWAT 2 9 FT qI AT GHE 7T
& e wfady At 97 ax 13w Wik faa
ST § | WAL TF T 59 dE ¥ g4
FISTT &l U I I #1729 7717 &
fow faa @rg &1 qiF @t F1 FIwaT
6 AT ¥ WET a@ TA & qFdT &
(smemr)

# aga T ¥ @g fadeT war
IRAT g & we o Amw Ay e wie
aar faer & fags fao ooy ow
g1 &1 Qifas wim st s A
aAE@ 10 F 12807 KA GAFLEF
§Y TH AW FY AT FT HIT qE7 ITFII
4T | T 99E ¥ "9 OF A9 HUAr
uf 7w ey ASET RIS Y q
Tl SR wfedr g § 399 qU &%
w6 | gwfag & Igm fs s oo
ffaF s Taa® | 5% L 6
qrar A S E M E 1 W AW

CHAITRA 17, 1899 (SAKA) Union Territories 148

(Amdt.) Bill

W R aaams@ a S o
s¥ fir wmos Trorftfers gfeaor sreamat
& 7 wvaar e o @R T At
O Ay gy (wqwanr) ¥ s
O s ot & g i & @ T AT
ok ¥ freme st 7 o @ oy
o & fow § fre 4 siewd@ei & A€
A TEAIET Y | T & AY
frAm O ET AT aET g | 9 WY
QT T TS F1T JT TAFAA A T |
vafad & aga Forar ¥ avg vy A
e fF wg 6 @ w T & @A
a1 TR T § wf wF T
9 ATAT & | FR HTOH S T A0
¥ oMo aEma § A IR ANA R
T WY HOAT WA G AT AE g,
oy ffe & @€ Aawe o @5y €
wafoe ¥ amraq gredar 2 fF o g a2
ngut § A Afqs 7 T @H T-
Afos T AT FATRG 1 AT 6 T
TIFT TH TR BT G FIATAAT 1 8
AT GIEF AT FHTO-ZAT FT &1 W90
HAT T | WY WHA  SEAT #
f& g z@ gv wgwd F A @A
7|

ng W N (Wwd wwfag ) - Fw-
ofy, mevEa, wET & WX A frg W A
T & 99 T AT IR TO 7@ A AR
T2 a0 g & qradig qeeai A
A & uF o a9 gar A8) faar agr faw
¥ o913 3T 1 FE IR AR G
FT4 %13 &9 594 faar § Ay oy 71

UF 97 % gg & g & fa
qiF G H QAT T QU FIA § A
oF @ & fan 3@ o a7 faar
a3 | & A% qumar g e w8 W 5w
T F1 a% faay 7 § % 5 90 & IqU
& 6 Are HT feq o1ig | HaFy A7 Gy



159 Govt. of  APRIL 7, 1977

[@tadr =< fag]
MIAT Y, I 1969 ¥ 1974 TF @Y,
IEF qTE HTYA FAAT AAAT FTaqTA
¥ 29 I FT A W A AT
1976 & 11 g€ | HATATG FY &A1 7/
avg &Y ¢ a9 a1 98 7 emr Arfza
T Fo e @ fF s g 5 g
Y @Y 9= G § wASA g A
Sard g w3 | W9 ag ARy &
&F 5 ay @19 I9E w3 6 3w F
F1E ] a4 Qi 48 F7 ArAT FAX A

‘ fr UF LED A Z, frer
£1 s dla 79 F1 8 AT33AT TET GEHAT
g1

UF g AT a9 fF g 91
7 WA FY 2 WY 2 qA ALY A1IH £ Ry
ﬂﬁﬁ?ﬁﬁtﬁ?ﬁﬁal T 7 /A
T@AT FE ARFH 7 A fpy g Avr a7
Qmaramaﬂ——:m?fm*» 2?7
¥agrauaarg fweq 7 it 7 oty &
A F JEEFE ) FY FAITRAAITY
B &1 41, 7v Tg gEA &1 §Eq
FAFIT T2\

awifa wgiad : SFArT TR g7
“for w75 g wEA wfatTaw

1963 &1 FIT AT FIA ATA

favas 9z famre fqar smg ("

The motion was adopted.
awafa wgra - w= & F9m9 2 9
@ AT AT F {UGA FT AGT § ——
Clause 2— (Amendment of section 5).
Amendment made:
Pages 1 and 2,—

for lines 8 to 15 ang lines 1 and 2
respectively, substitute—

Union Territories (Amdt.) Bill 160

‘Provided further that the provi-
sions of this section shall, in relation
to the Legislative Assemblies of the
Union territories of Goa, Daman
and Diu and Mizoram, in existence
on the Tth day of February, 1977,
apply as if for the words “five
years”, in the two places where
they occur, the words “five years
and seven months” had been substi-
tuted.” (3).

(Chaudhuri Charan Singh)
awvafa wdiEa : 9w I8 & fr aere
2 goifud &9 ¥ faugs F1 5w aq |
The motion was adopted.

Clause 2, as amended, was added to
the Bill,

gwafa vy w7 Az # 5 sema

3 fgae, Frogw oaT
The motion was adopted.

Clause 3 was added to the Bill.

awrafa w@tem : yow 1z § fv
gAfez  qar A z1eed 39 fagaw
F oAw 3T |
The motion was adopted.

Clause 1, the Enacting Formula and
the Title was added to the Bill,

[eD 77w Tag - § swqTE FAag

“fr za fadas &1 gmfug &n
T qig fFar sg 1’

gwafa w¥Ew ;99 38 € ¢

“fg zg faggs &1 dorfaa w9
¥ qrg frar sme

The motion was adopted.



