
 3197  Gold  Control
 Bill

 जो  फिल्मी  बर्क  2  वह  तमाम  संसार  में  प्रसिद्ध
 है।  वह  बहुत  बढ़िया  कला  का  नमूना  है  और
 उसको  बनाने  वाले  वह  साधारण  सुनार  लोग
 हैं।  लेकिन  इस  बिल  के  कारण  उन  लोगों
 का  धंधा  चौपट  हो  जायगा  ।  सारे  देश  में
 जो  इस  तरह  के  स्वर्णकार  हैं  उन  की  सारी
 वह  उत्कृष्ट  कला  व  कारीगरी  खत्म  हो  जायगी।
 हम  को  लगता  है  कि  वित्त  मंत्री  जी  को  कला
 के  प्रति  कोई  रुचि  नहीं  है,  कोई  अनुराग
 नहीं  है  1  हम  देखते  हैं  कि  उन  के  द्वारा  एक
 तरफ़  तो  सम्पत्ति  को  बढ़ाते  जाने  की  जो
 अवृत्ति  छाई  है  उस  को  वह  खत्म  करने  के
 लिए  कुछ  नहीं  कर  रहे  हैं  दर्सी  तरफ  वह
 इन  सुनार  बेचारों  को  अपना  शिकार  बना  रहे
 है।  जो  वास्तव  में  इस  धंधे  के  कारीगर हैं
 कौर  अच्छे  कलाकार  हैं  उनकी  कला  को  वह
 खत्म  कर  रहे  हैं।  इन्हीं  सब  कारणों  से  मै  बिल
 का  जोरदार  शब्दों  में  विरोध  करना  चाहता
 हं  -  इसके  द्वारा  लाखों  को  तादाद  में  सुनार
 लोग  बेकार  हो  जायेंगे  उन  का  सारा  काम
 धंधा  खत्म  हो  जायगा  ।  अभी  भी  समय  है  कि
 वित्त  मंत्री  महोदय  ठंडे  दिल  से  इन  सारी  बातों
 के  ऊपर  सोचें  और  अपने  इस  बिल  को  वापिस
 ले  लें  -  इतना  ही  कह  कर  मैं  बिल  का  विरोध
 करता  हूं।

 SHRIMATI  SHARDA  MUKERJEE
 (Ratnagiri)  :  Many  members  who  have
 spoken  before  me  have  expressed  their
 concern  over  fhe  unemployment  0
 the  goldsmiths.  I  join  them.  I  would
 also  like  to  point  out  that  while  all
 sides  of  the  House  will,  I  think,  agree
 that  the  country  is  facing  a  very
 severe  economic  crisis  and  that  every
 effort  must  be  expended  to  see  that
 there  is  no  further  drain  of  foreign
 exchange,  we  also  equally  feel  anxiety
 about  the  implementation  of  the
 legislation  before  us,

 I  would  like  to  quote  from  the  same
 report  that  Shri  Dandeker  quoted
 from  the  report  of  the  Informal  Group
 on  Gold  Control,  given  83  far  as  I
 know,  in  1963.

 SRAVANA  29,  1890  (SAKA)  Modifications  to  3198
 Income  Tax  Rules  (Ms.)

 SHRI  N.  DANDEKER:  The  1963
 report  is  different  from  the  1966
 report.

 SHRIMATI  SHARDA  MUKERJEE : This  has  got  no  date  on  it.  I  think
 it  is  the  1963  report.

 MR.  DEPUTY-SPEAKER :  She  may
 resume  her  speech  tomorrow.  We
 shall  now  take  up  the  Motion  sche-
 duled  for  discussion  at  5.30  p.m.

 17.28  hrs.
 MOTION  RE:  MODIFICATIONS  TO
 INCOME-TAX  (SECOND  AMEND-

 MENT)  RULES,  1968

 MR.  DEPUTY-SPEAKER:  We  have
 half  an  hour  for  this.  Time  will  have
 to  be  distributed,  Ten  mimutes  for
 the  mover;  ten  minutes  will  be  taken
 for  reply.

 SHRI  S.  S.  KOTHARI  (Mandsaur)  :
 I  beg  to  move:

 “This  House  resolves  that  in
 pursuance  of  section  296  of  the
 Income-Tax  Act,  1961,  the  following
 modifications  be  made  in  the  Income-
 Tax  (Second  Amendment)  Rules,
 1968,  published  in  the  Gazette  of
 India  by  Notification  No.  5.9  1112,
 dated  the  18th  March,  1968  and  laid
 on  the  Table  on  the  Ist  April,  1968,
 namely  :—

 (1)  in  rule  2,  in  the  proposed  rule
 11A,  for  ‘33-1/3  per  cent.’  substitute
 ‘50  per  cent’;

 (2)  in  rule  2,  in  the  proposed  rule
 11A,  for  ‘Rs.  20,000’  substitute  ‘Rs.
 25,000’;

 (3)  in  rule  5,  in  the  proposed rule
 19A,  after  sub-rule  (5),  the  follow-
 ing  be  added  namely:—

 (6)  The  resultant  sum  of  capital
 employed  as  on  the  first  day  of  the
 computation  period,  determined
 under  this  rule,  shall  be  increased
 by—

 (i)  The  average  cost  of  the  fixed
 assets  (including  ships)  acquired
 during  the  computation  period;  and



 3199  Modifications  io  |  AUGUST  20,

 {Shri  5.  5.  Kothari]
 (ii)  one-half  of  the  net  profits

 after  taxes  for  the  computation
 period :

 Provided  that  if  losses  have  been
 imcurred  during  such  period,  one-
 half  of  such  losses  shall  be  deducted
 from  the  aforesaid  resultant  sum  of
 capital  employed.

 (7)  In  this  rule,  ‘average  cost’  in
 relation  to  any  asset  means  such
 proportion  of  the  actual  cost  thereof
 as  the  number  of  days  of  the  com-
 putation  period  during  which  such
 asset  is  used  in  the  business  bears
 to  the  total  number  of  the  days
 comprised  in  the  said  period.
 This  House  recommends  to  Rajya

 Sabha  that  Rajya  Sabha  do  concur  in
 this  resolution.”

 I  would  like  first  to  deal  with  the
 second  part  of  the  Motion  which  is  of
 greater  importance  Sec.  80J  of  the
 Income-tax  Act  provides  that  the  pro-
 fit  of  a  new  industrial  undertaking
 upto  6  per  cent  per  annum  on__  the
 capital  employed  shall  not  be  taxable
 for  a  period  of  five  years.  The  object
 of  this  section  is  to  stimulate  capital
 formation  in  the  economy  and  8150
 formation  of  new  undertakings,  hotels,
 acquisition  of  ships  etc.  The  base  for
 the  calculation  of  the  6  per  cent  is
 the  capital  employed  during  the  rele-
 vant  previous  year.  The  previous
 year,  in  simple  terms,  is  just  the
 accounting  year.  What  the  Act  con-
 templates  what  this  section  contem-
 plates,  is  that  the  capital  employed
 during  the  accounting  year  shall  be
 the  base  for  calculation  of  the  6  per
 cent.  But  the  rules  as  framed  provide
 that  only  the  capital  employed  at  the
 beginning  of  the  year  shall  be  taken
 into  account.  It  follows  that  if  any
 assets  had  been  added  during  the
 year,  if  ships  had  been  purchased  in
 the  relevant  year  or  any  additions  had
 been  made  to  the  hotels  during  the
 year,  they  shall  not  form  part  of  the
 capital  employed.  It  means  that  the
 base  would  be  eroded  and  if  the  base
 is  eroded,  the  amount  of  tax-free
 profits  to  which  the  industry  is  legiti-
 mately  entitled  according  to  law

 1968  Income  Tax  Rules  (ads.)  3200

 passed  by  Parliament  would  9८
 reduced.  That  means  that  the  indus-
 try  would  be  getting  a  lesser  amount
 than  what  was  actually  intended  by
 law.  In  the  rules  as  they  existed
 prior  to  this  amendment,  the  provision
 was  that  the  capital  employed  during
 the  year  shall  be  computed  by  includ-
 ing  the  value  of  the  assets  which  had
 been  added  during  the  year  also.

 Besides,  may  I  submit  that  as  an
 industry  functions,  profits  accrue  and
 if  profits  accrue,  the  funds  are  en-
 hanced  and  the  capital  employed  also
 increases  by  that  amount  what  is  done
 usually?  Profits  are  continuing  to
 accrue  throughout  the  year.  In  order
 to  find  the  amount  of  profit  to  be
 added  to  the  capital  base  or  the  capital
 employed,  half  the  net  profits  which
 accrue  during  the  year  are  to  be
 included.  If  if  is  loss,  the  capital
 employed  goes  down  legitimately.  We
 have  no  objection  to  that.  But  it  is
 necessary  in  all  fairness  and  equity
 that  half  the  amount  of  profit  which
 accrues  should  be  included.  Here
 again,  I  submit  that  in  the  rules  as
 they  were  existing  this  was  provided.
 It  is  difficult  to  understand  why  when
 the  rules  had  been  amended  these  two
 provisions  should  have  been  elimi-
 nated.  I  should  deprecate  particularly
 the  tendency  of  the  Central  Board  to
 take  advantage  of  periodical  amend-
 ments  of  law  or  rules  to  tilt  the
 balance  against  the  assessee  and  for
 small  advantages  to  the  State  frame
 the  rules  in  such  a  manner  that  the
 letter  and  spirit  of  the  law  are  not
 observed.  In  this  particular  case,
 even  the  letter  of  the  law  is  not
 observed,  leave  alone  the  spirit,  That
 is  why  I  had  to  bring  in  this  motion.
 Besides,  if  the  Central  Board  itself
 does  not  set  high  examples,  how  does
 it  expect  that  the  officers  in  the  middle
 and  the  lower  ranks  would  do  justice
 to  the  people?  Therefore  I  earnestly
 appeal  to  the  Boarq  and  the  Minister
 concerned  to  ensure  that  the  Board
 acts  in  a  manner  which  is  fair  and
 impartial,  which  helps  people  and
 gives  them  a  fair  deal,  particularly
 when  amendments  to  the  rules  or  the
 law  are  effected.  The  earlier  part  of



 320  Modifications  to

 my  motion  concerns  authors,  play-
 wrights,  artists,  musicians  and  actors.
 I  submit  that  it.  would  be  a  sad  day for  democracy  if  intellectuals  and
 artists  are  not  dealt  with  by  society
 liberally  and  fairly.  Modern  tax
 laws  weigh,  heavily  upon  them.  With
 the  heavy  progression  in  taxation,  the
 greater  part  of  their  income  in  the
 higher  brackets  is  absorbed  by  the
 State.  These  persons  have  a  fluctuat-
 ing  income.  In  certain  years  consi-
 derable  income  accrues  to  them.  In
 other  years,  they  may  not  have  that
 much  of  income.  Particularly  in  the
 case  of  actors,  they  have  an  active
 working  life  which  extends  to  five  or
 ten  years  and  after  that  their  income
 is  reduced  to  atrickle.  If  taxation
 absorbs  or  mops  up  the  greater  part
 of  their  income  during  their  active
 working  life,  the  consequence  would
 be  that  they  would  probably  have  to
 starve  during  their  old-age.  There-
 fore,  it  is  necessary  that  they  should
 be  liberally  dealt  with.  If  the  amend-
 ments  that  I  have  suggested  are
 accepted,  it  would  mean  that  they
 would  be  entitled  to  higher  exemption
 limits  in  respect  of  the  qualifyine
 amount  which  accrues  on  account  of
 the  life  insurance  premium  paid  by
 them.  If  they  insure  more  and  they
 pay  higher  amounts,  it  means  _  that
 their  tax  will  be  reduced  and  the
 savings  would  be  greater  and,  may  I
 submit,  that  tax  evasion  would  also
 go  down?  That  is  a  very  important
 point.

 I  have  always  on  a  number  of
 occasions  on  the  floor  of  the  House
 unequivocally  condemned  evasion  of
 tax.  It  should  be  strictly  dealt  with.
 There  can  be  no  two  opinions  on  this
 score.  But  it  is  necessary  that  the  tax
 laws  should  be  fair,  just  and  equitable.
 They  should  be  such  that  society  feels
 happy  and  can  stand  up  and  say,
 “Here  is  a  just  and  fair  and  equitable
 tax  structure  and  let  us  obey  all  the
 laws.”  But  basically,  if  the  laws  are
 not  just  or  if  they  appear  to  be
 oppressive,  the  consequence  is  that  in
 the  eyes  of  the  people  tax  evasion
 acquires  a  certain  degree  of  respect-
 ability  and  unfortunately  that  is

 SRAVANA  29,  1890  (SAKA)  Income  Tax  3202
 Rules  (Ms.)

 exactly  what  has  happened  in  this
 country.  Most  unfortunately  that  is
 something  which  cannot  be  checked.
 But  efforts  should  be  made  to  render
 tax  laws  equitable.  The  Government
 should  also  bring  about  a  modification
 in  the  income-tax  law  itself,  namely,
 to  the  provisions  in  section  80C,
 whereby  higher  exemption  limits  are
 provided  for  actors,  musicians  and
 others  as  it  was  in  the  earlier  Acts.
 that  is,  prior  to  the  amendment  which
 was  passed  about  two  years,  ago,  when
 they  were  treated  in  a  preferential
 manner.  But  the  advantage  which
 was  given  to  this  class  of  people  has
 been  taken  away  and  according  to  the
 law  as  it  stands  at  present,  there  is  no
 distinction  between  ordinary  indivi-
 duals  and  others,  that  is.  authers,
 actors  and  the  like.  Therefore,  I
 would  suggest  that  the  amendments
 that  I  have  put  forward  should  be
 accepted,  and  differential  treatment
 should  be  accorded  to  this  class  of
 people.  I  would  also  emphasise  what
 I  have  stated  earlier  in  respect  of  the
 computation  of  capital  employed;  this
 should  also  be  considered  for  accept-
 ance  because  it  is  most  fair  and  equit-
 able.

 One  word  more  and  I  have  done.
 My  hon.  friend  Shri  Dar  has  given
 another  motion  which  seeks  to  reduce
 the  relief  in  respect  of  insurance
 policies  taken  out  prior  to  1st  March,
 1964,  by  authors,  artists  and  musicians.
 In  my  opinion,  this  is  a  retrograde
 step.  I  would  request  him  to  try  to
 appreciate  the  important  role  of  intel-
 lJectuals  and  artists  in  our  free,  modern
 society.

 att  अब्दुल  गनी  दार  (गुड़गांव) :  मैंने
 बडे ही  ध्यान से  अपने  सीनियर.  मेम्बर
 कोठारी  साहब  को  सिफारिशात को  सुना  है।
 मैं  ऐसा  महसूस  करता  हूं  कि  आज  वक्त आ
 गया है  जबकि  हमको  स्पेड को  स्पेड
 कहना  चाहिये  ।  इस  वक्त  भारत  में  तीन
 तरह  के  लोग  हैं  जो  जिन्दगी  का  लुत्फ  उठा
 रहे  हैं।  एक  वे  हैं  जो  इस  वक्त  हक मत  में
 हैं  और  उनके  रिश्तेदार  :  दूसरे वे  हैं  जो



 3203  Modifications  to

 यहां  के  पांच  बड़े  बड़े  राजा  हैं,  टाटा,  बिड़ला,
 सिंघानिया,  जैन  ग्रुप  और  इस  तरह  का  एक
 आध और  चुप।  तीसरे  वे  हैं  जिन  के  लिए
 भेरे  भाई  कोठारी  साहब  जिनको  काफी  दिल-
 चस्पा है  और  होनी  भी  चाहिये।  वह हैं
 कलाकार,  वह  हैं  अदाकार  और  वह  हैं  मुन्ने
 लिखने  वाले,  लिखारी

 एक  माननीय  सदस्य  :  और  चोथे  हैं
 विदेशी  गुर्गे

 शी  अब्दुल  गनी  दार  यह  भी  हो  सकते
 हैं  लेकिन  उन  का  तजर्बा  मुन्ने  इतना  नहीं,
 इसलिए  मैंने  उन  का  जिक्र  नहीं  किया।

 में  अजे  करना  चाहता  हूं  कि  इस  वक्त  दो
 तरह  से  मुल्क  चल  सकता  है।  एक  यह  कि
 फिर  से  अमान  राम  का  ख्याल  आये  और
 रामराज्य आये,  हर  शख्स  ईमानदारी के
 साथ  अपनी  जो  उस  पर  जिम्मेदारी है  देश  के
 निए,  टैक्स  की  सूरत  में  हो,  किसी  और
 सूरत  में  हो,  वह  पूरे  तौर  पर  उस  का  इकरार
 करे। कस  मुझे  दुख  हुआ  जब  मेरे  मोहतरिम
 भाई  मोरारजी की  टीका  टिप्पणी  हो  रही
 थी,  अगर  मैं  उन  की  जगह  होता  तो  आज
 जो  उन्होंने  यह  कहा  कि  आप  सूत्रीय  कोट
 में  जाओ,  वह  कहते  कि  मैं  अपना  कॉन्डक्ट
 सुप्रीम  कोर्ट  के  चीफ  जस्टिस  के  हवाले  करता
 हूं,  अगर  वह  मुझ  को  समझेंगे  कि  मेरा  यह
 फेल  काबिले  तारीफ़  नहीं  और  यह  इतनी
 बडी  पदवी  पर  होते  हुए  यह  कॉन्डक्ट  जो  था
 प्राइवेट  सेक्रेटरी  बनाने  का  वह  गलत  था  तो
 वह  खुद  बखुद  रिजाइन  कर  देते  ।  लेकिन
 वह  हमेशा  सबक  देते  हैं  दूसरों  को  ।  मेरा

 कहने  का  मतलब  यह  था  कि  इस  वक्त  देश  में
 बदनसीबी से  आम  रास्ता  पड़  गया जिस  को
 कहते  हैं  कि  हर  चीज  को  छिपा  दो  1  हमारे
 कुछ  भाइयों  ने  सोने  की  बाबत  कहा  है  कि  किस
 तरह से  वह  नीचे  चला  गया  और  किस  तरह
 से  बजारों  के  अजीजों  अकारिब  इस  में  शामिल
 हैं।  1956  में  और  57  में  हम  ने  मोरार
 जी  भाई  से  जब  यह  पंजाब  का  दौरा  कर  रहे

 AUGUSL  20,  1968  Income  Tax  Rules  (Ms.)  3204

 तो  हाथ  जोड़  कर  अर्ज  किया  कि  जो  सोग
 इस  वक्त  बरसेरे  इक्तदार  हैं  उन  के  बेटे  सोने
 की  स्मगलिंग  करते  हैं।  यह  हम  से  खफा  हो
 गए  और  बार  बार  यहां  कहा  गया  कि  यह  नोग
 गलत  कहते  हैं।  तो  जो  स्मगलिंग करते  थे
 आखिर तो  स्मगलिंग का  पता  चलना  ही  था।
 वह  स्मगलिंग का  पता  कभी  छिप  नहीं  सकता
 था  तो  ऐसा  दास  कमीशन  ने  फैसला  किया  कि
 मोरार जी  भाई  और  द्न्य  पंडित  जवाहर

 उपाध्यक  महोदय  :  दार  साहब,  गोल्ड
 कन्ट्रोल  आर्डर  अंडर  डिस्कशन  नहीं  है।

 श्री  झम्दुल यनी दार :. यानी  दार:  में  गोल्ड  कन्ट्रोल
 में  नहीं  जा  रहा  हूं।  उस  में  इनकम  टैक्स  का
 रुपया  बचाते  हैं,  इनकम  टैक्स  के  साथ  धोखा
 होता  है।

 म  यह  कह  रहा  था  कि  मैं  कोठारी  भाई
 से  बिल्कुल  इतफाक  कर  लेता  अगर  अदाकार,
 अगर  कलाकार  अगर  लिखाडिये अपनी
 आमदनी  पूरे  तौर  पर  सरकार  के  सामने  रखते
 कि  उन्होंने  कितना  रुपया  लिया,  वह  कितना
 लेते  हैं,  ऐग्रीमेंट कितना  होता  है,  इस  में  अगर
 कोठारी  भाई  जायेंगे  तो  उन  को  मालूम  होगा,
 उन  के  बढ़ाप ेमें  कोई  तकलीफ  उन  को  होने
 वाली  नहीं  है  क्योंकि  1  लाख  रुपया  लेते  है
 तो  5  हजार  रुपये  का  एग्रीमेंट  करते  हैं  ।

 तो  95  हजार  तो  उन  के  पास  रहने  वाला  है।
 चाहे  मोरार  जी  भाई  हों,  चाहे  चव्हाण
 साहब  हों,  चाहे  इन्दिरा  बहन  हों,  वह  उस  से
 निकाल  नहीं  सकते  ।  इसलिए  मेरे  दिल  में
 उन  कलाकारों, उन  अदाकारों,  लिखारियों
 की  बडी  इज्जत  होते  हुए  भी  मैं  यह  कहना
 चाहता  हूं  कि  इस  वक्त  देश  की  स्थिति  ऐसी
 हो  गई  है,  आप  जानते  हैं,  कई  बार  यह  सवाल
 उठाया  गया  कि  हमारी  सरकार  कुछ  इन्सेन्टिव
 देती  है,  इन्सेन्टिव  का  ऐसा  है,  ऊलेन  टिप्स
 बाहर  से  4  रुपये  में  आती  है,  8  रुपये उस  पर
 खर्च  आता  है।  12  रुपये  कुल  होते  हैं।



 3205  Modifications  to.

 कंट्रोल  बांध रखा  है  साढ़े  12  रुपये  13
 रुपये  और  26  से  30  में  पर  पौंड  वह  बिकती
 है।  न  उस  पर  इनकम  टैक्स  होता  है  न  सेल्स
 टेक्स  होता  है  ।  इसलिए  रोना  किस  का
 रोया  जाय  और  मैं  कैसे  कहें?  तभी  में  पीछे
 की  तरफ  गया  कोठारी  भाई  आगे  की  तरफ
 चलना  चाहते  हैं  ।  मैं  जो  पहले  था  उस  की
 तरफ  भाग  रहा  हूँ।  क्यों  भाग रहा हें?
 भेरे  दिन  में  ईमानदारी  से  ऐसा  ख्याल  आ

 गया  है  कि  आज  यह  हो  सकता  है  कि  कुछ
 भाई  ऐसे  हों  जो  अपने  आप  अपनी  आमदनी
 का  पूरा  पूरा  पता  देते  हों  कि  इतनी  हमारी
 आमदनी  होती  है  इसलिए  इतनी  हम  को  छूट
 मिलनी  चाहिए  ।  इन्होंने सवा  33  परसेंट
 के  बजाय  50  परसेंट  कहा और  20
 हजार के  बजाय  32  हजार  कहा  tv  मैं  ने
 उलटा  कहा  कि  इस  को  कम  क्या  जाय
 2ie56,  (व्यवधान)  आप  की  घंटी बज

 रही  है  और  मेरे  दिल  की  घंटो  भी  बज  रही
 है  कि  कुछ  खरी  खरी  बातें  इन  से  होनी  चाहिएं।
 :---(थ्यवथान)......मेरा ख्याल  है  कि
 में  तो  अपने  टाइम  में  ही  हूं  ।  वैसे  आप  तो
 मालिक  हैं  और  मालिकों  को  तो  कुछ  कह
 नहीं  संकते  |

 कल  आप  के  सामने  यह  बात  आई
 क्यों  कहते  हैं  यह?  में  ईमानदारी से  यह
 चाहता हूं  कि  यह  इनकम  टैक्स  बिलकुल उड़ा
 दांतो  बड़ा  अच्छा  हो।  पहले  कहते  थे  कि
 कान्ति  आई  ने  63-64  में  इतना  दिया,  68
 हजार  दिया  फिर  45  हजार  दिया,  फिर  43
 हजार  हुआ,  फिर  14  हजार  पर  आ  मए...
 (व्यक् थान) .  .  भाई,  मेरे  सवाल  के  जवाब
 में  आया  था,  मझे  पता  है।  आप  जरा  सब्र
 करिए,  मैं  उन  पर  चोट  नहीं  करता  ।  मैं
 नहीं  कहता  कि  14  हजार  उन्होंने  बेइमानी
 कर  के  दिया  या  पहले  उन्होंने  बड़े  फराखदिली
 से  अपने  को  लुटाया  1  मे  यह  कुछ  नहीं  कहता  |
 में  केस  यह  रख  रहा  हं.  (व्यवधान)
 अरे,  यह  भी  एक  अदाकार  हैं।  एक  नाटक
 भी  खेल  रहे  हैं।  एक  नाटक  वहां  फिल्मों  में  हो

 SRAVANA  29,  1890  (SAKA)

 की  है  वरना  में  नलाता  क्यों  टीमें
 कोठारी  साहब  को  हमेशा  अपने  लिए
 लीडर  मानता  हूं  इस  माने  में  ।  लेकिन  मैं
 लाया  इसलिए  कि  यह  तो  सब  कागज  की
 कार्यवाइयां  हैं।  इनकम  टैक्स  का  जो  बही
 मतलब है,  आप  को  डिप्टी  स्पीकर  साहब,
 क्या  बतलाऊं,  जो  शरीफ  आदमी  है,  जिस  वक्त
 इनकम  टैक्स  आफिसर  के  सामने  जाकर
 बैठता  है,  वह  कितना  ही  ईमानदार  रहा  हो,
 लेकिन जिस  वक्त  इनकम  टैक्स  आफिसर
 ने  उस  से  कहा  कि  मैं  जानता  हूं  तुम  किस  तरह
 बेईमानी  करते  हो,  तो  वह  तो  उसी  वक्त  बहीं
 मर  गया।  जो  शरीफ  आदमी  होता  है,  वह
 वहीं  मर  जाता  है  ।  लेकिन  काश कि हमारे कि  हमारे
 मोअज़िज़;  मोहतरिम  फाइनेंस  मिनिस्टर
 इस  बात  की  जांच  करते  कि  क्या  जो  इनकम
 टैक्स यह  लेते  हैं  इन  से  और  जिस  तरह  यह
 लेते  चले  जा  रहे  हैं  और  जिस  तरह  यह  जहां
 चाहते  है  छूट  देते  हैं  इस  से  मुल्क  को  स्वाद

 को  तरक्की  मिलने  वाली  है  या  नहीं  मिलने
 वाली  है?  अगर  वह  इस  को  ठीक  समझते
 हैं  तो  बड़ी  खशी  से  करें,  हम  ताईद  करेंगे  1

 इसलिए  मेरी  बड़ी  अदब  से  अर्ज  है  कि  कोठारी
 भाई  अपनी  इस  तजवीज  को  वापस  नें  और
 इसलिए  वापस  लें  कि  जैसे  इन  को  कहते हैं
 कि  बिना  सोचे  समझे  बिल  नाते  हैं,  औरों

 जाने  वाली  है,  जायगी 7  फिर  जो  फैसला

 कोठारी  भाई  करेंगे  वह  सही  होगा  t



 3207  Modifications  to

 :  ७»)  pS  pile  cy

 gee  Gail  ae  Obes ad  au
 Olan S  cole  आओ  अ

 ५५  खनी ज्  अ

 WS  ee  AT ciy  Ta  pe

 ole  Up  tees  dee  fe
 SIE  bis  He  le  cis!

 et  By  GI  Fj  oe  Unt
 vet  Saye  iy  Ul  ge  Ut  9  SO!
 29  Aapeyd  slo  at)  FS  Ol  oe

 ener  कंक  Ole ge  उ
 BUS  Me

 अथऊ  ob  ot  ast  dk om

 Loe eh  eed  ~  aS yt at
 wale  Sly e  Sle  an 2

 Se  wl  A  uw  ऊ  अ

 अ  ज  yl  ct  उ
 अ  ज्  आ  ज्

 अ  उ४  ४:  अ  उश  आ

 अण्ड Sh
 BIB oe Ae of § UI

 alt  5

 aS  Up  bale  UST  कम  जल

 के  Sle ee  ob  99  iy I
 Oke -  अ  श  I

 Zi  teh  eb  sal  ZT  ke  &  pb

 उ+  eu Ss <  Gylslal  jars  अ

 De  £  S23  vl

 AUGUST  20,  1968  Income  Tax  3208
 Rules  (Ms.)

 et  et  me  we  SS
 आअ  अ  ey  ७  अ  उल  कि
 >  आन  JT  es Ia ot

 ls  fein  1 eal  ao  य्  lye

 Slew  ज  HSE

 se  gl  Gye  eS  Ol

 mse  el  फ  आली

 or  *  oe  ७  Sle  UF  sy
 अ  rors  may  अ  प

 अक  OS  2  tym  S  ptm  ae
 *  Iyer AS  Segre 5S  अ

 Sle yah  2  Ged  ed  a  Jas

 ESTEE  *  Bom  om  2  GI  SH
 6  2  CAS»  asl  1  अ

 ि  age  ge  Wi be  oy

 BP  Gm  Ate Ke  9

 s  BS  bee  ed nt
 र्  Sis  lh as  Us a oth

 ध  Sy  ace  ple  ce  eee  ee

 ee  AS  th  ee  ST
 <  ody  end  le  99  bee

 TRS <  YT  eh  ST  ye

 or uw Sf  Ae  Foe
 उ  ०  ४  अर  अ  फेस  स

 ऊ  2  cet  ate  uk  elt

 Sere Sle  obey  oo
 Bb  Sw  2)  5  oe  6  chy
 ol  Sy  ge  cg  ay  a  be

 Be  eo  EON  Ge  lal  ju  cis
 am  eet  SS  SH  S

 प्  Ole  az  gh  yh  ysl  &  rs  te

 ut  a  ke  SJaur



 3209  Modifications to

 FA  BBS  Se  ge
 ew  ebb  kb  Fei son

 opie  as  ७४  SK.

 अं  जना  ob  Lil  5  i

 अ  dle  ge  abe  we  abe
 Be?  ar  SY  hye  Ody  A

 male  ws:  oor  PKohl

 SRAVANA  29,  1890  (SAKA)

 od  PLAS  abt  er  LS
 ke

 अ  उन:  अ  tle  Gt

 = Oe  ७)  ce  क  dy  tT

 om  say  ©  SS  SI  Ge  ul
 Gy  Bao ek  5S  SS  Sl  ut

 ek

 we ७  ७  Pe  OL
 oa  Glit  JOb  -  gle  gles

 Ss  Js  ite  ,  ०४  ज  प्!

 अ  औ  eon  GT  Al  kt

 a seit  ST  Hy  Fae) S0

 उ*  ad  LT  ७  ४  द 24  LT

 s  Vee ol A Lge A  ion  EST  bee!
 अ  ण  जे"  ज  आधि

 rl  vet  ae  ०  ध  (उन
 &  ot  db  Be  s  ol  ASS

 Be  od  “अ  SY  SI  ST

 oe  el  5 aay  अ  o

 ae  LO she go se ue

 अं  se  he  ab  -  Yb

 Us  tle  ०  BLE  Oe

 Income  Tax  3210
 Rules  (Ms)

 2४ e  Ol  क  Oe  Gh  Hal  ae

 ue  Jo  te  Dol  Se  coe
 Oni  Oayblot  gal  OybAT  ol

 ut  st  oot  Swe  OH  SRS

 ed  Say  nl  aT  ge  Cols  *

 Be  ta  So  ol  set  S
 a

 UF  UUs  Spe  a  gk  ATU
 2  उ  Bell Pa  अ  Gyn

 PL  gal  sl  a  te  el

 ul  any  A  a  जी  ऊन  अ)  ब्

 oe 3  4a  sr- A  UI  be  »
 Aj 5  wth  ee ge -  oe
 क  ral  न्र  द  वह)  थ

 nol  aie  So  by  nut

 SS  he  Gye  SS  QS
 ४०  by  Sol  ysl  2  Gy

 = On  ao  oe  gal  Ze  ४5

 -S  GS  ae  ज्  ऊ

 Ue Gb S ST Se  अ

 Sot  &  a  ज  उजर  ot  cele

 Sle  On - Ost  ७)  Sly  Gb

 Sylailyl Gee  J2  aie -  Use  bey

 ae  tara ड  उपर  अ

 a!  Gla  a  ke

 93  8  ad al  rey  अ  3  Oye

 Slee il  Ue oo 4 by अ  by
 A  gl  A  ol  &  er  gal

 <  seit  gale  che  Spee  5

 temo. gle  TS  time  re  lye

 ge  er  Sle  SZ  be  आफ

 eh  5 फ्  OW  ee
 or  Glerys) Be  LT  oS



 3211  Modifications  to

 {o's  sl  ae  54]

 Jo  coe  al  A  ay  we  Oe  S

 «४  SA  wee te  S
 ele  Se  a  Ol  उ  CHT  CAS
 <  फैले  bee  (Oo), ee

 ७  ve  Als  का  SoA

 OIL vl  am  SIL GT  ty  ge

 EX  ot  eT  a  rae

 glob  a  wu  sg  ys

 Glib  ee  a  et  ET  One

 SS  pS  2  Oe  el  a

 --P  ट्  We ge  3  JL

 Ele SES  wi  ET  an
 ७५,  a, bo  Ul  uw  arse

 Wye  ley  ला  ए  अ  त  कर

 अ  ि»  ह  om
 hye  Llp  «ऊप  (O25)

 ge  WS  oT  au  OUT  Ce
 OS  ot  tye  yO  ot oe

 aes आ  ल  छ  ue ust ot
 अ  ४७  be  SF  Gale  Z

 ae =  fry  Eli  eh 2  sil

 ES  el  ee  Qe  LW  OS

 o  SU  Kl  औ  2  bey  ee  oo

 SIG  अज  Ay  SAT  अर

 2ul-ot 2)  3  oe  अ

 -ऊ अ  Sle  ES Boe 3  oe

 AUGUST  20,  1968  Income  Tax  Rules  (rds.  3212

 FAST BT  WT  ge  ce  ob  KI
 ut SIRT UY a  ua spe S

 अ  अ  cole  आ

 FS  oe  se  ol  rer  8b LI
 dé  ~e  aT  Ot  ड  Qe
 5  Se,  pl ee  Obl S
 AS oS  ma  2 tk ow  अ
 अ  अ  आप  LT  ele  अर्जन

 soil  SS  Ki  ay ge  ee  wl

 LS  og  wee  SO  le
 on  फरश  +  Sl  उ

 WS  ce  rl  Beil  SS  pS  Pry

 Ch  oS  pe  BE  eT

 aol  sing  Se  ठी  lil  a
 ७७  ool  nyt  oe Sy aes oe
 FE  K-42  oh  pare
 rei)  te  ji  Lele

 IS  aS  BS  gil  S  अज  Me
 a2 ot ae  KS SI  5

 ut  Ayal  «र  *  ob pe  vl

 ut  2५  lpm ay  oe  अ

 Shee ol  ot  Geo  फब

 ui  ४  &  dl  2  ह्  अ  न

 अक  Sole Slee db ly
 ws  <  st  sh  अ  उ  कन

 S25  ASU  oe

 we  ae  Ah  Ge  2  ot
 wl  al  gle  OWS अ  a

 अ  oot  आ  A  ls  अ  अर

 at  SF  9  Ol  owe  Td  ely

 ot aNd  ame  gon
 भ

 ६  ऊ  अ  अ  अ  Ussl



 3213,  Modifications  to

 ce oe  St  2

 Oy  प्  oe  Fe  2S  Ze

 ls  FSO od  cyl  b  ४

 ae  aay  de  get  uP  ce
 am  ७)  eet  be  s

 अ  a  ध्  फ्  Ge

 Past  “2  प  cep  é  >  s

 a  gin  ro  de  eye  ०

 fh  wiry  Ble  अ  रि  अज

 Sty  «्  3  8  अर्जन

 f-  5  oo  थ  SS  dle

 THE  MINISTER  OF  STATE  IN  THE
 MINISTRY  OF  FINANCE  (SHRI  K.  C.
 PANT):  Mr.  Deputy-Speaker,  Sir,
 with  reference  to  the  last  statement
 of  my  hon.  friend  who  spoke  just  now
 there  is  no  harm  if  a  deaf  person  25
 leading  the  blind.  But  it  is  dangerous
 if  the  blind  leads  the  deaf.  So  long
 as  one  can  see  where  one  is  going,  I
 think  there  is  no  harm.

 The  only  statement  of  my  very
 senior  colleague,  Shri  Abdul  Ghani
 Dar,  with  which  I  find  myself  in  total
 agreement  is  his  wish  that  Ram  Raj
 should  come  to  this  country  and  that
 people  should  pay  their  taxes  in  time.
 About  that  I  agree  with  him  whole-
 heartedly.  Beyond  that,  I  am  afraid,
 it  is  difficult  for  me  to  agree  on  the
 substance  of  the  amendment  that  he
 has  moved.

 1  think,  he  will  agree  with  me  that
 authors,  artistes,  playwrights  and
 others  should  not  be  treated  in  a  man-
 ner  which  places  them  at  a  disadvant-
 age  as  compared  to  the  generality  ot
 cases,  for  two  reasons.  One  is  that  their
 incomes  fluctuate;  it  is  not  a  steady
 income  like  that  of  others.  The  other
 ig  that  they  have,  as  my  hon.  friend,
 Shri  Kothari,  pointed  out.  short  active
 working  lives.  Take,  for  instance,
 cinema  stars.  They  may  have  a  very
 earning  capacity  for  a  few  years  but
 after  that  their  earning  capacity  goes

 SRAVANA  29,  1890  (SAKA)  Income  Tax  3214
 Rules  (ids.

 down.  Therefore  some  special  consi-
 deration  does  need  to  be  shown  to  this
 class  of  persons.

 1  am  not  sure  whether  he  has
 understood  the  purpose  of  the  new
 rule  11A.  The  new  rule  11A  pres-
 cribes  :—

 “In  the  case  of  an  _  individual
 being  an  author,  playwright,  artist,
 musician  or  actor  the  total  amount
 of  savings  in  approved  media
 such  as  life  imsurance  premia,
 cumulative  time  deposits  in  Post
 Office  Savings  Bank  etc,  which
 qualify  for  tax  relief’;

 in  other  words,  we  enable  them  to
 make  certain  savings  in  accepted  and
 approved  media  so  that  they  have
 these  savings  to  assist  them  later  on
 in  life...  They  do  not  have  pensions,
 gratuities  and  so  on.

 The  ordinary  level  at  which  the
 generality  of  cases  are  given  this
 exemption  is  a  limit  of  30  per  cent.
 Everybody  is  given  up  to  30  per  cent.
 It  would  not  be  fair  to  give  it  up  to
 only  25  per  cent  for  these  cases.
 Similarly,  it  is  now  up  to  Rs.  20,000
 and  it  would  hardly  be  fair  to  reduce
 that  to  Rs.  15,000,  particularly  in
 these  cases.

 Now,  we  go  to  the  other  side  of  the
 argument,  that  is,  the  argument  of
 my  hon.  friend,  Shri  Kothari,  I
 appreciate  the  desires  that  have
 prompted  him  to  move  in  this  matter,
 but  would  ask  him  to  consider  what
 exactly  would  be  the  effect  of  his
 suggestion.  He  suggests  that  33-1/3
 per  cent  should  be  raised  to  50  per
 cent.  Now  let  us  take  a  _  practical
 view  of  the  matter  and  see  what  would
 be  the  condition  of  a  middle  class
 person  or  somebody  in  the  middle
 income  brackets.  Would  he  accept.
 say,  Rs.  60,000  as  a  middle  income
 bracket  for  these  people?  In  that  case
 what  he  is  suggesting  is  that  half  the
 income  should  be  allowed  in  the  form
 of  these  savings  and  out  of  the  other
 half  he  would  pay  taxes  and
 paying  taxes  he  is  supposed  to  main-
 tain  a  fairly  high  standard  of  living
 What  ,  happens  at  the  level
 60,000?  At  the  level  of  Rs.  60,000,  if



 3215  AMfodifications  to  AUGUST  20,

 the  saving  is  Rs.  25.000  and  not  Rs.
 30,000,  even  then,  after  paying  taxa-
 tion,  the  disposable  income  with
 which  this  person is  to  live  on  is
 Rs,  19,340  or  about  Rs,  20,000  a  year,
 that  is,  something  a  little  over  Rs.
 1,500  a  month.  Is  it  suggested  that
 these  people  could  live  on  an  income
 of  about  Rs.  1,500  per  month?  I  do
 not  think  that  could  be  suggested
 unless  they  have  non-taxable  income
 from  agriculture  etc.  or  they  have
 some  undisclosed  income  to  fall  back
 upon.  I  hardly  think  that  he  can
 advocate  a  case  in  which  anybody  has
 undisclosed  income  to  fall  back  upon.

 Therefore  one  has  to  take  a  practical
 view  of  this  matter  and  considering
 that  we  would  like  to  give  something
 extra  to  them  we  have  increased  it
 from  30  per  cent  to  33-1/3  per  cent.
 That  is  a  concession  given  to  these
 people  and,  I  think  that  is  appropriate
 when  one  considers  the  practical
 aspect  of  the  matter  which  1  have
 placed  before  the  House.

 His  other  proposal  is  to  increase  the
 monetary  limits  from  Rs.  20,000  to
 Rs.  25,000.  On  that  I  see  no  great
 objection,  because  that  would  mean
 that  at  the  level  of  Rs.  75,000,  the
 Rs.  25,000  limit  would  be  reached  and
 उ  am  prepared  to  say  that  even  at  the level  of  Rs.  75,000  for  this  particular
 group  of  people,  it  could  be  considered
 an  income  which  many  of  them  enjoy
 only  for  a  short  span  of  their  lives.
 But  I  would  not  consider  it  normal
 for  others.  For  them,  I  am  prepared
 to  go  to  that  extent.

 SHRI  S.  S.  KOTHARI:  That  means
 you  are  accepting  it.

 SHRI  K.  C.  PANT:  Yes.

 Apart  from  this.  he  talked  about
 Rule  19A.  Rule  19A  relates  to  income-
 tax  rules  for  computation  of  capital
 and  for  calculating  the  exemption
 from  tax  for  the  first  few  years  of  the
 tax  holiday  that  is  given  to  new
 industrial  undertakings,  ship  and  the
 business  of  hotels  which  is  of  the
 order  of  6  per  cent  on  the  capita].  He

 -I  have

 1968  Income  Tax  Rules  (Ms.)  3216

 probably  knows  that  we  have  provid-
 ed  that in  case  there is  loss  in  a
 certain  year,  the  deficiency  will  be
 carried  over  to  next  year  and  that
 there  has  been  a  change  in  the  com-
 putation  of  capital  employed.  Now,
 the  debentures  and  other  long-term
 borrowings  from  banks  and  so  specified
 financial  institutions  for  purpose  of
 acquirjng  capital  assets  in  India  are
 not  treated  as  liability  and,  aecord-
 ingly,  are  included  in  the  capital
 base.  So.  this  goes  to  increase  the
 capital  base  and,  thereby,  goes  to  give
 the  benefit  which  he  has  in  mind.

 He,  probably,  also  knows  that  as
 Mr.  Bhoothalingam  has  suggested  in
 the  course  of  his  report  on  the  simpli-
 fication  of  tax  structure,  this  is  a
 simplified  calculation,  only  upto  6  per
 cent  on  the  capital  as  on  the  first  day
 of  the  computation  period.  It  is  a
 direct  calculation.  It  does  not  involve
 averages;  it  does  not*  involve  caleula-
 tion  of  disposals  and  acquisitions  of
 each  asset,  or  half  profit,  etc.  ete.  All
 these  complications  in  the  process
 of  calculating  the  6  per  cent,  in  the
 process  of  computing  the  capital  base,
 I  do  not  know,  after  going  through  all
 the  trouble  of  simplifying  the  tax
 structure,  if  he  would  now  like  to
 introduce  changes  in  it  which  would
 again  bring  back  the  old  complicated
 picture  and  which  would  undo  what
 good  that  has  been  attempted  by  Mr.
 Bhoothalingam.  Therefore,  I  would
 appeal  to  him  not  to  press  all  these.
 suggestions.

 SHRI  5.  5.  KOTHARI:  My  only
 point  is  that  in  the  Act,  it  is  the
 relevant  amount  during  the  year.  The
 rules  may  be  inconsistent  with  the
 section.  That  you  may  examine.
 Otherwise,  the  rules  will  be  sltra
 vires,  if  somebody  goes  to  the  court.

 SHRI  K  .C.  PANT:  We  can,  cer-
 tainly,  examine  whatever  he  haa  said.

 put  before  him  the  broad
 approach  of  Government  that  we
 would  not  like  to  complicate  the
 computation  which  we  have  simplified
 now  in  response  to  the  request  of  all
 sides  of  the  House.  So,  I  would
 request  him  not  to  press  his  other"
 suggestions  I  accept  his  one  suggestion.



 327  Modifications  to
 Income  Tax  Rules  (Ms.)

 MR.  DEPUTY-SPEAKER :  Does  the
 hon.  Member  accept  it  ?

 SHRI  5  S.  KOTHARI:  I  accept  it.
 MR,  DEPUTY-SPEAKER :  So,  I  am

 Putting  the  motion,  as  amended,  to
 the  vote  of  the  House.

 The  question  is:
 “This  House  resolves  that  in

 Pursuance  of  section  296  of  the
 Income-Tax  Act,  1961,  the  following
 modification  be  made  in  the  Income-
 Tax  (Second  Amendment)  Rules,
 1968,  published  in  the  Gazette  of
 India  by  Notification  No.  S.O.  1112,
 dated  the  18th  March,  1968  and  laid
 on  the  Table  on  the  Ist  April,  1968,
 namely  :—

 in  rule  2,  in  the  proposed  rule
 11A,  for  ‘Rs,  20,000’  substitute
 ‘Rs,  25,000"
 This  House  recommends  to  Rajya

 Sabha  that  Rajya  Sabha  do  concur  in
 this  resolution.”

 The  motion  was  adopted.

 18  hrs.

 MR.  DEPUTY-SPEAKER:  Now,  I
 shall  put  the  other  motion  of  Shri
 Abdul  Ghani  Dar  to  the  vote  of  the
 House.

 LAILSS/68—GIPF,

 SRAVANA  29,  1890  (SAKA)  B.A.C,  Report  3218

 tt  अब्दुल  मनी  वार  :  कोठारी  जी  की
 जीत  हो  गई  है  इसलिए  मे  वापिस  लेता  हूं  t

 उऊ»:अज्शनज्न

 we 2d DS ees

 foe Sb

 The  motion  was,  by  leave,  with-
 drawn.

 BUSINESS  ADVISORY  COMMITTEE
 TWENTY-SECOND  REPORT

 THE  MINISTER  OF  PARLIAMEN-
 TARY  AFFAIRS  AND  COMMUNICA-
 TIONS  (DR.  RAM  SUBHAG  SINGH):
 I  beg  to  present  the  Twenty-second
 Report  of  the  Business  Advisory
 Commitee.

 MR.  DEPUTY-SPEAKER :  Now,  the
 House  stands  adjourned  to  meet  again
 at  11  A.M.  tomorrow.

 18.01  hrs.
 The  Lok  Sabha  then  adjourned  till

 Eleven  of  the  Clock  on  Wednesday,
 August  21,  1968/Sravana  30,  1890

 (Saka)


