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Umts of Accounts to 13 European 
Units of Account (EUA) w.e.f. 1st 
January, 1980. Further efforts are 
eontinuing for improvements. 

Coffee is already included in the 
GSP Scheme of EEC. However, in 
respect of unroasted undecaffe1ned 
eoft'ee in which India has an export 
interest, the benefit of the GSP 1 has 
been limited to the ~ast deve~Qped 
COWltries .. India had requested the 
EEC for reduction Qf ,tariff for C¢fee, 
both on Most Favoured Nation (MFN) 
basis .and unqer the G~P. The MFN 
tariff on unroa~ted undecaffE'ined 
coffee was ~educed from 7 ·to 5 per 
cent w.e.f. 1st January, 1977. 

Bulk tea is duty free on MFN basis. 
Tea in retail packs is already includ-
ed in the QSP ,scheme with a duty 
free tr;eatment. 

Oil cak~s which are the mqin animal 
feeds exported by India are duty .free 
on MFN basis. Some other types of 
animal feed in which India has small 
exports are included in the EEC's 
GSP scheme. 

~volvement of Indian Gannent Ex-
porters in forced Certificates Racket 

•75. SHRI RAJNATH SONKAR 
SHASTRI: 

SHRI CHHANGUR RAM: 

Will the Minister of COMMERCE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) whether it is a fact that some 
Indian garment exporters are aUeged 
to be involved in forged certificates 
.racket; 

(b) if so, whether the Indian ex-
porters involved in the racket have 
been identifi,ed, if so, details thereof 
stating their modu~·operandi; 

(c) tl'lte lose in, . foreign, excha~ge 
earnings on th~ accoq:pt; and 

(d) th~ step' taken by Government 
in the matt.er? ' ' ·' 

THE MINISTER OF COMMERCE 
AND STEEL AND MINES (SHRt 
PRANAB MUKHERJEE); (a) on the 
basis of a preliminary probe, it has 
come to light that some export ~erti­
ficates produced at the point of import 
in a certain' quota country are of 
doubtful authen.ticity. 

(b) The p1atter is under investtga-
tion. 

l I 
(c) It does not seem as if loss of 

foreign exchange i's ittvolved. 

(d) Impo~tin~ countries have been 
requested to exercise due vigilance in 
the ma,tter of scrut4'1y of export cer-
tificates. Further, a system of month-
ly reconciliation of erxport certificates 
with that of import statistics main-
tained by the quo~a CQ\lntries is. being 
introduced. This is expf1Ctep to con-
siderably minimise the production of 
export documents of doubtful authen_ 
ticity. 

Bonus to Central Government 
ElpJtloyees 

•76. SHRI AMAR ROYPRADHAN: 
W1ll the Minister of FINANCE be 
pleased to state: 

(a) th~ number of the Central Gov-
ernment emplo'yees who will not get 
bonus under the scheme of produc-
tivity-linked bonus; and 

<b) what steps government propose 
to take to equalise them with those 
employees who will get bonus under 
the said scheme? 

THE MINISTER OF ST.f\TE IN THE 
MINlSTRY OF FINANCE (SHRI 
S.AWAI SINGH SISODIA; (a) so far 
pr~ductivity ... linked bonus has been 
~xtended to abput 22 lakhs r~~ular 
employees out of a total of abo}lt 32 
lakhs Central Government employees. 

(b) TJre productivity-linked bonus 
has beeq given onl" to l encourage 
productivity in prqd~ct'1on oriented 
organisations or t}?.(j)~e·. wflich are. pre-
dominantly commercial in character. 




