
6i73

MOTIONS  RE.  REPRESENTATION 

OF tHE PEOPLE  (PREPARATION 
OF ELECTORAL ROLLS) RULES

Mr, Deputy-Speaker: The  House

will now proceed with discussion of 
the  Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation  of  Electoral  Rolls) 
Rules, 1956.

Shri M. L, Agarwal (PiUbhit Distt. 
cum Bareilly  Distt.-East);  What 
about the discussion of my Bill which 
was part discussed on the last day, 
Sir?

Mr. Depaty-Speaker: We  decided

this morning that we are not taking 
up any other business in connection 
with non-official business than the in­
troduction  of these  Bills.  Perhaps 
the hon. Member was not present at 
that time when the House took that 
decision.  His part-discussed Bill will 
be taken when  opportunity  comes 
next time.  When it will be, it is not 
known. ! J[

An Hon. Member: Is the Bill debar­
red? >

Shri S. V. Ramaswamy  (Salem): 
Would you advise the hon.  Member 
to wait in hope?

Mr. Depaty-Speaker: That he will
decide for himself.

We have allotted two hours for the 
discussion of these rules.

Shri Kamath (Hoshangabad):  Will 
not the hon. Minister move a motion?

The Minister of Legal Affairs (Shri 
Pataskar): I have placed the rules on 
the Table.

'Mr. Deputy-Speaker: The Members

will move tjieir  motions  proposing 
amendments to the Rules.

Sliri  Sadhan  Gnpta (Calcutta 
South East):  I beg to move:

(i) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  ̂Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in

7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Motions re. Represen- 6174
tation oi the People 
(Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls) Rules 

rule 11 of the Representation  of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls)  Rules, 1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely:

**for clause (b) substitute:

“(b) supply  two  copies  of 
each separate part of the elec­
toral  roll  to  every  political 
party to which an election sjmi- 
bol has  been allotted  by the 
Election  Commission  or to  a 
representative  of  any  such 
political party who is authoriz­
ed to receive the sum; and

(c) give such  further publi­
city to the notice in Form 3 as 
he may consider necessary”.’

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution:

(ii) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule (1)  of rule 26 of  the 
Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation of  Electoral Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the Table on 
the 24th July, 1956, namely:

(i) in  clause (a), for “ten 
rupees” substitute:

“two rupees”; and

(ii) in clause  (b), for “one 
rupee” substitute:

“four annas”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

(iii) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule (2) of rule 26 of the Re­
presentation of the People (Pre­
paration of Electoral Rolls) Rules,



6175 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 6176
People (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls)

Rules

1956, laid on the Table  on  the 
24th July, 1956, namely:

Jor “sub-section” substitute: 

“sub-rule”.’

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

Shri K. K. Basa (Diamond  Har­
bour): I beg to move:

(i)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
rule 2 of the  Representation  of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls)  Rules, 1956, laid on ' 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely:

“suchin clause  (c), after 
person” insert:

“being a judicial or  semi­
judicial officer and not being 
an executive officer”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(ii) This House rasolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of  ̂
sectior̂ 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following cunendment be made in 
rule 2 of the Representation  of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls)  Rules, 1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely:

in clause (c) after  “appoint”
insert:

“subject to the approval of 
the Election Commissioner”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(iii) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule  (1) of  rule 6 of  the 
Representation  of  the  People

(Preparation of  Electoral Rolls) 
Rules, lf56, laid on the Table on 
the 24th July, 1956, namelv;

omit “imless the chief  elec­
toral  officer,  subject  to  any 
general or special  instructions 
issued by the Election Commis­
sion, determines in  respect of 
any part that the  alphabetical 
order is more  convenient  or 
that the names  shall  be  ar­
ranged partly, in one way and 

partly in the other”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

(iv)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub̂section  (3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule (1) of rule 6 of the Re­
presentation of the People (Pre­
paration  of  Electoral  Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the Table on 
the 24th July, 1956, namely:

after “Election  Commission” 

insert:

“for  reasons  recorded  in 
writing”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(v) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
followiî amendment be made in 
sub-rule  (1)  of rule 6 of  the 
Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation  of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the Table on 
the 24th July, 1956, namely:

omit  “or  that  the  names 
shall be arranged partly in one 
way and partly in the other”. 

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(vi) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28 of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the



6i77 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 
People (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

RiOm

617s

[Shri K. K. Basu] 

following amendment be made in 
rule 10 of the Representation of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls)  Rules, 1956, laid on 
Table on  the  24th July,  1956, 
namely:

in  sub-clause  (b), for “at 
such place” substitute:

“at  the local  posrt  office 
police  station  and/or  any 

other public place”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
Ihe said resolution.

Shri Kâ th:  I beg to move:

(i)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28 of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
rule 10 of the Representation of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls) Rules,  1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely:

after  clause  (b),  add  the 
following Sub-rule;

“(2)  A  copy of such draft 
roll shall be supplied  without 
payment  to the  recognizea 
parties and also such other im­
portant  organisations  of the 
area as may be prescribed by 
the Election Commission.”

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(ii)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of ŝub-section  C3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
rule 12 of the Representation  of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls)  Rules, 1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely;

for “21 days” substitute  “42 
days”.  ,  .

This House recommends to Bajya

Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
thp said resolution.

(iii) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment te made in 
rule 19 of the Representation  of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls)  Rules, 1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 

namely:

after sub-rule  (2), add: 

^̂ Explanation.—Such places 
of enquiry shall not be at  a 
distance of  more than  two 
miles from the places where 
the  claimant  objected  to 
usually resides”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(iv) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule  (1) of rule 26 of  the 
Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation of Electoral  Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the TAble on 
the 24th July, 1956, namely:

in  clause  (a), for  “ten 
rupees” substitute:

“five rupees”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(v) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule (1) of rule 27 of the Re­
presentation of the People (Pre­
paration of Electoral Rolls) Rules, 
1956, laid on the Table on the 
24th July, 1956, namely:

in  clause  (b), for  “ten 
rupees” substitute:

“five rupees”



«T70  VoMont i« 7 SEPTSHBKR 1856 Hepreientotioit of tte  618O
I People (Preparation

 ̂ ' «f ZIeetoral Bolb)
Kulei

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur ii- 

the said resolution.

(vi)  This House resolves tiiat in 
pursuance of sjub-section  (3) o+ 
section 28 of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sud-rule (2) of  rule 33 of  the 
Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation of Electoral  Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the Table on 
the 24th July, 1956, namely: 

odd at the end:

"Provided  that  at  every 
general election or bye-elec- 
tion every contesting  candi­
date  shall be suppUed two 
copies tree and not more than 
six copies at one-half of  the 

selling price”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

Shri Dabhl (Kaira North):  I beg

to move:

(i)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made*in 
rule 8 of the  Representation of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls) Rules, 1956, laid  on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 

namely:

for “may’* substitute “shall”.

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

(ii)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the  Representation 

of  the  People  Aot,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
rule 8 of the Representaiion of the 
People  (Preparation of Electoral 
Rolls)  Rules, 1956,  laid on the 
Table on  the  24th  July, 1956, 

namely:

after “send” insert:

“either  by registered post

or through the staff employ­
ed for the purpose”.

*  This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

(iii)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
sectio** 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following  proviso  be  added to 
sub-rule (2)  of  rule 33 of the 
Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the Table on  - 

the 24th July, 1956, namely:

“Provided that the State Gov­
ernment may supply,  free  of 
cost, one or more copies of the 
electoral roD to the candidates 
to the elections concerned.”

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

(iv)  This House resolves th%t in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28  of the Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule (2) of rule 33 of the Re­
presentation of the People (Pre­
paration of Electoral Rolls) Rules, 

1956, laid on the Table  on the 
24th July, 1956, namely: 

add at the end:

‘Provided  that  at every 
general election or bye-elec- 
tion every contesting  candi­
date shall be supplied  three 

copies free of cost.”

This House recommends to Rajya 

Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur m. 

the said resolution.

(v)  This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28 of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendment be made in 
sub-rule (2) of rule 33 of.the Re- 
presefttation of the Peqple (Pre­
paration  of  Electoral  Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid,on the Table on 
the 24th July, 1956, namely:



6i8i MoHons re. 7 SEPTSaCBER 1956  Representation of the 6182
• People  (Preparation

of Electoral Rolls)
Rules

[Shri Dabhi]

add at the end:

“Provided  that  at  every 
general election or bye-elec- 
tion every contesting  candi­
date shalJ  be supplied foxir 
copies free of cost.”

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 

the said resolution.

Shri  Shree  Narayan  Das  (Dar- 
bhanga Central): I beg to move:

(i) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28 of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
following amendments be made in 
rule 26 of the Representation of 
the People (Preparation of Elec- 
total Rolls) Rules, 1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely:

(i) for  sub-rule  (1), 
substitute:

“(1)  Every  application 
under  sub-section  (1)  of 
section 23 shall be made  in 
duplicate  in  Form 4  (Part 
I).”; and

(ii) omit sub-rule (2).

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(ii) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 
section 28 of the  Representation 
of  the  People  Act,  1950,  the 
folowing amendment be made in 
sub-rule (1) of rule 27 of the Re­
presentation of the People (Pre­
paration of Electoral Rolls) Rules, 
1956, laid on the Table on  the 
24th July, 1956, namely:

m clause (b),—

omit “and  a  fee 
rupees  to be paid 
juAcial stamps”.

of  ten 
in non-

This House recommends to Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

»Ir.  Deputy-Speaker:  All  these
motions are now before  the  House 

along with the Rules.

Shri Sadhan  Gupta:  My  amend­
ments are to rules 11 and 26.  Rule
11 is a very important rule, oecause 
it deals with publicity to tne draft 
electoral rolls.  The  importance of 
publicity is that it enables  persons,, 
who are entitled to be included on 
the electoral roll but whose  names 
have been omitted for some reason or 
other, to get their names  included. 
In a country like ours where there 
are so many difficulties in enlisting 
electors, the  proper framing of this 
rule is absolutely essential.  First of 
all, we have a lot of people who are 
perhaps  not conscious  about  their 
franchise due to illiteracy,  perhaps 
due to ignorance, and it is necessary 
to evolve some process  by  which 
their names could be enlisted on the 
electoral roll.

Secondly, due to illiteracy, many of 
the people are not in a position to 
check up the rolls themselves and to 
ascertain whether their  names have 
been included on the electoral rolls 
or not.  Under these  circimistances, 
unlass some mechanism was evolved 
for including their names, they would 
be deprived of their franchise.  With 
this end in view, I have suggested an 
amendment  to  rule 11 for  proper 
publicity and f6r proper facility for 
inclusion of .names in the  electoral 
roll.  Now, the mode of further pub­
licity suggested by Rule 11 is, firstly 
to make a copy of each separate part 
of the electoral roll together with the 
copy of the notice in Form 3 available 
for inspection at a specified  place, 
accessible to the public and in  or 
near the area to which that part re­
lates; and, secondly, give such  fur­
ther publicity to that notice in Form 
3 as he—̂the Electoral  Registration 
Officer—may think..............  .

Shii Kamath; On a jwint of order; 
I am sure, you will agree that when 
we are discussing an important elec­
tion law, we must have a quorum in 
the House.



6i83 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBEtR 1956 Representation of the 
People  (Preparâon 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

61̂4

Mr. Deputy-Speaker:  Certainly,  I
was taken by surprise  by the tone 
and language.  At first I anticipated 
that it was about quorum and  then 
when  I heard,  ‘I would  agree’,  I 
thought it was something else. (In­
terruption).  I am having the  bell 
rung.—̂ Now, there is quorum.  Shri 

Sadhan Gupta may proceed.

Shri Sadhan Gopta: I was submit­
ting that the two modes of publicity 
which are provided are  inadequate. 
Firstly, making copies  available for 
inspection by the public in  a  place 
nearabout the area to which the part 
relates and,  secondly, such further 
publicity as the Electoral Registration 
Officer may consider necessary.  This 

kind of publicity does not provide for 
the inclusion of the names of those 
wno are unable to read the electoral 
rolls or who find it difficult  or who, 
due to ignorance, do not come to the 
place where the roll can be inspected 
and ascertain whether  their names 
are included in the rolls.  We must 
make an effort to include the names 
of all those persons in the rolls  to 
confer  the  franchise  and ' not  to 
deprive the ignorant or, perhaps, the 
lethargic or those who otherwise find 
it difficult to enquire and take steps 
for the purpose of getting their names 
included in the electoral roll.

What would be the best  way  of 
publicity and the best way of ensur­
ing that the names are included in 
the electoral rolls?  We cannot leave 
it  to  the  bureaucratic  machinery 
alone.  There might be good enume­
rators; there might be bad enumera­
tors.  We  have  had  plenty  of 
examples of enumerators not going to 
the houses at all or just paying  a 
perfunctory visit and not caring  to 
verify how many people there were 
in the house and enumerating only 
those people whom they found in the 
houses  and  not  taking  notice  of 
others.  It may even be that the en­
umerator does not find it possible to 
visit every house more than once or 
twice and in all those visits he n̂ y 
miss certain persons.  To remedy all 
these, it is necessary that organisa­

tions who volimteer to assist in thf 
preparation of the electoral rolls, or­
ganisations who volunteer  to bring 
forward claims on behalf  of other 
persons, those organisations have fr«̂ 
scope.

By amendment No. 1, I have sug­
gested that for  this  purpose  two 
copies of each separate part of  the 
electoral roll should be supplied  to 
every political party  to which  an 
election symbol has been allotted by 
the Election Commission or to a re­
presentative of any such party who is 
authorised to  receive the  same.  I 
would prefer Shri Basu’s amendment 
which goes further and suggests that 
other organisations, in the discretion 
of the Election Commission, may also 
be given copies of the electoral rolls. 
For instance, there may be a club in 
a village which is concerned with all 
kinds of activities  in the  village, 
social and other activities, which in­
cludes the activity of facilitating the 
inclusion of the names of  electors 
from the village in the electoral rolls. 
So, in the discretion of the Election 
Commission, such an organisation may 
be provided with a free copy.  But, 
it is absolutely essential that politi­
cal parties to which electicwi symbols 
have been allotted and who, there­
fore, necessarily command the  sup­
port of huge  masses of the  people 

should have a copy of the electoral 
roll and should be enabled to verify 
its correctness.

Today the electoral rolls are avail­
able for inspection in post offices or 
in police stations or in such other ‘ 
places.  If representatives of any or- 
gemisation including  political parties 
want to verify the correctness, what 
they have to do is to go there  and 
glance through the  rolls and make 
notes and then come to the differ­
ent houses and verify, which is an 
impossible  matter.  You  cannot 
possibly take notes of the entire elec­
toral roll and verify the correctness 
of it  On the other hand, if a copy of 
the draft rolls, or two copies of the 
draft rolls better still,  are provided 
to them free of  charge,  then,  thcar



<>i85 Motions re. 7 SEFraPMOBSR 1956 Representation of

People  (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

6ig%

[Shri Sadhan Gupta]

can take the draft rolls from house 
to house—divide a part of the rolls 
between their  volunteers and  ask 
them to—̂ o from house to house and 
thereby verify the accuracy of  the 
draft rolls.  They will be in a much 
better position to verify because  the 
volunteers  would  be  men  of  the 
locality and that way  they would 
succeed in verifying the  correctness 
much  better than  any enumerator. 
Therefore, this furnishing  copies  of 
the draft rolls is  a very  essential 
matter for the purpose of the accurate 
registration of the electors.

4 P.M.

The next two amendments which I 
propose are in respect of sub-rules
(1)  and (2) of Rule 26.  In 26(1) it 
is provided tkat every ,  application 
under sub-section  (1)  of section 23 
shall be made in duplicate in Form 4 
(Part I)  and shall be accompanied, 
when  it is to the  Chief Electoral 
Officer, by a fee of Rs. 10/- and when 
it is to the  Electoral. Registration 
Officer, by a fee of Re. 1/-.  Ours is 
a poor country.  What section 23 aims 
at is to enable the electors to be re­
gistered who have not succeeded in 
getting themselves registered  during 
the time when the electoral roll was 
imder preparation.  It is a very im­
portant section because it  enables 
those, electors who have been omit­
ted, to exercise their franchise.  You 
know that  in  a country  like  the 
U.S.S.R. the rule is that even the day 
before the election, a person is  en­
titled to get himself registered and to 
exercise  his  franchise.  Therefore, 
section 23 is a very important one, 
but it loses its utility to a consider­
able extent by providing a very high 
fee for registration.  It  is  said that 
when a notification for an election is 
given in a constituency, the applica­
tion is to be made to*the Chief Elec­
toral Officer, and for such an appli­
cation the fee is Rs. 10/-.  How many 
electors can pay Rs. 10/- and get them- 
««ives registered?  Yet in our coun- 
tTT the urg*.*  for  r̂istration  will 
BjttiiraUy come when a notification is

issued.  I have, therefore,  tried  to 
reduce this sum of Rs. 10/- to Rs. 2/-. 

The Report of the Committee on Sub­
ordinate  Legislation  says  that  it 
should be reduced to Rs. 5/-, but the 
reasons they give lend greater sup­
port to a reduction further.  Person­
ally I think there is no reason to keep 
any fee at all, but if you want  to 
keep a fee, let it be Rs. 2/-, and not 
more.

Shri Pataskar;  I am  prepared to 
accept the suggestion  of the  Com­
mittee, that is, I accept the  fee  of 
Rs. 5/.. *

Shri Sadlian Gnpta: That is some 
thing.

Shri  K.  K.  Basa:  Some  small
mercy.

Shri Sadlian Gapta: The next thing 
is regarding the  application to  the 
Electoral  Registration Officer.  That 
application is to be made when  no 
notification is issued for election from 
that constituency.  In that case  the 
charge is Re. 1/-. It is hard on people 
in our coimtry to pay Re. 1/-. I have 
suggested-  four  annas,  that  is,  a 
nominal charge, even that to distin­
guish it from the ordinary preparation 
of the rolls.  Let those who have not 
succeeded in getting ̂themselves  re­
gistered on the rolls when they were 
under preparation  pay four  annas, 
but let them not have to pay more 
because in that way  many  people 
might be excluded.  I think the Com­
mittee on Subordinate Legislation has 
recommended  eight annas, and  the 
reasons they give would apply  with 
greater force to lour annas.  I do not 
know  whether  the  Minister  will 
accept it But in the interests of demo­
cracy, that should be accepted. Re. 1/­
is too high for most people in  our 
country to register,  considering  the 
fact that in many cases whole fami­
lies may  have to register  and the 
price  to be paid will be probably 
quite a number of rupees; if there are 
ûr people, it will be Rs. 4/-; if there 
are more, it will be more rupees.  So, 
it is absolutely necessary  that this



6i87 Motifms re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 
People (Preparation 
9f Electoral Rolls) 

Mules

6188

iee should be reduced to a nominal 
amount and the registration  should 

be facilitated.

I commend these  amendments  to 
the acceptance of the House, and  I   ̂
also support tiie other  amendments 
which have been moved, particularly, 
the amendment for the grant of copies 
of the electoral rolls to candidates.
We know that one of the greatest 

difficulties of candidates  at a parlia­
mentary election is the fact that the 
price of the rolls is prohibitive.  If 
you want the functioning of  demo­
cracy, you should not place all these 
clogi in the way of a candidate for 
Parliament  The greatest difficulty is 
to procure the rolls.  I know  that 
during the last general elections there 
were manŷ candidates to Parliament, 
at least from \our party, who could 
not afford even to buy a copy of the 
electoral rolls and had to fight the 
election  without  one.  That  is  a 
scandalous state of affairs and  that 
should not be  permitted.  Sufficient 
number of rolls ought to be granted 
free to the candidates, and the candi­
dates should be allowed to buy fur­
ther numbers of rolls, if they require, 
at a concessional price.

Shri K. K. Basu:  I have moved a

number of amendments to the Repre­
sentation of the People  (Preparation 

of Electoral Rolls) Rules, as amended 

this year.  We all know  that in our 
country we had a unique experience 
of parliamentary democracy fimction- 
ing,  with  possibly  the  largest 

number of voters in one State.  Even 
in the first election we had a  novel 
experience, for  which I  think  the 
common  man  of  India should  be 
congratulated, and every  section  of 
the people must feel proud of the way 
in  which  they  exercised  their 
franchise.  We feel that if we want to 
make our parliamentary  democracy 
function properly and quite in conson­
ance with the desires of ttie common 
man, it should be our  effort to  see 

that the voters’ list should be  made 
as fool-proof as possible and it should 
be our endeavour to find out and  to 
lielp every  citizen of  India to  be

enrolled as a voter.  The duty of the 
Government  and  the  election 
machinery which is set up to prepare 

the voters* list is that they should see 
that no citzen eligible to vote is left 

out of the  list  so  that  he cannot 
exercise his franchise at the time  of 
the election.  Therefore, I have tried 
to move these amendments  in  the 
spirit and  with  the idea  that  we 

should improve the preparation of the 
electoral roUs in such a way that  it 

will help the growth and functioning 
of the  democratic  system  that  is 
prevailing in this country.

I have moved amendnJent No. 4 In 
list No. 2 in respect of rule 2 of  the 

Representation  of  the  People 
(Preparation  of  Electoral  Rolls) 

Rules, laid before the House.  Herf I 
seek  to  move  an  amendment  in 
respect of the definition  of Revising 

Authority.  Under the old Rules, the 
Revising Authority was to have been 
appointed by the State  Government 

subject to  any  general or  special 
instructions issued by  the Election 

Commissioner in  respect  of  those 
Revising Authorities.  Unfortimately. 
in the Rules  that  have  now  been 
enacted, the Revising  Authority has 

been defined  as  “such person as  ■ 

State Government or  any  authority 

authorised by the State Government 
in this behalf may appoint as Revising 
Authority”.  We know that in respect 
of State Electoral  Officers, in  most 

cases if not in all cases, they are part­
time officers; they  are  either  Joint 
Secretaries or Deputy Secretaries  of 

the State Governments and they are, 
in addition, doing the function of the 
Chief Electoral Officer.  So, they are 
largely under  the  influence of  the 
Government of the particular  State. 
When we have in this country parlia­
mentary  democracy,  naturally  one 
party may form a government  in  a 

particular State and there are bound 
to be large parties in opposition  ^o 
niay not see eye to eye with the party 
government.  We know full well  in 

this  form  of  government  the 
ministerial party can largely influence 

the bureaucratic  machinery  or  th«



6i89 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 
People  (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

6190

[Shri K. K. Basu] 

permanent  administration  of  the 
particular State. Therefore, I feel that 

it should be our duty to see that  no 
person or no party should feel  that 

in the case of revising the rolls of  a 

particular constituency,  there should 

be scope  for  doubts,  scope  for 
mistrust and scope for suspicion.  I 

do not say that all the Chief Electoral 
Officers as such will succumb  to  the 
influences or other forms of indirect 

pressure of the party government of a 
particular State.  My amendment says 
that this Revising  Authority should 

not be an executive officer, because I 
 ̂know that in  some  of  the  States, 
Deputy  Magistrates  or  men  of  a 
similar rank are often appointed  as 

Revising Authorities.  These persons 
are in day to  day  touch  with  the 
party that runs the administration or 

forms the government of  the  parti­
cular State.  They are susceptible  to 

the pressure of tiie party in  power. 
So, I  have  sought  to  put  in a 
qualifying clause at the end of rule 

2(c) that he should be a judicial  or 
semi-judicial  officer  and  not  an 

executive officer,  I am fully alive t4> 
the difficulties.  If all of them are to 
be judicial officers, it may be difficult 
from the administrative point of view 

to release so many  officers.  So,  I 
have  included  the  quasi-judicial 
officers.  But, I have made it specific 
that it should not be  an  executive 
officer.  In some  States,  there  are * 
persons  like  the  sub-registrar  of 
assurances or officers in the co-oi>era- 
tive department and they are not  so 
much connected with executive work 
as the sub-divisional officers  or  Jie 
taluk officers, or whatever they may 
be called.  So, I want the Government 
to appoint  such  judicial  or quaai- 

judicial officers and not the executive 
officers.  If munsifs, and other judicial 
officers  a;e  not  available  in large 

numbers,  the  other  quasi-judicial 
officers who  may  not  directly  be 
connected with the Government may 

be appointed.  ,

I have also tried to incorporate the 
provision that was there  in  the old

Act.  I have tried to move an amend­
ment here which reads:  “subject  to 
the approval of the Election Commis­

sioner.”  As it reads: “subject to the 
general  and  special  instruction...”. 
The Election Commissioner is a consti­
tutional authority outside the influence 
of the party in power.  I do not want 

the appointment should be left com­
pletely to the Government machinery. 

All these should be subject  to  the 
approval of the  Election  Commis­
sioner.  It will help him to see that 
they are outside the influence of the 
party in power,  I hope the Govern­
ment will  accept  this  amendment 

about the definition of the expression, 
*revising authority’.

Rule 6 deals with the manner  in 
which the rolls  are to be prepared 
and published.  The  electoral rolls 
shall be arranged  according to  the 

house  numbers, unless  the  Chief 
Electoral Officer, subject to any gene­
ral or special instructions issued by 
the Election Commission,  determines 
in respect of any part that the alpha­
betical order is more convenient  or 
that the names  shall  be  arranged 
partly, in one way and partly in the 
other.  That is my amendment. I wish 
all  these  rolls  to  be  prepared 
according to the house numbers.  I 
had to do a good deal of election work 
on behalf of my party and so,  from 

personal  experience, I  know  that, 
despite the directive of the  Election 
Commissioner, some State  Electoral 
Officers took a different view.  They 
have said that they had  a  different 
form and that they did not want  to 

deviate from it; they also  said  ti.at 
there were not numbers on  houses. 
Because of the union or board tax or 
cess or the panchayat tax that may be 
coming in almost all the States every 
hut in India has some mark  Even at 
the time of the census, every house is 
given some mark and it is not at  all 

difficult from the administrative point 
of view to prepare rolls like that.

Otherwise, what happens in ttie 
rural areas? In one hut, a husband 
and his adult son is living.  If thv



6i9I Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 6192

People P̂reparation 
of Electoral Rolls)

Rules

very  much  against  the  proper 
functioning of the election machinery. 
This should not be allowed.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: The  hon.

Member has eleven amendments.

Shri K. K. Basa: I can go rapidly

but the Government will not hear me.

rolls are prepared according  to  the 

alphabetical order, they are allotted a 
particular  polling  booth.  It  may 

happen that his  wife  or  widowed 

grandmother or sister or some women 
members of the family are allotted  a 
different booth, one  or  two  miles 
away.  It is very difficult for a woman 

of our country in rural areas to go to 
distant places of their own accord, to 
places where their menfolk do  not 

go to vote.  Therefore, large sections 
of our people do not exercise  their 
franchise.  It happened last time. So, 

the rolls should be prepared according 
to the house number.  If, in a special 
case, the Election Commissioner  has 

reasons to deviate from this practice, 

the reasons should be  recorded  in 
writing.  I want them to be recorded 
for this reason.  We have to deal with 
the chief electoral officers who  are 

mostly State officials and we have  a 
feeling that they are some what under 

the influence and  pressure  of  the 
Government.  They do not  disclose 
real facts.  We get an impression from 

the discussion that we have îth  the 

Election Commissioner here but when 
We go to the Stat6, the officials there 

raise some  administrative  problem, 
this and  that  which,  according  to 
them,  could not be solved.  So,  in 

these special cases, the Election Com- 
missioener, for reasons  recorded  in 
writing, may allow  in  a  particular 
State the electoral rolls to be prepared 
in some other form than according to 
the house numbers, say alphabetical­
ly, etc.

I am very much opposed to the last 
clause or part of the rule which says 
that the names  shall  be  arranged 
partly in one way and partly  in the 
other.  This should not be  allowed. 
The roll of a particular constituency 
should be only in  one way.  There 

may be urban and rural areas in one 
constituency itself and in the case of 
towns there may be one form and in 

the case of villages, there may be  a 
different form.  That is what they say. 
This argument may have some force. 

But, the balance of advantage is not 
in this mixed arrangement  It works

Rule 10 deals with the publication 
of the draft electoral rolls.  There is 
one amendment to rule 11 by my hon. 

friend  about  the  issue  of  draft 

electoral  rolls  free  to  recognised 
parties and other important  institu­
tions.  Sir, you are a leader  of  a 
particular party.  You know full ŵ?U 
that the bureaucratic machinery can 

never  make  a  fuU  and  complete 
electoral roll. They appoint temporary 
persons; they appoint part-time people 
who may be working in villages  or 
some where  else.  Even in  urban 
areas, they appoint officers who work 
for two or three hours to take  these 
lists.  When  they go to a particular 
place in the morning, the man might 
have gone  out.  In  my  State, the 
names of MLAs of certain areas have 
been omitted.  The name  of a sitting 

Member  of  Parliament  was  not 
included in a State simply because he 
was not in his  house,  but in Delhi 
attending  the  Parliament  session, 

when the  officer went to his house. 
The  Election  Commissioner  issued 
some directives to improve upon this 
sort of a position.  The provision here 
reads: “..at such places in the con­

stituency as may be specified by him 
for the purpose___”.  This is a discre­
tionary power and it has often been 
misused. I know of a specific instance 

in a rural area in the 24 Parganas. 
There, a notification issued and people 
went to the union board president’s 

office.  Inspite of the best efforts  of 
the villagers, they did not have access 
to that.  The president of that union 

board was asked to put up the list in 
respect of that particular area.  Quite 

a good number of eligible voters had 
been in attendance at the office of the 
union board.  Everytime the president 
has been saying that he has got  the 
electoral roll but he never puts It or



6i93 Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the

People  (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rulct

6194.

[Sbri K. K. Basu] 

hangs it publicly.  It is with me,  he 
says; for weeks he said like that.  It 

is impossible for th jse persons to walk 
one mile or two miles every day and 

dance attendance on such persons to 
check up the list.

Therefore, my  suggestion is  that 

every party and every important non­
official organisation should be given a 

copy free.  I gave some examples  of 
such non-official organisations.  There 

may be a village organisation like the 
Palli Mangal Samithi that we have in 
our parts.  I am sure there must  be 
such organisations in all parts of India. 

There  may  be  what  is  called 
“Gramodyoga Samithi”.  Whatever it 

may be, I am sure there must be such 
organisations who are interested  in 
working  among  the  rural  people. 
Even in towns  or  industrial  areas 

there may be trade unions or kisan 

samithis or similar popular organisa­
tions.  It must be left to the discre­
tionary power of the Election Com­

mission to find out whether a parti­
cular organisation can be relied upon 

and then to give a  free copy to  it. 
Each recognised  political  party  to 
which symbols are granted  must be 
given the drsift rolls free, because  it 
is in their interest to see whether any 
names have been left out.  If we want 

to see  that  the  right  to  vote  is 
effective, then it is absolutely neces­
sary that every, political party is given 
i a copy free.  I do not know what the 

attitude of the Government on  this 
matter is.  In the conference that we 
had with the. Election Commissioner 

we tried to impress this point.

Shri Pataskar:  May I just interrupt 

the  hon.  Member?  I  asked  the 
Draftsman to draft  an  dinendment

accepting this point. We will put  it
thus: “supply free of cost two copies 
of each separate part of the electoral 
roll to every political party to which 

a symbol has been  allotted by  the 
Election Commissioner"'.  I think  in 

substance he means the same thing.

Shri K. K. Basn:  llien I do not
want to dilate that point.  But one

thing I will request and that is about 

the publicity.  The rolls must be hun̂ 

at a public place like the local  post 
office or the police station.  As I cited 

an example, it is himg up at the office 
or the house of the president of the 

Union Board.  He may be interested 
in the future election and he tries  to- 

unnecessarily  give  trou'ble to  real 
eligible voters by not allbwî  them 
to see the lists.  Therefore, I would 

urge upon the Government to see that 
these are hung up at the local  post 

office or police station, or at any other 

public place where an ordinary citizen 
can go and find out whether his name 

appears there.

Sir, I am very glad that the hon. 
Minister has accepted the proposition 
in respecl of  issuing free  electoral 

rolls.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: Now the other 
amendments  may  be  êft  to  his 

colleagues to deal with.

Shri KL K. Basu:  I will finish very 
soon, Sir; I hardly find anybody l̂re. 

Then, in respect of applications to be 
made for revision of the rolls, I have 
suggested that 21 days is too short a 
period.  Though I know that even  if 

there are small powers they  go  on 
expanding them, I think as a rule  it 
should be six weeks, that is 42 days. 
This much time  should be  allowed 

within which application for revision 
can be made.

In respect of enquiry, Sir, I  have 
made one suggestion; of course, if the 
hon. Minister thinks that it cannot be 
put in the rules, then I suggest  that 
it can be  done  through  executive 
action.  In respect of enquiries to find 
out  whether  eligible  voters  are 
entitled to become voters, the system 
nowadays is to hold these enqtiiries 
at the taluk headquarters or, in most 
cases, the sub-divisional headquarters. 
For example I will take the case  of 
my constituency.  There are parts  of 
my constituency which ftre nearly 24 
miles away from the  sub-divisional 
headquarters.  One has to go on foot.



6195 MotUnis re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 RepreseTitztion of the
People  (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

619S

go in a bus by boat or by any other 
conveyance  available,  for  such 

enquiries.  In these cases it is  very 
difficult for the ordinary voters.  We 
know the poverty in our country and 
we know it will be very difficult  for 
an ordinary citizen to spend Rs. 5  or 
Rs. 10 to get himself enrolled as  a 

voter.  It is due to the failure of the 
Government that  his  name is  not 

there.  Therefore, I would suggest  to 
the Government that efforts should be 
made, if it is not possible to make  a 

provision in the rules themselves  at 
least through the executive machinery 

and executive  directives  should  be 
issued that all these enquiries should 

be held within one mile or two miles 
from the  place  where  the  .voter 
resides.  Taluk or smaller imits may 
be taken for this purpose.  It is not 

necessary that these  should be done 

by big officials.  Also, in the course 
of their circuits these officers can hold 

these enquiries.  I hope the Govern­
ment will keep this in mind.

Lastly, there is one very important 
amendment to which even the Com­

mittee on Subordinate Legislation has 
fully given its support. I also find that 
there a number of aipendments  on 
this point moved by my hon. friend 
over there.  I must  thank the  hon. 

Minister for reducing the fees.  I hope 
the fee of Rs. 5 applies to both  the 

cases.

Shri Pataskar:  Yes, to both  the
cases.

Shri K. K. Basu: I am very glad. 
Then I come to the  last motion iand 
that is with regard to the supply  of 
copies free of cost to the candidates. 
My friend Shri Sadhan Gupta has also 
stressed that point  I am told, during 
the last elections—Shri S. S. More was 
telling us—in the Bombay State each 
candidate got the copies  at  conces­
sional rates.  Otherwise, especially if 

it is a double-member  constituency, 
with one electoral  roll  it  will  be 

nearly impossible  for  any  person, 

unless he has tons of money to  buv 
copies, to conduct the election.  If you 

compare the reimbursement that the

Government gets for the  investment 

that it makes in the preparation of the 
electoral  rolls,  it  is  practically 
negligible.  I am told in some of the 

States heaps of electoral rolls  were 
lying waste because nobody could bur 
at the price at which they were sold. 
Had the prices been reduced, certaiiHy 

a large number of prospective candi­
dates  would  hav̂  bought  them̂ 
Therefore, I urge upon the Minister to 
at least accept this amendment. When 
we requested the Election  Commis­
sioner he said that it is left to  the 

Minister to do it  Each  candidate 
should be given two copies  free  of 
cost and a certain number of copies at 
concessional rates.  I hope the  hon. 

Minister will agree to this and also ' 

issue proper  directives to the States 
concerned.

Shri Bamachandra Beddi (Nellore):: 
Sir, I have only a very few observa­
tions and suggestions to make with 
regard to these rules. In rule 4 it is 
provided that the electoral rolls for 
each constituency shall be prepared 
“in such form and in such language or 
languages as the Election Conunission 
may direct”. It so happens in certain 
places that the electoral rolls—I mean 
esi>ecially in the bilingual areas—are 
prints and made up-to-date only in 
one language and the other language 
is usually  neglected for the simple 
reason that the people of that language 
are not very much vocal. Recently we 
have  heard  in  the  by-election  in 
Bellary that the  electoral rolls in 
Kannada were readily available and 
up-to-date, but the electoral rolls in 
Telugu  were  not  made  available. 
Therefore, we would suggest that the 
Election Commission may be directed 
to get ready electoral rolls in both the 
languages  in a bilingual area  and 
make them up-to-date.

In rule 26 provision is made for the 
registration  on payment of  certain 
fees. I think there is some concession 
shown by the hon. Minister for Legal 
Affairs and some reduction is thought 
of. It is to be noticed, in sub-clause
(2)  of rule 26 it is said that the fees 
specified in sub-clause  (1) shall be'



•6i97 Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the
People  {Preparation 

of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules

6198

[Shri Ramachandra Reddi] 

paid by means of non-judicial stamps. 
This is a matter which requires some 
attention.  Non-judicial  stamps  are 
available either at the  premises of
civil courts or the registration offices, 
and the registration offices will not be 

very many; for each group of 15 to 20 
villages there will be a registration 
office and men have to go a long dis­
tance to obtain a non-judicial stamp. 
If there is any other method possible 
to get the registration by payment of 
ihe necessary money, not necessarily 
by non-judicial stamps, it would have 
to be considered. I would suggest, that 
in each village where there is a Village 
, Officer, or there is a panchayat where 
there is an executive officer, certain 
receipts and application forms might 
l>e kept ready with them so that they 
■can take the necessary registration fee 
and  issue a receipt, and with  the 
receipt the application will be sub­
mitted  to  the  authority  concerned. 
That will, to a large extent̂ cease 
ôwn the difficulty of securing non­
judicial stamps, and if they do not get 
it readily they will naturally forego 
the opportunity of being an elector.

Then, the printing of electoral rolls 
in several cases is not done correctly. 

It is often noticed that in the column 
of the female, the male is entered and 
in the column of the male the female 
is entered.  It so happens sometimes 
that  in  the  column  of  the  female 
there  will  be  a  male’s  name 
and  in  the  column  of  the  hus­
band there will be the wife’s name. 
That makes a very difficult position, 
with the result that there can be an 
objection raised while giving voting 
papers to such voters because there is 
-an error in printing.  For that, the 
voters should not be penalised.

It is also seen that in certain cases 
the names of dead persons are noted 
down in the electoral rolls and also 
the fact that he is dead is entered 
there. I do not know why a  dead 
person should be noted there and also 
mentioned as dead.  It is, therefore, 
tiecessary that in tho preparation of

these  electoral rolls, more  care is 
bestowed and more attention paid in 
the matter of correct noting of the 
names in the several columns.

As regards the supply of the elec­
toral rolls, I also agree with' the other 
Members who preceded me in sug­
gesting that the price of the electoral 
rolls should be reduced. Especially, in 
double-member  constituencies  for 
Parliament the electoral roll will be 
a very huge bundle and the cost of 

it would be prohibitive. In the case 
of  double-member  constituencies, 
where the Scheduled Caste candidates 
are poor, some concession would be 
given to them, but, instead of making 
concessions to oniy one commxmity, it 
is much better that the electoral rolls 
are given at a concession rate at least 
to those people who are found in the 
final valid list of candidates.

The hon. Minister was saying that 
copies of the electoral rolls will be 
given to political parties. There might 
be people who do not belong to any 
political party and they may stand as 
independents.  So, the same kind of 
facility as is given  to the political 
parties should.be given to such of the 
candidates as are standing  for  the
election or contesting the election as 
independents, once a symbol has been 
granted to them.

With regard to the printing of the 
electoral rolls, I have got smother sug­
gestion to make. It is this.  Let the 
rolls be printed only on one side of 
the page and not on either side. If it 
is printed only on one side, it is easily 
detachable  and distributable  to  the
several workers on behalf of the candi­
dates  or  of  the  political  parties. 
Otherwise, since the electoral rolls are 
very costly, manuscripts will have to 
be made ready and that will not only 
entail cost and extra labour but also 
delay.  If  the electoral  rolls  are
printed on  only  one side and  if the
cost is also reduced, there will be a 
larger number of copies sold and the 
Government would not be incurring 
much loss.



6i99 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of 
People  (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Allies

6200

Further, when the  Government is 
the direct purchaser of the stationery 
for this purpose of printing the elec­
toral rolls, the electoral rolls need not 
necessarily be very costly, because the 
paper that is required for the printing 
of electoral rolls can be easily secured 
by the Government  direct and the 
other charges that will accrue if they 
are sold by the  wholesaler or the 
retailer, can be avoided.

Another suggestion I would make is 
this.  While printing these electoral 
rolls, they may be printed separately 
for each village or each ward in a 
municipality, so that it would be easy 
for  the  distribution  purposes  after 
detachment of the particular lists, and 
it would facilitate speedy movement 
and canvassing.

These are the few suggestions that 
I wanted to make.

Shri  Shree Narayan  Das: Mr.
Deputy Speaker, Sir, I am one of those 
who feel that in the elections money 
should not count at any stage of the 
elections.  Either  in  the  matter  of 
enrolment or in the matter of other 
expenditure, money  should not play 
any important part in the elections.

Firstly, I  would request  the hon. 
Minister to see that it is the duty of 
the Government  to see that every 
qualified person is enrolled as elector. 
If any names are left out, then also, 
it is the duty of the State to see that 
every facility is given to those whose 
names have been left out for having 
their names enrolled. I see from the 
rules that when a person’s name is 
not in the draft electoral roll that is 
initially published,  that person will 
have to apply. At that stage also, it 
is the duty of the Government to see 
that tresh efforts  are made by the 
election machinery for  getting those 
persons enrolled.

In  the  case  of  those  persons 
whose names have been left out, I 
think  the revising authority should 
go to the area concerned and find out 
from where the applications for in­
clusion of the names have been made. 
Generally it is seen that those who

apply for enrolment or for the inclu­
sion of their names are asked to come 
from  their  villages  to  the  sub- 
divisional headquarters and not eveit 
to the thana headquarters.  This will 
cost much. Therefore, it is the duty of 
the Government to send the revising 
authorities to the places of the appli­
cants  and see that the names  are 

enrolled.

As has been suggested by my hon. 
friend,  Shri K. K. Basu,  provisicais 
to this effect are included in the rules 
and if it is not possible for them ta. 
do so, the Election Commission should 
issue instructions to the Chief 13ec- 
tion Officers or the electoral r̂ ŝtra- 

tion officers to see that no applicant 
is asked to come for more than twa 
miles to present his case to the revis-

•  ing authority.

Next, I should  say that i)0  fee 
should be charged at any stage  As is 
provided in section  23  of  the Act, 
when the notification about the elec­
tions is issued, and if anyone find.s 
that his name has been left out and 
desires that his name be included in 
the rolls, he wiH have to apply to the 
Chief Electoral  Officer and he wilt 
have to pay Rs. 10. When the Govern­
ment fails to enrol his name, or when 
the election machinery fails to enrol 
his name, why should that person be 
asked to pay a sum?  It is sufficient 
that he has found out that his name 
has not been included in the rolls, and 
if he files an application with the Chief 
Electoral Officer that his name shoulc 
be included, and if he is otherwise 

qualified, his name should be enrolled 
without any fee for this purpose.

I heard that this svim has since been 
reduced to Rs. 5. It is good. But then,
I .think that is not also just.  Why 
should a person be punished for the 
non-inclusion of his name in tlie rolls?
It may be that a person might not 
have been present at the place when 
the election staff enrolled the voters.
If he was not present, why should he 
be punished for that? It is not fair 
a person  should be punished if hw 
name has been left out because he has-



2̂01  Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of th« 6202

People  (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls)

Rules
[Shri Shree Narayan Das]

-not been alert at the time of ttie pre­
paration of the electoral rolls or at 

the time when the draft rolls were 
published. Why should a poor man be 
punished?  He  might  have  had  no 
money at that time. Why shouJd the 
facility of getting his name enrolled 
be denied to him for his being poor, 
and why should that facility of enrol­
ling names be given to the rich men 
b̂ecause the rich men have got money? 
Because a person is poor, he should 
.not be punished. We should see that 
equal  opportunity is given to all at 
least in the matter of elections.  I 
think the directive principles of the 
‘Constitution should be adhered to by 
the Government.  No person, if he is 
entitled to or is  qualified to vote, 
should be penalised at any stage.

In my own  constituency, in some 
villages, I found that some names had 
been left out from the electoral roPs. 
I asked  them to get their  names 
enrolled. They said that everyone of 
them would have to pay Re. 1 and 

"that it was not  possible  for  them 
to pay. I humbly request and appeal 
to the hon. Minister that at no stage 
before the election should any person 
be asked to pay anything, except that 
he should be required to put m an 
application. It is the duty uf the Gov­
ernment to see that his name is there 
in the electoral list; but, if his name 
is left out, it is sufficient that he comes 
■forward and applies to th<» pro.scribud 
authority for the  registration of his 
name. I hope the hon. Minister will 
consider this matter favourably and 
see that this provision  for the pay­
ment of money is deleted.

With regard to the supply of elec­
toral rolls, as has been pointed out 
bv some hon. friends, it Is the duty 
the Government to supply them 

xiec'iy. There may be persons who can 
afford to buy himdreds of copies, but 
there are also per̂ ns who find it very 
difficult to find Rs. 25 or Rs. 50 to bay 
a copy 01  the electoral  roils.  Last 
time for a parliamentary constituency 
in the State of Bihar, the pries of a 
•copy was fixed at Rs. 50 and it was

impossible for some person? to pur­
chase it.  Therefore, at least 5 copies 
should be given free to every contest­

ing  candidate.  If  any  c:aiididate 
requires more than 5 copies, a small 
fee should be charged.  I heard that 
last time 6 copies were supplied r̂ee 
to every contesting candidate in the 
State of Bombay. That method should 
be followed by other States also and 
at least 5 copies Should be supplied 
free.

With regard to the publication of 
notifications etc. in the newspapers, I 
do not think more than 5 per cent, of 
our people read newspapers. So. every 
notification should be published iii the 
form of small leaflets and distributed 
throughout the area, so that it may 
reach  every  village.  At  least  such 
persons who can read will tell tlieir 
friends that such and such notifica­
tion has been issued. So, publication 
in the newspapers or even in the post 
offices is no good.  When the draft 
electoral rolls are published, it should 

be  notified  through  small  leafiets. 
After all, it will not cost much to the 
Government and everybody will know 
whether his name has been included 
or not

I oppose the amendment that instead 
of executive officers, judicial officer.̂ 
should be entrusted with the task of 
revision, instead of executive officers 
appointed by the Gk>vemment. I think 
executive officers will do, because they 
come into contact  with the people 
daily.

As far as the period prescribed is 
concerned, I think if not six weeks, 
at least a month should be  given 
within  which those persons  whose 
names have been left out should apply 
lor the inclusion of their names.

I do not know about other States, 
but in the State of Bihar, the names 
have not been entered in the alpha­
betical order, but  according to the 
number of the houses. Some numbers 
were given at the time the census was 
taken  and  people  do  not  know 
whether it is the same number here



6203 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 
People (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

620

also or whether some other procedure 
has been followed.  Whatever proce­
dure  is  followed  in  this  regard 

should  be  announced  clearly,  so 
that the people  may know what it 
is. Otherwise, at the time of the elec­
tion even the parties will not be able 
to find out the names easily from the 
electoral rolls, unless they are told in 
tmie that the number has been given 
in this way or that way. Therefore, 
this difficulty should be removed.

In conclusion, I would again em­
phasise my amendment that  if any 
names have been left out, no money 
should be charged from any person 
who applies for the inclusion of his 
name, because it is the duty of the 
Government to include all the names 
and for the failure of the Govern­
ment those persons  whose  names 
have been  left out  should not be 
penalised.  No fees should be charg­
ed at any stage, either after the noti­
fication is issued or after the applica­
tion is sent to the chief electoral offi­
cer for the enrolment of nsmies that 
have been left out.  I think the Gov­
ernment will consider this  matter 
favourably.  Reducing the fee  from 
Rs. 10 to Rs. 5 is not  sufficient;  it 
should be removed altogether, so that 
at least in matters of election, money 
will not count and all people, whether 
rich or poor, will have equal oppor­
tunities.  There was a suggestion in 
the Joint Committee and also in this 
House from Mr. More  that  every 
elector should be compelled to vote, 
as is the practice in some countries. 
When we think of  making  voting 
compulsory whether it is proper that 
in cases where names  have  been 
left out of the list, so that  persons 
should have to pay for a fee for in­
clusion  of  their  name.  I  think 
in order to make democracy a success 
in this country and in order to give 
equal opportunities to all, rich and 
poor alike, money should not count at 
least in matters of election.

Shri Dabhi:  I have given amend­
ments Nos. 16, 17, 18, 24 and 25.  I 
shall first take up amendments Nos. 
16 and 17 to rule 8.  If my amend­

ments are accepted, rule 8, as amend­
ed, will read as follows:

“The electoral registration offi­
cer shall, for the purpose of pre­
paring  the electoral roll,  send, 
either  by  registered  post  or 

through the staff employed  for 
the purpose, letters of request in 
Form 2 to the occupants of dwell­
ing houses m the constituency or 
any part thereof; and every per­
son receiving such  letter  shall 
furnish  information  called  for 
therein to the best of his ability.” 

You will see that the present nue 
provides that the list may be sent to 
certain individuals.  I do not under­
stand why only selected individuals 
will be sent such lists.  On the con­
trary, ordinary illiterate people  re­
quire such lists.  You will see that 
the  constant  complaint  about  the 
electoral rolls is that  they  contain 
several material errors.  With all the 
care that is taken to see  that  the 
electoral rolls are correct,  still we 
know that they contain several mate­
rial errors.  In some cases  females 
are mentioned as  males  and vice 
versa.  So we must see that no error 
creeps into it

What is the cause of the  creepmg 
in of these errors?  The cause is this. 
Ordinarily, while in towns and tlties 
the municipal staff like clerks  are 
employed for preparing the rolls, in 
the villages and rural areas the talatis 
or village accountants are employed. 
What happens?  None of them goes 
to the houses of the electorates. They 
prepare the electoral rolls from their 
houses or offices and that is why so 
many errors are found.  Therefore. 1 
suggest that letters in printed forms 
should be sent not only to particular 
individuals but should be sent to all 
the occupants of the house  in  the 
constituencies  concerned.  It is  not 
difficult because  the form is  there 
and the staff can visit the houses with 
the printed forms and then  gather 
information.  There  would  be  no 
difficulty  whatsoever  for  that.  It 
need not be sent through post.  The 
forms can be printed and the  staff



6205 Motions re.

[Shri Dabhi] 

concerned can go and give it to the 

occupants.

I can give the instance in the Bom­

bay State.  There in cities and towns 
electoral rolls have been prepared biy 
visiting  every  house.  There will 
practically be no difficulty for that. 
The difficulty arises only in the rural 
areas.  The talatis do not go to the 
houses of the persons concerned and 
they  make  several mistakes.  The 
only thing they have to do is to visit 

the houses and  then  prepare  the 
electoral rolls.  Because it is not done, 
these mistakes are occurring frequent­
ly.  Of course, it is true that under 
rule 12 any person whose name is not 
entered m the  electoral  roll  can 
lodge  a  complaint.  Again,  under 
rules 12, 22  and  23,  the electoral 
registration officer can suo motu make 
such amendments,  if necessary,  in 
the electoral rolls.  But most of the 
people are illiterate  in the villages 
and you cannot expect them, every­
one of them, to apply for that  So 
the only method, the cheap n̂ethod 
and the safe method to see that all 
electoral rolls are correct  and  no 
material errors have crept  in is to 
accept my amendment  and I think 
there would be no difficulty in accept- 
inĝthis amendment.

Then I come to my amendments 18, 
25 and 24.  All these  three motions 
are alternative amendments  to rule 
33.  Motion No. 25 says that  every 
candidate  should be supplied  with 
four copies of the electoral rolls free 
of cost while my motion No. 2̂' says 
that if not four copies, at least toee 
copies should be supplied free of cost. 
As  my  hon.  friend,  Shri  Shree 
Narayan Das, has stated, there should 
be  no  difficulty  for that.  In the 
Bombay State, during the last elec­
tions, every candidate  whether  he 
was a can̂ date for the State Legis­
lature or for Parliament,  was sup­

plied  with six copies  free  of cost; 
not a single pie was charged.  And 
that too was supplied  without  our 
demand.  So, there would not be any

7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 6206

» People (Preparation 
of Electoral Rolls)

Rules

difficulty in accepting that four copies 
should be given free of cost.  So. I 

would request  you  to  accept  niy 
amendment No. 25 or at least 24. But 
I have moved my amendment No. 18 
for this purpose.  It  may  be  that 

States like Bombay may wish to give 
six copies and if we limit it to four 
copies or three copies, perhaps they 
may also say: why should we supply 
four copies?  Therefore, if the Gov­
ernment are not  going  to  accept 
either of these amendments then at 
least let it be mentioned that if State 
Government  wants  to  supply any 
copies free of cost,  it may  supply. 
Perhaps, it may not be possible for 
all State Governments to supply six 
copies.  These rules are meant for all 
the States.  But if the hon. Minister 
will oblige us, then we are prepared 
to accept six also.  We require msiny 
copies because we have to give one 
copy to the nominee, one copy to the 
agent and we require it for  other 
purposes also.  So, at least four co­
pies  must be supplied.  That is the 
least that every State should supply 
to every candidate.  I hope there will 
be no difficulty in doing so because 

we have the example of the Bombay 
Government which has, as I have iu.«t 
now stated, supplied six copies. So, 
it will not be difficult at all to acc  ̂
my amendment.

Shri Kamath: I >upoort the amend­
ments that have already been moved 
by my hon. friend, Mr.  Basu, and  I 

particularly  refer  to  amendments 
No. 10, 12, 14 and 15, I shall coniine 

my observations to those four amend­
ments only because 1 do not wish to 
take up much of time of the House and 

I would, therefore,  press the points 
that have been incorporated in these 

three or four amendments.

I am glad to leam—I am  sorry I 
was out for a short while, but my 
friend Mr. Basu told me—that  the 
hon. Minister has promised  to give 

sympathetic,  nay,  favourable  consi­
deration to the proposal made In our 

joint amendment No.  14 with regard



4ao7 re.  7 SEPTEMBIE 1956 Representation of the
People  (Preperatipn 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

6208

to  the  reduction  of the fee  from 
Rs. 10/- to Rs. 5/-.  That is good as 

far as it goes.

I will now come to the  other two 

amendments, which are more or less 
of a similar character, amendment Nos.

10 and 15, which relate to the supply 
of copies of  the draft roll and subse­
quently the final roll  to the parties 

concerned.

5 P.M.

Amendment No. 10  relates to  the 
supply of a copy of the draft electoral 
roll to the recognised parties.  I would 
here; like to make it clear that I would 

be very happy indeed if they are sup­
plied not  merely  to  the  recognised 

parties, but also,—if I may use  the 
term—non-recognised  political parties. 
After all, that  is a distinction made . 
by  the  Election  Commission.  We 
should not go strictly by the distmc- 
tion made by the Election Commission. 
There are many  democratic parties.
It is but meet  and  proper that  we 
should continue  to recognise , those 
parties though the  Election Commis­
sion, for reasons best known to them­

selves,  have  made . the  distinction. 
The Government ought  not to make 
such a distinction as regards the sup­
ply  of  electoral rolls.  All parties 
■whether recognised at the provincial 
or all-India level must be given this 
right and accorded this facilities  of 
persuing and scrutining the draft elec­
toral roll, so that the electoral rolls 

could be made up-to-<late  and  eor- 
rect, in the interests of fair and fee 
elections, which are the corner stone, 

the  foundation stone  of a live and 
kicking democracy.

There is another aspect to this mat­
ter which is embodied in  amendment 
No. 15 which proposes  that  every 

contesting candidate  should be sup­
plied free of cost two copies  of  the 
electoral roll and another half a dozen 
copies at a  concession rate,  maybe 

half the price  or one-third  of  the 
price—we have  said  half the  sale 
prTce.  This  is  a matter of detail 
and we may make it one-third if the 
House agrees.  It is said,—our Gov- 
•ernment spokesmen are never ti;red of 
repeating—that we want to make the

elections so free  and  fair  that the 
poorest in the land should be able to 
fight or oppose the richest in the land- 
This, I suppose, I hope and trust,  is 

the ideal that the Government is striv­
ing  to  achieve  or  attain.  That 

reminds me of what a great political 
thinker of England, Harold La ski, in 
his  inimitable  manner  once  said, 
talking of the equality before the law 

of the rich and the poor.  He said it 
is like saying that “the Ritz hotel  in 
London is open  to the rich and the 
poor alike.”  How can the poor man 
go to that; he cannot aftord that.  We 
can similarly say that the Taj in Bom­
bay or the Ambassador Hotel in Delhi 
or the new Asoka Hotel springing up in 
Chanakyapuri is open to the rich and 
the poor alike.  But, I suppose  the 
poor man could not zven have a peep 
into the Hotel.  That is going to be 
the condition of  our democracy  if 
things  do not improve  We  have 
alreay had a lot of discussion during 
the passage of the big Bill, which  is 
now an Act, the Representation of the 
People Act, 1951.  It was not merely 

alleged, but almo.st  substantiated by 
the Opposition that the ruling party is 
busy, overbusy nowadays,  to gamer 
funds, by all means at their disposal, 
by hook or by crook, more bv crook 
than  by  hook,  so  that  the scales 
naturally  will  be tilted  in favour 

of  the  rich  contesting  candi­
dates.  Government always talks of 
sympathy for the Scheduled Castes and 
Scheduled Tribes.  In thla  state of 
affairs, when the ruling party can put 
forth Rs. 10 crores in the field, how 

many Scheduled Castes and Scheduled 
Tribes Candiates of the opposition, not 
joi the ruling  party,—they  will get 
their need  from out  of the Rs. 10 
crores— how many Scheduled Castes 
and Scheduled Tribes candidates and 

the poor  of other castes  and com­
munities also can stand in opposition? 
People whose badge is poverty,  if I 
may use that expression, whose only 
asset before the electorate is  their 
poverty and honesty which often  go 

together  bow  many of  these poor 
candidates ĉn fÛit or dare to fight 
tte  ruling party’s rich  cwdid̂tes, 

unless  of  course, the  el̂ orate is



2̂09 Moticms re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 62i<>
People  (Preperation 

of Electoral Rolls)
Rules

[Shri Kamath] 

educated,  unless  the  electorate  is. 

literate, unless the  electorate is cons­

cious.  Then of course all your money 
begs may not work, will not go a long 
way  because  I myself  had experi­

ence  of this  lately  in some consti­
tuencies and the electorate is conscious 
now,  I am glad to see that.  Their 

votes cannot be purchased by  money. 
We used a slogan very eftectively  in 
some recent by-elections:

That was the slogan used and.......

Mr. Depnty-Speaker:  In the hon.

Member’s constituency?

Shri Kamath:  I will  not specify
constituencies, but that ̂Icgan has been 
used very effectively in many consti- 
tiiencies, and certainly with encourag­
ing  results—encouraging  for  the 

opposition, encouraging for democracy, 

for a true and live democracy which I 
hope and trust the Government also 
IS aspiring to build  in the country.

I am not so sure their desire,  but I 
hope they are trying to do so.  There­
fore, I suggest that as far as possible 
the scales must be even  as between 
the rich and the poor contesting candi­
dates, but I am afraid that»even at the 
very outset, ah initio, the  pitch is 
queered for the candidates.  It is 

very unfortunate that in a poor coun­
try  like  India  with  a  per capita 

income of how much, Sir—I am sorry,
I want  to be enlightened by you—I 
think Rs. 250 per annum, a Candidate 

for a parliamentary constituenc3’' has 
got to pay about Rs. 600 to Rs. 700 
for one copy of the electoral roll, that 
is to say, in Madhya Pradesh.  Hon. 
Member Sardar Saigal is also  well 

aware, but I know he  can  afford to 
pay.

Sarftir A. S. Saigal (Bllaspur): Not 
like you.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker:  Those  who
work the averages do not go in for 
electi(̂ ^

,  Sbri Kamath: I am thankful to you 
for your illuminating observation.  My 

hon. friend  Sardar Saigal  need not 
-worry. His party will, where neces­

sary, come to the aid of their candi* 

dates.

What 1 am pointing out is this.  If 
you want really to make the elections 
free and fair, I doubt if the Govern­
ment wants  to make  the elections 
free and fair  bû assuming  for the 
sake of argument that they really want 
to have the elections free and fair,— 
the first test  of their bona fi'des, the 

earnest of • their intentions will come' 
at the very outset.  Do you want to 
see those electoral rolls without which 
no candidate can fight the  elections 
properly  and fairly, supplied free or 
not to the candidates?  You get the 

security deposit and all that.  That 
itself was debated in the House some­
time ago that it  should be reduced, 

 ̂but I do not think  it was accepted̂ 
Now, the candidate who wants to fight 
the election,  who perhaps  with his 
other qualities is eminently suited for 
Parliament or the A.ssembly, is handi­
capped  because  he  has no money. 
Even to buy one copy of the electoral 

roll  it  costs  Rs, 600 to Rs. 700  in 
Madhya Pradesh.  I am sure there­
fore  that  you will agree,  and  my 
hon. colleagues In this House also will 
agree,  that the  first thing  that the 
Government should  do is to provide 
two copies  at  least  free to every* 
contesting candidate in every consti­
tuency.

Shri Ramachandra Reddi:  Certified.

Shri Kamath:  Certified, of course.
Uncertified copies we do not want.

Sardar A. S. Saigal:  You will get
certified copies.

Shri Elamat]i:  That goes without
saying.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker:  Every  copy
will 'be certified

Shri Kamath: If they are not certi­
fied, we will return them.

My amendment  15  also  suggests 

that additional copies might  be sup­
plied  at  half  the price.  Now, the 
objection that might be raised  the 
Treasury  Benches  is  perhaps  the 
actual cost of  oroduction of  thes'i 
electoral rolls.  I would like ray hon. 
friend, right hon  friend, the Minister



211
Motimifi re  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the
Monans re. ipreperati<m

of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules

62i2

of Legal Affairs to tell the House, it 
not today, at least tomorrow, when he 
repUes—perhaps, it is too late today— 

as to how much it really costs Govern­
ment to produce these electoral rolls, 
per page.  He may  requisition  or 
request the services of  the Finance 
Ministry.  I do not know whether it 

could be done, but I think It could be 
calculatê within half an hour, Jf he 

cares to.

Shri Pataskar;  The hoii. Member 

wants the cost of printing?

Shri Kamath:  Cost of printing is

there,  of course.  I want to know 
the cost of production, that is.  the 
cost of paper plus the cost of print­

ing—that, I suppose,  is the cost  of 

production, and nothing more.

Shri Jaipal  Singh  (Ranchi West- 

Reserved—Sch.  Tribes);  Including

printing mistakes.

Shri Kamath:  Mistakes  will be
detected by very careful ob.servers like 
my hon. friend Shri Jaipal Singh.

I would,  therefore,  request  the 
Minister to let us know what the ac­
tual cost of production was, so far as 
the last general elections were con­

cerned.  I think the sale price was 
less than one-fourth of the cost of the 
production, or roimdabout that.  If 
Government could sacrifice that much,

I believe they could sacrific a little 

more, so as to make the elections free 
and fair,  so far as that  first step is 
concerned.  Of  course,  there  are 
many more things  that  have to be 
done to make the  elections fair and 
free.  I do not  think  they will be 
done by Government at all-  At least, 
they can take this little first step, and 
see that the electoral rolls are sup­
plied free, that is to say, true copies 
are supplied free, to every candidate.

I would like to refer to amendment 
No. 12 in conclusion.  The import  of 

that amendment is very brief, namely, 
that  the  place of  enquiry shall be 
situated not at a long distance,  but 
within a convenient distance, say, two 
or three miles, from the place of resid­
ence of the claimAnts.

I shall deal wHh just one more point 
«nd I have done.  About a month or

so ago, answering a question in this 

House, the Minister referred to  the 
astonishing or rather the mysterious 

reduction of the electorate in Madhya 
Pradesh, Madhya Bharat and Bhopal* 

that is, nearly three-fourths  of the 
new Madhya Pradesh.  I do not know 
why Madhya Pradesh has suffered in 
this manner.  Compared to the elec- 

oral roll  of  1951,  the  electorate 

today according  to the 1955  rolls is 
much less;  it appears the population 

has gone up but the  electorate has 
gone down, that is to say, the total 
number of electors has gone  down. 
This needed some explanation.

When the question was repeated in 
this House after a few days, the Min­
ister: was content to say that instruc­
tions had been given to the officers 
concerned to avoid the mistakes that 

might have occurred in the past, and 
to correctly prepare the electoral rolls 
for 1956.  But how  this  r’ectorate 

was  reduced,  from what' It was in 
1951, suddenly by a few lakhs, in 1955 
was not explained.

I do not think there has been any 
large-scale migration or exodus from 
Bhopal or from  Madhya Bharat  or 
Madhya Pradesh to Bengal or* Punjab 
or elsewhere.  There might have been 
an exouds the other way, for, today 

ê were told that some families from 
Travancore-Cochin , have been  settled 
in Bhopal.  That means, the electo­

ral  population  must have gone vp, 
they must have got themselves regis­
tered there, and the electorate phould 

have gone up.  But instead of that, 
we find that the electorate has gone 
down, that is to say, the total number 
of electors has considerably decreased 

in these three units of the new Madhya 

Pradesh.

Since we are dealing with electoral 

rolls, which fs the matter under dis­
cussion now, I hope the Minister will 

look into this matter again and try to 
probe this mystery of the disappear- ' 
ance of a large  number of eleĉtors, 

while the population  has been  rein­
forced,  and try to arrive at a very 
satisfactory  solution of this question.



6213 Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 RepresentatUm ef the

 ̂ j  People  (Preperation
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

6214

[Shri KamathJ

I would  in the  end  req,uest  the 
Minister to give very senous consi­
deration to this matter of the elecfbral 

rolls and to see that copies of draft 
electoral rolls are at first supplied  to 
the parties concerned for their scru­
tiny so that they may be corrected 

and revised fully, and later on to the 
candidates.

The other day we had a conference 
with the Chief Election Commissioner 
at which all the four political parties 
were represented  by two  members 
from each party.  I also hi.pperied to 
represent  my party along  with my 
friend, Shri Triloki Singh.  There this 

matter was not specifically taken up, 
but  we were  told that  the Election 
Commissioner was already moving in 

the matter  and  Goverriment  would 
§ive very serious consideration to this 

important question and have it solved 
to the satisfaction of all parties con­

cerned.  I hope it will be done.  1 
will again repeat my request to  the 
Minister  to  give  yeiy sympathetic 
consideration to this question.

Shri K. h* More  (Kolhapur  cum 

Satara—̂ Eleserved—Sch.  Castes):  I

do not wish to tak̂ ud the time of the 
House except to bring one fact to the 
notice of the House.  That is with 

regard  to electoral  rolls.  Some of 
my hon. fr1!ends have moved for the 
supply of free copies to every contest­
ing candidate.  That  would  be  a 
very good thing, if done.  But if it 
is impossible to supply free copies to 
4?ach and every contesting candidate, 
I wish to  subpnit  that  free  copies 
shoUd at least be supplied to every 
p̂ didate contesting a reserved seat, 

reserved for the Scheduled Castes and 
IScheduled Tribes.

Shrimati  A.  Gale (Nagpur):  Also 

to women

Shri Kamath:  The Backward Clas­
ses* Coramî on  has dubbed  them 
backwatd.

1̂. Peputy-Sl̂al̂ej::  Only  caste

n̂ĵleg  to be mâe ui>touchables?

Shri K. L.  More:  Many  people
realise the difficulty  of  purchasing 

So I am in agreement wfth

Shri Dabhi’s  amendment. But I*'w!sh
to say that if that is not possible,  at

least  some  concession  should  be

shown  to  Scheduled  Castes  and 
Scheduled Tribes  contesting  candi­
dates by supplying them at least one 
or two free copies.

KTm 3To f̂ o

 ̂ ^

^  I  ^ %

TTTrHtTT  ^ ̂ ̂  f̂HTT  W 'TT # 

i I  ^

 ̂   ̂ fiRT %  ^

TTTO ( sq-|>̂T) ^ ̂  ̂

 ̂ ̂    ̂̂  ̂ I  ̂̂

(HT̂iKdr | ̂   ̂ ^

$Fnrr r̂nr  oftzr 

P̂TT * . . . .

11 qr ̂  ̂   11

Wo  ftto ^

^  % iTrTTf̂ ^ ̂  \3 

cT¥   ̂ ^

(̂ 1̂ +1   ̂  JTT »T̂ ^

w?TT  ̂  i I  ̂   ̂ m 

^  ̂  TRT t   ̂ t  ^

 ̂ ̂  sft̂: ̂  ̂  ̂  ̂  t I

V  ̂«fr̂ HT  ̂I ^

 ̂ 5TRT  ̂ 5rr̂ t I  flI’T

%■ TUT dn*l  ^



621$  Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1956 ReprestntatuM of the
People  (Preperatkm 

of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules

621

(dJ4nOT<)

 ̂̂   ^ ̂TRTT 5)̂  efTTMT % *

t I WTT

% f̂nr '3TRTT ^

 ̂ ̂  ̂  ̂   Farrar ̂  ^

fWt sf  t

-d  ̂t,  ̂  

5̂iTT?T «zrrr  ̂ p̂t f̂nrr strt  i 

^ 3TP̂ T̂T̂  f W«TT 3̂  %

r̂f̂ Rnrt f ^ ?ron: f ’ '̂h+̂

n̂«FRf % 3̂tM   ̂

yfPT  1%  TtHT ^ «FTT̂ ■ ̂•tn

# W ̂   T̂5T?3r̂ ̂ 1

 ̂  ?rrT  ̂ ̂   ^

•ql̂dT g iV ̂  ^

 ̂ ̂  ?r*ft  wr ?T̂ ?|#5̂ 

‘*̂t ̂    ̂  ̂ ̂  ̂l-sMrs 'til̂i

(?T̂ r=̂ 3TT%zff %

f̂r̂TT 5TRT  I  tl[̂ ̂ TPT»rt̂

 ̂3nft ̂  ^

r̂trdt ^ ’ift   ̂ %JTT '=̂rf̂ i

 ̂̂  I', ̂ ^

îPTT ^

fPTTT̂ f%m %  ^ ̂  <̂Vtl r̂'W.

(̂ TcTwr  ̂)  (̂ ',  ̂ ^ ^

I #  ^ «ft ̂ pft ̂   t>

 ̂ % Hr|ir«l'+  3̂T̂  ^  )W

5EF5TTf ̂ R!?Tt 1 r  ̂̂

^̂<+TT ?TH 2TfT % ^

«fr?:% P., «Hd̂  ĉTr |̂,

3̂̂  3RFB

 ̂d  ^  ?Tft ̂   ̂̂

Îd  ̂  ̂f% ̂  efji’-̂’Sd̂

tTT̂ of̂ 9l'SMr’«

sTi«3r (̂ nĵ r̂  ̂ TTf̂ siTtor) ^

q̂rr| Nt  ̂ ̂  ̂

ft̂  ^   ̂I

 ̂ «r̂ n̂rTT

g f% ̂  TO T?:  ̂  t

#  cTt<F

 ̂ qrw  ̂rrft% % ̂   ̂  ^

r̂r̂   ff,  ̂ ^  t|

 ̂ wj  ̂ ̂ I ?Tr5r ?ft

 ̂  t   ̂  ?TiTfNr ̂  I ̂  

 ̂ TT̂p  ̂ % 3m  f̂ T STTrrr t, 

SR" -q̂ilci  iff '̂ildl % rft ̂

 ̂ *Tt̂  WRTT. f I F̂TT

f̂^̂rr  dt OT  ̂ ?rra“Rf ^

5rrto  I  ̂ Tjr̂ ’TO#  ̂ ^WfT T̂%?TT

 ̂  ̂  r̂hrr f ?I\t

 ̂  T̂rHfaQfHd̂

tfftm  =arr|  ̂ wt%,̂

<rw  ̂ ft?TT wrf̂ I   ̂

•̂ WT 1% ̂  î 4̂dl<H Tt̂ «(̂ l̂f eft ̂  

wit ’MWF̂ %   ̂ T̂%̂ I  ̂  I^

 ̂ ^ ̂  dÎ<5  g I

'̂Imm  ̂ f̂rft vj|<ĵ

tTT  OTRt  ̂  ^

 ̂ fl®hn I  *1̂  d*t»  ^

?ftT

-«ll̂dT I  âHT  *T»̂ ÎI f%

ĵPT̂ qr ̂fr m  ?ftr mr ̂  m

rr̂ f̂iVr̂ TT̂ %  ̂̂  ̂ f̂T

T^̂ rft, ?̂I3TN3̂

p̂nrt  ̂ *4.̂*td)  0  ̂ %

 ̂<̂rfiRf  f, ̂ ̂   f%

 ̂vsnFf gfT ̂  spt nf f, %f%?T  5̂TFr 

 ̂   f% ŵ  wr?r

•  ̂  ̂rl  ̂r  ̂’TT  ̂ f̂spp̂  ̂

?rWT ̂   ̂  ̂   ̂ l»̂ 4dl<̂ ffw

5F(w ̂  t ̂  ̂    ̂ f ̂rr

?ftT ?T̂  'Trf 3̂TRT ̂ff  ̂ ^

-̂ . fw   ̂  I

 ̂ 51̂ % ?TT«r ift d<*n̂T 

t, H  ̂I



6217  Motions re.  7 SEPTEMBER 1958 Representation of the 6218

People  (Preperation 
of Electoral Rolls)

Rules

I  ̂  ^  %

 ̂̂>n% f I ^

 ̂ ^  ?rr  f, ̂

 ̂ ̂    ̂̂   f̂f’T ?IT̂  ?TT

 ̂ ̂   I  feft ̂  ?TR

 ̂  HT̂ ̂ 3̂ "H ̂  «t><c*l ̂  I 'iR

^  ̂ T5nfV̂ fiT ̂  f, ̂  qr

inrr

î̂ ni ̂  ̂rr ̂3̂ ̂  v,o ô ̂   ^

f̂*T '»i4?'<,a  ̂  ̂ ?TTTr »TPT 5̂TF̂ ^

ir̂t <5)+ ̂ <.<̂1  n̂rt ̂  ̂  WT 

 ̂ p̂n I  ̂    ̂  ̂   ̂ t %

V.O   ̂ % WTdTH ̂ JT

I Hdl̂ T  ̂  ̂ JfFR’

 ̂̂  m ’TRTTT 1

W % ̂  ft #■   ̂  T  i %

5fr 5ft̂  ̂  ̂ ^ ̂

TO’  ̂?r  ̂t  ̂ ̂

 ̂̂  d̂V ̂ I  ̂ ̂ î -

^  ̂  1̂ 2: m =̂rf̂  ̂I

 ̂ »T̂ r̂ r̂fl   ̂̂  ̂  ̂ T %

^ ̂   M'Slal  ̂• I W  21̂

f̂TJPT.̂  1% gT

 ̂  ̂  ̂̂ '̂Id  I ̂

^̂PRT  I

• % ̂rnr ■*? ̂  cnrnr «ucTi

 ̂ I ’

Shri Jaipal Singh; Sir. I have been 
listening with much  respect to  the 
views that have been expressed  in 
regard to the lireparation of electoral 
rolls.  I am, as you know, concerned 
more with the jungle areas that are 
wide and scattered, where these rules 
of putting up the draft electoral rolls 
in a thana or magistrate’s office have 
no**meanin'g whatsoever.  You cannot 
give the excuse of having .put things 
in the OfBcial Gazette of the State 
calling upon electors to see the rolja, 
find out for themselves whether they 
have been included or whether they 
have been wrongly entered.  There is

MNcft (f̂îTT

#■   ̂̂  ̂ T̂.ft

g I   ̂ f?T  ̂ ̂ T̂

 ̂̂  II  <rT

Tt̂  t ̂   TT 

% ̂IH  n̂r SRT   ̂ ̂   ^

ŜTTcTT ̂ I  ^

51̂ t  5  ̂  ̂ 

^   ̂   ̂ ?TT«T

^ f̂ jff %  ̂  I

Tt̂ p̂fTR ̂T%  % ̂TPT  ^

3TT̂ ̂ I T T T^r^^  ̂?TT ̂ dl

 ̂ f?T?j ?rr̂ PjêiF̂ivl % «Tnr 

 ̂?ITjTf% t   ̂ t ̂

%  m % ̂ Tf% 0̂,̂ 0

wft TT  n̂% f   ̂ +n̂<r̂1 

*r ̂  ̂  ̂  vftrff % »iiH   ̂I  ^

^ r̂dT' ̂  ^

5̂̂  TtfT ̂frT ̂  ̂TTfT ?TT̂ f ?T)T 

^ ̂  ̂  ̂  ̂   ̂ ̂ 4)H|

^ f̂PTT I  P̂TT ̂

 ̂̂  ̂    ̂  ̂̂   r̂nr

 ̂ ̂  t ̂  ̂  -d̂r T?: m

 ̂ t I   ̂?t1T  ̂   3̂TRT 

I

 ̂   ̂ i % 

âi  ^ I,

 ̂̂ rfr n̂r?T  ̂ ̂ n̂?rr

^  ̂   ̂ ^

 ̂ ^   ̂̂   t * 

 ̂ ̂  dr  t  5^

 ̂ t, ̂  ̂  ̂   ^ ̂STRft t

 ̂ 1%  q̂rdwf ̂ % ̂ 3̂TRf ’mK̂I 

Ecr̂x   ̂ t'̂  i f̂rrer ̂  ̂  ̂

I, ?tVt t  w  ̂ ̂

 ̂̂   I ̂   ^

fit t f ^

 ̂  I, fert ̂ ’trt ̂  ̂

T̂?l?r ̂tcTT  feit % f̂ T ̂  Hi*l <Md



S2I9
Wntions re 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 6220
Motions re. * (prcpcrotion

of Electoral Rolls)
Rules

his followers are definitely and cer­

tainly on the rolls and  the  others, 
beautifully left out.  That is happen­
ing.  I can only talk with  personal 
knowledge and if I may say so, with 
authority and say that it is definitely 

happening in the jungle tracts.

mo meaning in it.  In an area where 
one cannot read the language exhibit- 

•ed to them, this sort of argument does 

not hold any water.

I maintain that just as it is the res­

ponsibility  of  the  Government  to 
collect the taxes, so also in return for 
taking revenue from the electorate it 
is the duty, alone of the Government, 
to see to it that no adult in this coun­
try is left out.  It should be a penal 
offence for anyone who is making the 

electoral rolls  to be  subjected  to 
-severe punishment if any elector is 
left out.  It is easy enough for people 
who are urban to find out things for 
themselves.  I am thinking of  rural 

India, and democracy, if it is to have 
any meaning whatever, if it is to func­
tion in this coimtry, should function 

in the rural area.  If it  does  not 
function in the rural area, it will be 

 ̂sad day for this country.

Today every argument seems to be 
dominated  by  spokesmen who  are 
inherently urban; they may represent 
Txiral areas but they are urban peĉle, 
and their outlook seems to be not of 
the rural point of view but of towti- 
•dwellers.  I  maintain  that  every 
village has a chowkidar or whatever

•  other  name  we give  him.  In  the 
different parts of  India  the village 
lieadman, the village chowkidar,  th- 
village pradhan or whatever it is, is 
there and it is  his  responsibility to 
keep the  affairs of  the village au 
courant with the thana or the sub­
division or the district.  It should be 
his responsibility to ensure that no 
one who is entitled  to exercise  his 
franchise is  left out.  I  have  only 
recently been to my own home area 
and I found that as much as twenty- 
five per cent, of the electors were left 
out.  The figure  is as high as  that. 
And, may I tell my hon. friend ovei 
there how it has happened?

A couple of years  back, we  haa 
,  what we called the village panchayat 
elections.  Parties contest these elec­
tions.  In one village, it may be that 
l̂r. A’s party wins and in the other, 

Mr. B’s party wins and so on.  When 
the task of making the electoral rolls 
is entrusted to Mr, A he sees to it that

We talk of school-masters and the 
like, being committed with the task 
of making the electoral rolls.  In my 
own home area, there are far flung 
areas; areas thirty mjles away frora 
the mam places.  Do ̂  expect an 
urban school-master  toÛ âlk  thirty 

mUes into the ji&gle.  Half-way he 
will  be swallowed up  by a  tiger. 
Supposing on a market day he visits 

my village, there Vill be no one.  He 
will say: Yes, I went to the village 
and only four people were present and 
I have done my job.  If they are not 
there, it is their default and it is not 

my job.

But, what happens when I have to 
pay taxes?  It is not a question of 
whether I am in  my house or  not 
Government sees to it that whatever 

is due from me is realised.

And, I may tell that we have done, 
on the whole, well in the last general 
elections.  It was a wonderful experi­
ment.  Certainly,  the  jungle  tracts 
showed the way of discipline and of 
exercising  the franchise  more than 
any other place.  Statistics are theî 
for the whole  country to  see as to 
how the jimgle folk respon4ed to thii 
tremendous power that the Constitu­

tion had given them.

But,  they were  also  sorely dis­
appointed.  They went to the potoig 
booths, everyone of them,  thinkmg 
that they were voters.  Many of them 
were not in  the rolls.  It is  not a 
question of whether a man is on the 
electoral rolls or not.  It is sheer 
waste of money to print these rolls. 
Why not the elections take place in 
every village?  There iS the viUi*-e 
authority.  Why must people be astofti 
to go ten miles or twenty miles aiv.- 
the liKe to cast their votes?  Why no* 
in the  village itself?  It  is  rural 
India.  Surely, you  know that it 
me villagers you can trust more tbou



6221 Jtf otioKs re. 7 SiPTEMB̂ 1956 Hepresmtation of the 

t W fUe  iPreperation
 ̂h eccorcl Rolls) 

Rules

[Shri Jaipal Singh] 

the lawyer type of people who come 
from  the ti)wns  to  conduct  these 

things there.  If voting  could  talce 
place in the village itself or a group 
of a  certain number  of villages,  i 

assure you that  you can  economise 
crores of rupees.  Crores are speni.

One hon. Member from Bombay toia 

us that in his State, every contestant 
was  given half a dozen  copies  ol 
electoral rolls.  No wonder that toey 

could not give  text-books  to  the 
schools.  You know what happened. 

Only last year, schools in Bombay had 
no text-books.  There was no paper, 

ê want to face a situation like that 
when all the  paper is  going to be 
thrown away on the printing of elec­
toral rolls and the like and the educa­
tional institutions will be starved df 

the wherewithal of knowledge.

I know I am taking a tevolutibnary 

view.  But, I do think that it is about 
time we trusted ourselves.  We are 

relying too much on what is printed— 
what is wrong.  We know what  is 
printed is wrong.  I ask my  hon. 
friend to come to my own village.  I 
will prove it to him and show him how 

the names are mis-spelt, how the ages 
of ladies who are so much younger 

are put down much more than what 
they are.  It is grossly unfair.  All 
that we are interested in seeing  is 
that the man or woman has attained 
the eligible âe.  That is all  that 

matters.  I cannot, for the life of me, 
understand why we are wasting  so 
much paper, so much ink, and so much 

on printing expenditure,  when  all 
these could be obviated by  having 
faith in ourselves.  Trust our  own 
people and get tid of all these.  Let 

every village be a polling centre, be­
cause, after all, it is the  chowkidar 

who is responsible for the village and 
for any omission he may make let him 

be punished.  Who is punished at'pre­
sent?  May I inform you, Sir, that last 

time my name wa6 not on the electoral 
rolls '

Pandit Thakur Das Bliargava (Ghir- 
îaon): My name also was not ttiere.

Shri laipal Singh: I am very glad 

that I am in very good company. My 

hon.  friend  Pandit  Thakur  Das 
Bhargava says that his name also was 

not there.  Neither he nor I grudge 
giving the Government Rs. 10 or Rs.

50, whatever it is that they  want. 

That is not the point.  The point iŝ 
do we want democracy to function oi 
not?  What  is  democracy?  Does 

democracy mean the functioning  of 
electors who can afford to pay Rs. S 

or Rs. 10?  Democracy  means  that 

everyone, even the humblest must be- 
in a position to exercise his franchise, 

even the poorest man must be in a 

position to stand.  That is why, parti­
cularly, if I may stress, in the jungle 
areas we have got to be very very 
careful, where the load of  finance 
must not go against the very essence 
of democracy.

With regard to the question of buy­
ing electoral rolls, in some States we 

have heard that as much as Rs. 600 

for one copy has to be paid.  What a 
monstrous figure it is!  To my m!nd» 

as I have already said, it seems  it 
would be much better if we do away 
with all these electoral rolls.  Each 

village must be taken as a unit. Tlhe 
village chowkidar knows the villagers. 

There can be no imposters as there 
can be when people go in burkas and 
the like and when the same person 
ccnnes in twenty times as a woman. 
This has been happening.  I have seen 

it happen before my own eyes.  None 
of that monstrosity would be there if 
we have faith in our villagers.  We 
talk a lot about the villagers,  but 

we do nothing to go to the villagers.

As I have already said I think much 
money could be saved if we really • 

have faith in our villagers. Similarly, 
when you go to the town, you need 
not have such a very big area.  You 
can have one block where everybody 

knows everbody else.  There is  no 
question of importing voters  from 
outside.

So, to end up, I would request the 
Government to make this question of



6223 Motions re.

perfecting the electoral rolls as simple 
and as costless as possible, because, 

now, as things are, it seems that only 

money can put things right.  I think 
that is going against the spirit  of 

democracy.  As my friend from Bihar 

said, up to the very last minute  it 
should be possible for an elector to 

be able to have his name put into the 

electoral rolls.  After all, who is the 
man who is witness to the fact that 

he is or he is not an elector?  It is 

the viDage chowkidar.  Again, as I 
said, for this purpose it seems to me 
that the village headman or the village 
chowkidar—whatever name it is, be­
cause the names are different in diff- 

ernet parts of India—should be, to my 

mind, the basis of the edifice of demo­

cracy that we intend building.

So, I would once again request that 

the Government should not put any 
hindrances to anyone in the exercise 

of his franchise, because then alone 
can we say we are heading to a truly 

representative and  democratic gov­
ernment in this country.

Shri Pataskar: Sir, instead of reply­
ing in detail to every hon. Member I 

will try to reply to the main points 

which have been urged and ŵhich are 
more or less common for  Members 

coming from different States.  I would 
:irst refer to the point that was raised 
by Shri DaBhi through his  amend­

ment.  He has also been supported by 
several other Members.  The fact of 
the matter is that so far as the ques­
tion of supplying free copies of the 

final electoral rolls to the contesting 

candidates is concerned, it has  to be 
considered very carefully.  I have 

tried to collect  some  information. 
The system is this.  The rolls are 
printed by different State  Govern­
ments in their own States and  they 
make their own arrangements.  As 

regards cost, it is shared between the 
State Governments and the Central 
Government.  They have fixed a cer­
tain price, that is to say, the State 
Governments fix the price in consul­

tation with the Election̂ Commission, 
and the Central Government does nm 

come into the picture.

7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Represeni&tioh oj the 

People  iPreperation 
of Electoral Rolls)

Rules

The figures relating to prices  are 

interesting.  I have also found that so 
far as the old prices—those relatin̂\ 

to 1952 to 1955—are concerned, there 

is a good deal of variation  between 
the prices fixed by one  State  as- 

against the price fixed by  another 
Ŝte.  For instance, in Assam, it was 

three annas per page.  In Bihar,  it. 
was six pies per page.

Shri Kamath; It is ‘pies’ or ‘pice'?

Sitri Pataskar: They  have  put

dashes.  Anyway, why worry about it? 
In Bihar, it was six pies per page. 
Their proposal now is to keep  the 

same price.  In Bombay, it was six 

pies per page, and as yet, the Bom­

bay Government have not yet'mti- 

mated as to what price they would 
like to fix now.  In Madhya Pradesĥ 

it was two annas per page.  They 

have proposed that it should now be 
reduced to one anna three pies.  In 

Madras, it was three annas per forlrie 
of four pages.  It is not calculated as 
per page.  They have not as yet inti­
mated as to what they would charge* 

now.  In Orissa, per ten pages or frac­
tion thereof, it was six annas six pies. 

Now. they have not intimated as to 
what  price  they  would  like  to 
fix.  In  Punjab,  it  was  one 

anna  per page.  They  have  not 

.yet  intimated  about  the  future 
price.  In Uttar Pradesh, it was  two 

annas per page of 100 entries.  So, the 
basis is different.  They have not inti­
mated about the future price.  In 

West Bengal, it was Rs. 20 for single­

member mofussil Assembly constitu­
ency.  So, it is not per page.  It was 

Rs. 40 for single-member  Calcutta 
Assembly Constituency; Rs.  40  for 
double-member  mofussil  Assembly 
constituency and Rs. 80 for double­

member Calcutta Assembly constitu­
ency.  In Madhya Bharat, it was one 
anna per page.  Now, they propose to 
charge six pies per 100 entries.  In 
Mysore, they were charging three nies 
per page, and even now they propose 

to adhere to the same  price.  In 

PEPSU, it was one anna six pies per 
page.  Now, they propose to charge at 

one anna per 100 entries.  In Rajas­
than, it was six pies per page



6̂12$ Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the 

People  (Preperation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

6226

[Shri Pataskar] 

same price is suggested now.  In 

Saurashtra, it was six pies per page. 

They have not yet intimated as  to 
. the future price.  Obviously, they will

- merge into Bombay.  In Travancore- 

-Cochin, it was three pies per page plus 
.sales-tax.

Shri Ê math:  Sales-tax? It is mon­
strous.

Shri Pataskar: They have not  yet 

intimated their proposal for the future 

price. In Ajmer, it was six pies  per 

page.  It  will  continife  the  same 
price.  In Bhopal, it was six pies per 

page.  They want to reduce it to three 

pies per page.  In Coorg, it was one 
.anna six pies per sheet.  They have 

n̂ot yet intimated the future price-

Pandit Thakur Das  Bhargava;  If 

t̂he price of the electoral rolls for the 
Parliamentary constituency is given, 

it would be appreciated better.  In the 

Punjab, it is Rs. 350.

Shri Pataskar: Please hear what I 

propose to do.  This is previous his­

tory.

Shri Kamath: When was the saley- 
tax imposed for  this  purpose  in 
Travancore-Cochin?  In which year 
was it? '

Shri Pataskar:  Let us be a little

.more serious.

Shri Kamath: Of course we are.

Shri Pataskar: I have  given the 
price in the various States only by 

way of information.  I am in  full 
Sympathy with the object that some­

thing should be done in order that 
there may be some sort of uniformity 

in price.  There  should  be  some 
method by which it is done.  We will 

also examine whether we could  or 
could not supply any free copies___

Shri Kamath: We are trying to help 
.you.

Shri Pitaskar: I think the basis on 

which the prices were fixed last time 
requires some modifications.  I  will 
-exert myself to see what best I can 
-do. After' all, the expenses are being 
shared by both the Central Govem- 

'ment and the State Govemmeals.  *

can visualise that the costs of printing 
are not likely to be uniform  in  all 

the States, but in spite of that, there 

need not be so much variation in price 
from State to State.  I have  hearc 

what hon. Members had to say and I 
will try my best to see that there is 
some sort of uniformity, if not abso­

lute uniformity,  in  the  matter  ot 

price. .

The next point is about supply of 

free copies- It is true that the Bom­
bay Government supplied some copies 
free last time.  If I remember arighu 
I had to purchase the first copy myself. 

After that, they supplied some copies 
to the contesting candidates.  Anyhow.
I can assure the hon. Members of this 
House that I shall try to bring about 
some uniformity between the v̂.rious 

States.  Naturally, I would  not like 
to commit myself here to any price or 
to fixing a particular number of copies 
to be supplied free. But at that level 

I wiU try to enter into discussion  and 
correspondence  and  see  that  what­

ever possible is done,  after  taking
into consideration the views  of hon.

Members, whether they belong to this 

party or that party.

Shri K. K. Basa: I hope your inten­

tion is to have  uniformity with the 
Bombay Government and not  the

other Governments.

Shri Kamath: On a point of order. 

Sir. I fear that the hon. Minister  is 
trying to water down the provi:jions 
of article 324 of the  Constitution. 

Article 324 vests the work of prepara­
tion and revision of electoral rolls in 
the Election Commission.  I  submit
that the Election Commission  alone 
should have the power, and not  the 

Central Government or the State Gov­
ernments, to fix the price also.  There 

should be one single authority  and 

that  authority should fix the price 
of the electoral rolls also  uniformly, 
and determine  whether any  copies 

should be supplied free to the canai- 
dates or not. They should be given the
- powers and not the State Government 
or the Central  Government,  und̂ r̂ 
article 324.



•6227 Motwngtt. 7 SEPTEMBER 1»56 Representation of the 
People  (Preperation 

of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules  "

622»

Shri Psbtoskar: I was also a Memb?r 

of the Constituent  Assembly  along 

with my friend and I have not still 
iorgotten it. I hope the hon. Member 

■will realise the  .limitations  of  the 

<jOvernment and the functions o? the 
election Commission.  It Will be far 

Irom me ever to try  to violate  the 
Constitution. Suggestions  have  been 
made in this House and the Election 

‘Commissioner is not a Member of this 
House. I do not mean that the Gov­
ernment will assfume the powers  of 
the Election Commission, but jnst as 

Members have got the right to express 

"their views, I have also  the  right, 
without violating the Constitution, to 

make certain suggestiors, after taking 
into consideration  the views of hon. 
Members here, to the Election  Com­

mission and the State Governments.

I don’t think there is £Jiy such ĉues- 
flon and I would leave the matter at 
that.

Then, with respect to the amend­
ments to the rules, there are so many 
amendments and I have already indi­

cated as to which of the amendments 
I would like to accept. But, of coursê 
they will have to be put in a  little 
different form.

Shri Kamath: Your decision. Sir, on 
the point of order?

Mr. Deputŷ peaker: In view of the 
statement made by the hon. Minister 
It becomes a hypothetical  question. 

There* is nothing that 1 should decide. 
If a question arises then it will  he 
êen as to what decision is to be given. 

There is nothing before me that I can 
decide.

Shri Pataskar: With  respect  to  the 
actual  amendments, I have  already 

indicated as to which of them Of parts 

of them I shall accept and I have tried 
to put them in  a form in which they 

Will have to go to the other Hlusp for 

connrmatlon.

The first one is with respect 1o rule 
>. In clause (c), after “may” (that is 
the amendment of Mr. Sadhan Gupt̂a 

though it contains other things also) 
Insert “subject to the approval of the 
Election Commission”.  Then  It wiU 

Tead:

' ‘revising autnority’ means such 

person  as the State Government 

or an officer authorised  by  the 
>̂tate Government in this behalf 

may subject w me  approval of 
the Election Commission  appoint 

as the revising authority in res­

pect pf a constitueiicy or part of a 
constituency;”

As the hon. Members are aware, the 
hon. Member, Mr. Basu, naturally had 

expressed some concern with respect 
to appointment being made by a State 

Government.* As *it was just pointed 

out that laection Commission is  the 
final authority, I accept the  amend­
ment of Mr. Sadhan Gupta.  I have 

tried to put it in this form.

Then the next one relates to rule 11. 
There we have made  certain verbal 

amendments besides one of substance. 
Our amendment is:  v

In clause (a) omit ‘and’ at the 
end and in clause (b) add at the 
end ‘and’ and after clause (b) add 
another clause,  namely,  clause 

(c); “(c) two copies of each sepa­
rate part of the electoral  roll to 
every political party to which  a 
symbol has been allotted  by the 
Election Commission.”

I think this in  substance  is  the 
amendment which was given notice of 
by several hon. Members and I have 
already indicated that I will  accept 
this.  This is how it has been put in. 
Along with that I have tried to cor­
rect some mistakes.

Then there is another  amendment 

in rule 26 where we have agreed to 
reduce the fee . from Rs. 10 to Rs. 5. 
The amendment will read:

In clause (a) of sub-rule  (1), 

for "ten rupees”  substitute “five 
rupees”; and •*

in sub-rule (2), for “sub-section 
(1)” substitute “sub-rule (1)”.

The use of  the  expression  "sub­
section (1)” is a printing mistahc. It 
ought to be “sub-rule (1)”. So, that
iias been corrected. '

Then there Is another amendment Jto 
TUlfj 27- In sub-clause (b) of sub-rule 

(1), for “ten rupees” substitute  “five



6229 Llotivns re.  '  7 SEFlliStCBER 1956 Represen̂tion of the
People  (Preperation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

[Shri Pataskar] 

rupees” bfecause there also the fee ot 
Rs. 10 will be reduced to »s. 5.

Therefore, I would like to point out 

that so far as supply of draft rolls to 
the recognised parties who have been 

allotted symbols are  concerned  the 
amendment has been accepted and  I 
think that will remove many of the 

difficulties.

Sliri Shree Narayan Das; Regarding 

the two copies of the draft roUs that 
will be made available to each party, 

will it be at various levels or to the 
central party only? If it is supplied tD 
the head office only then  no purpose 

will be served at which level?

Shri K. tL Basu: That is a working 
arrangement.

Shri Pataskar: I think these are the 

only rules which we  are  going to 
frame. I am sure, whatever is neces­

sary will be done in a proper spirit of 
seeing that the elections are, as far 

as possible very  fair and  hardships 
are minimised. We canno{ put every­

thing in the rules.  These  are  the 
amendments which 1 am inclined to 
accept.  As I have already said, with

resi>ect  to the Ciuestion raised in  this
House about the free supply of elec­

toral rolls to the candidates, that is a 

matter which the Election  Commis­
sion, the  Slate  Governments  and 

others will take into consideration at 
a oroper level and whatever is possi­
ble for the Government will be done-

With respect to the other comments 
I think  there has been  a general dis-

*!ussion  as to whether the rules  are
proper, how they should be published, 
etc. I think the rules themselves make 
quite ample provisions.  We should 
not try to ê and them.  With re­
gard to the work of the Election Com­
mission, I find ifrpm the speeches  of 
the -hon. Menaljers opposite that they 
are appreciâ % the way in whicn it 
is proceeding and I do not think that 

there is any ground for supposing that 
things which  are legitimate,  reason­
able and proper would not be done by 
it

Shri Dabni; What is the difficulty in 
accepting my anenjment to rule 8?

Shri Pataskar: What is that? Free 
supply of copies?  .

Mr, Deputy-Speaker: Order,  order,. 
Now,  1 will  put  the  Government 

amendments.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: Order, order. 

Sir, I invite your attention to rule 338 

of the Rules of Procedure.  You will 

recollect that the hon. Minister him­
self, when  I asked  at  the  outset 

whether he would move the motion on 
his own, said that the initiative was 
with us, who have given  notices  of 
motions here  with  regard  to  the 

Electoral Rolls rules and that -we oft 
this side of this House were to move 
the motions standing in our  respec­
tive names.  According to rule 338(3), 

a Member who has moved a motion— 
we have moved  our  motions—may 

speak again by way of reply, and if 
the motion is moved  by  a  private 

Member, the Minister concerned may, 
with the permission  of the Speaker, 
speak—̂permission is  not  necessary 
for  us;  in  this  case,  your 
permission  is  necessary  for  the 

Minister.  I  want  the  right  of 

reply. We have moved our motions- I 
request you to allow us two of three 
minutes.  We do not want to speak 
at great length. A couple-of minutes 

for each of us. ‘

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: I would  not 
object to it, certainly. But, really they 

are in the form of amendments,  and 

the usual procedure that we normally 
follow is that amendments are movisd 
bj hon. Members and then the Minis­

ter makes a reply to them.

Shri Kamatb:  If you will  kindly 
see here, Sir, usually, in  the Order' 

Paper, when amendments are moved, 

it is described as ‘notice of  amend­
ment’.  Here for the electoral  rolls 

Rules to day, it is notice of  motion, 
not notice of amendment.

M?.  Depnty-Speaker: They are
notices of  motions.  I  agree that 
technically they are notice® or motions..



2̂31 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Representation of the
People (Preperation 
of Electoral Rolls) 

Rules

623̂

Shri Kamatb: A motion is a motion 
according to the rules.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: If  the hon.

Member persists that he  wants  to 
have two or three minutes for reply, I 
âye no objection.

Shri Pataskar: I have also no objec- 
rtion.

Shri Kamath; I  won’t  take  more 
than two minutes.

Some Hon. Members: We also want 
 ̂few minutes.

Shri Kamath: Mr.  Deputy-Speaker, 
I am grateful to you that I am reluc­
tant to say that unlike what happened 
yesterday,  the  rules have  been  ob­
served today.

Mr.  Deputy-Speaker:  He should
come to the point straightway.

Shri Kamath: I would only submit 
“that in regard to our joint motion No. 

15. the hon.  Minister has  gone,  I 
would not say half way, but perhaps 
only a quarter  way  to  meet  our' 

demands, and I w.sh he had gone  a 
little farther to meet the just demands 

that the Opposition has  made with 

respect to this important matter  of 
electoral rolls. He has given  an as­
surance, however, that  this  matter 

would be looked into.  I would have 

been happier if the House had decid- 
•ed this matter here itself once for all

to whether every candidate would 
be entitled to get two  copies of  the 
rolls free.  Even now, I would like to 
have an  assurance  from  the  hon. 
Minister as to whether.......

Mr. Depaty-Speaker: Now there wiU 
be no time for him to give an assur- 
.ance.

Shri Kamath: With your permission, 
he can. If you do not want to give 

him a chance, I will not ask for an 
assurance again because it would be 
ifutile.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: He would have 
no chance.

Sliri SadhaA Gupta*  He can inter­
pose an assurance at this stage.

Shri Kamath: If he pannot give an 
4issurance on this matter, I would not 
•tike to say anything further except to

state that I am sorry that this matter 

has not been given the earnest con­
sideration that it deserved  and that 
the Government is not really anxious 

to promote fair and free elections hi 
our country.

Shri K. K. Basu: I  will  not say 
much. I am really thankful  to  the 

Minister that he ĥs accepted some of 
the amendments In  spirit.  I  only 
request that in respect of our amend­

ments 8. 9, 11 and 12 he should  at 

least forward the discussions and the 
point of view we have expressed to 
the Election  Commissioner,  because 

many of these things I think can be 
done through executive  direction ir 
the Minister  wants to improve  the 

preparation of the electoral rolls and 
Tt would be helpful. I only urge again 

ill respect of amendment 15 regarding 

the supply of free copies that even the 
Committee on Subordinate Legislation 
has unanimously endorsed  this  view 

that free copies should be supplied. I 

hope the hon. Minister will keep it in 
view that a Committee of Parliament 
has unanimously suggested it, and will 

so define his policies that the spirit of 
this recommendation is accepted.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: We shall first 

dispose of Government’s motions.

Motions adopted:

(i) This House resolves that in 

pursuance of sub-section  (3)  of 
section 28 of the  Representation 
of the  People  Act,  1950,  the 

following amendment be made in 
rule 2 of the Representation  of 
the People (Preparation of Elec­
toral Rolls) Rules,  1956, laid on 
the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 
namely:

In clause  (c), after “may” insert:

“subject to the approval of the 
Election Commission”.

This House recommends to  Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

(ii) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3)  of 
section 28 of  the Representation 
of the  People  Act,  1950,  the



6233 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956 Repreŝtation of the 
People  (Preperation 

of Electoral Rolls) 
Rules

6234-

CMr. Deputy-Speaker] 

following amendments be made iî 
rule 11 of the  Representation of 
the People  (Preparation of Elec­

toral Rolls) Rules, 1956, laid  on 

the Table on the 24th July, 1956, 

namely:

(i) in clause (a), omit “and” 

at the end;

(ii) in clause (b), add at the 
end “and”; and

(iii) after clause (b), add:

“(c) supply free of cost two 

copies of each  separate part 
of the electoral roll to every 
political party  to  which  a 

symbol has been allotted  by 
the Election Commission-”

This House recommends  to  Rajya 

Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution. .

(iii) This House resolves that in
pursuance of sub-section  (3)  of 
section 28 of the  Representation 
of the People Act, 1950, the follow­

ing amendments be made in rule 
26 of the Representation  of the 

People (Preparation  of Electoral 
Rolls) Rules, 1956, laid  on  the 

Table on the  24th  July,  1956, 
namely: ’  .

(i) in clause (a) of sub-rule (1),

for “ten rupees” substitute “five 
rupees”; and

(ii) in sub-rule (2), for “sub-sec­
tion  (1)” substitute  “sub-rule
(1)”.

This House recommends to  Rajya 
. .Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur m 
the said resolution.

(iv) This House resolves that in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3)  of 
section 28 of the Representation of 
the People Act, 1950, the following 

amendment be made in rule 27 of 
the Representation of the Peojrie 
(Preparation of Electoral  Rolls) 
Rules, 1956, laid on the Table on 

the 24th July, 1956, namiBly:

to clause (b) of sub-rule (1), 
for  “ten  rup̂ s” substitute 
“five rupees”.

This House recommends to  Rajya 

Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution.

—[Shri Pataskar\

Mr. DepntyrSpeaker: Shall I have to 

put every other motion?

 ̂Shri Sadhan Gupta: Some of ihenL 

are barred.

'  Shri K. HL Basu: In response to the 

spirit in which he has replied, we do 

not want to press our  amendments 

and beg leave to withdraw them.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker:  Shri Kamailfc '

also follows the same course, I sup­

pose.

Shri Kamath: I think so.

Mr. Depnty-Speaken  Hon.  Member* 

there.

Shri Shree Narayan Das: I do not
' press and beg leave to withdraw them̂

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: So, the motions 

of these Members are withdrawn.

The motions were, by leave, with­

drawn.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: Shri Dabhi haî 

already gone.

Shri Shree Narayan Das:  In  the

absence of the hon. Member I think 

his motions may be put to vote.

Mr. Deputŷ peaker:  Then  I put
motions 16, 17, 18, 24 and 25 to tne 

vote of the House.

The question is:

This House  resolves  that  in 
pursuance of sub-section  (3)  of 
section 28 of the Representation of 

the People Act, 1950, the follow­
ing amendment be made in rule 8- 
of the Representation of the Peo­
ple  (Preparation  of  Electoral 
Rolls) Rules, 1956, laid  on  the 
Table on the  24th  July,  1956„ 

namely:—

for “may” substitute “shall”*



6235 Motions re. 7 SEPTEMBER 1956

This House recon;imendd to  Rajya 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
6 said resolution.

The motion was negatived.

Mr. DeputŷSpeaker: The  question

t  This House  resolves  that  In. 
pursuance of sub-section  (3) of 

section 28 of the  Representation 
;  of the People Act, 1950, the follow­

'  ing amendment be made in rule 8

of the Representation of the Peo­
ple  (Preparation  of " Electoral 
Rolls) Rules, 1956,  laid  on the 
Table on thfe  24th  July,  1956, 
namely:—

after “send” insert:  ,

“either by registered  post  or

through the staff employed for the 
purpose”. '

This House recommends to  Rajya
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur in 
the said resolution. .

The motion was negatived.

Mr. Deputy-Speaker: The question

is:

This House  resolves  that  in
pursuance of sub-section  (3)  of 
section 28 of the Representation of 

the People Act, 1950, the follow- 

 ̂ ing proviso be added to sub-rule
(2)  of rule 33 of the Representa­

tion of the People (Preparation of 
Electoral Rolls) Rules, 1956, laid 
on the Table on the 24th  July, 
namely:—

“Provided that the State Gov­
ernment may supply, free of cost 

one Or more copies of the electoral 
roll to the candidatefc to the elec-  * 
tions concerned.”

This House recommends  to Rajyii 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur In 
ilje said resolution.

The motion was negatived.

Hr.
is:

Representation of the 6236̂ 

People  iPreperation 
of Electoral RolU)

Rules

Deputy-Speaker: The  questioiu

This House  resolves  that  ii| 

pursuance of  sub-section (3)  of 
section 28 of  the  Representation, 

of the People Act, 1950 the follow­

ing amendment be made in sub­

rule (2) of rule 33 of the  Repre­

sentation of the People (Prepara­
tion of Electoral  Rolls)  Rules,. 

1956. laid on the Table  on  the 
24th July, 1956, namely:

add at the end:

“Provided that at every general 
election or bye-election every con­

testing candidate shall be supplied 

three copies free of cost.”

This House recommends  to Rajya ̂ 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur im 

the said resolution.

The motion was negatived.

Mr. Depiity-Speaker: The  auesH->n*

is:

This House  resolves  that  in 

pursuance of  sub-section (3)  of 
section 28 of  the  Representation 

of the People Act, 1950 the follow­

ing amendment be made in sub­
rule (2) of rule 33 of the  Repre­
sentation of the People (Prepara­
tion of Electoral  Rolls)  Rules, 
1956. laid on the Table  on  the 

24th July, 1956, namely:

add at the end:

“Provided that at every general 
election or bye-election every con­
testing candidate shall be supplied 

four copies free of cost.”

This House recommends  to Rajya- 
Sabha that Rajya Sabha do concur im 

the said resolution.

The motion was negatived.

6-05 P.M.

The Lok Sabha then adjourned till 
Eleven of the Clock on Saturday tĥ  
8th September, 1956.




