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that every school must have a play-
ground; if so, what is Government's 
view in this regard? 

THE MINISTER OF EDUCATION. 
SOCIAL WELFARE AND CULTURE 
(DR. PRATAP CHA:-.IDRA CHUN-
DER): (a) Some suggestions regarding 
reconst\\ution of the All India Council 
of Sports are receiving Government's 
attentioll. 

(b) Sports is not being llegleted but 
there is a scope for" further improve-
ment. 

(c) Government are of the view 
that active interest in sports should be 
developed amongst students at all 
levels and necessary facilities provid-
erl. 

Slump in Demand of Nitrogenous 
Fertilizers 

"281. SHRI G. Y. KRISHNAN: Will 
the Minister of AGRICULTURE AND 
IRRIGATION be pleased to state: 

(a) whether there is a slump in the 
demand for nitrogenous fertilizer in 
the country; 

(b) if so, the estimated stockpile of 
fertilizers; and 

(c) whether there is any restrictions 
On inter-State movement of fertilizers; 
and if so, the reasons thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF AGRICULTURE 
AND IRRIGATION (SHRI SURJIT 
SINGH BARNALA): (a). No. Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

(c) Yes Sir. Inter State movement 
of fertilisers is governed by the provi-
sions of the Fertiliser (Movement Con-
trol) Order issued under the Essential 
Commodities Act. Regulation of such 
movement is meant to enable equit-
able distribution of both the indigen-
GUS and imported fertilisers in diffe-
rent parts of the country. It ena'Jles 
the Central Government, the state 

Governments and the Fertliser pr9-, 
ducers to plan the movement and dis-
tribution of fertilisers systematically. 
A,Part from this, it reduces the strain 
d.1 the transport system by rationalis-
ing movements minimises transport 
delays, and results in frei~!Jt savings. 

Fruit Processing Complex ill North 
Eastern Region 

':'282. SHRI M. RAM GOPAL RED-
DY: Will the Minister of AGRICUL-
TURE AND IRRIGATION be pleased 
to state: 

(a) whether Government have de-
cided to set up' a fruit processing com-
plex in the North Eastern region of 
the country; and 

(b) if so, the total cost involved? 

THE MINISTER OF STATE IN THE 
MINISTRY OF AGRICULTURE AND 
IRRIGATION (SHRI BHANU PRA-
TAP SINGH): (a) No, Sir. The 
matter is still under active considera-
tion of the Government. 

(b) Does noi arise. 
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Non-Availability of Urdu Medium 
Text Books 

*284. SHRI C. K. JAFFER SHAR-
lEF: Will the Minister of EDUCATION, 
SOCIAL WELFARE AND CULTURE 
be pleased to state: 

(a) whether text books in Urdu 
medium were not available for the 9th 
and 10th Class students in the Union 
territory of Delhi and other StateR 
during the last academic year and i! 
so, what are the reasons therefor; and 

(I:» whnt nction 'Government have 
taken in the matter? 

THE MINISTER OF EDUCATION, 
SOCIAL WELFARE AND CULTURE 
(DR. PRA'TAP CHANDRA CI-ruN-
DER): (a) In the Union Territory of 
Delhi text books in Urdu medium for 
Classes 9th and 10th were not avail-
able during the last academic year 
1976-77. The reason was inordinate 
delay on the part of the Taraqui-e-Ur-
du Board whose responsibility was to 
translate, edit, produce and distribute 
text-books. In regard to the other 
States, it is for the State Governments 
to prescribe books and wherever re-
quired make available text-books in 
Urdu medium. The time and labour 
that will be involved in collecting this 
information and the reasons if any for 
such books not being available would 
not be commenssurate with the results. 

(b) While the translation of te;::C-
books into Urdu would continue wi:n 
the Taraqui-e-Urdu Board. all otne:' 
[unctions sLlch as-editing. production 
and distribution would be handled 07 
the National Council of Education '0.1 
Research and Training. 
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Mailltellllnce of ruined Palaces in 
lIimnchlll Pra(ltlsh 

2504. SHRI DURGA CHAND: WiiI 
the Minister of EDUCATION, SICIAL 
WELFARE AND CULTURE be pleas,'(j 
to state: 

(a) whether the Central Govern-
ment are contemplating a proposal to 
maintain and declare the ruined 
palaces at Vijaypur and at Suj'anpur 
Tira in Himachal Pradesh monuments 
of National importance which are 
connected with the birth place of 
Maharaja Sansar Chand, fathel' of 
Kangra School of Paintings; and 

(b) if so, the details thereof? 

THE MINISTER OF EDUCA nON 
SOCIAL WELFARE AND CULTURE 
(DR. PRATAP .CHANDRA CHAUN-
DER): (a) and (b). The Katoch Palace 




